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SN NUPCO CODE ITEM SPECIFICATION VENDOR NAME MANUFACTURER TRADE DESCRIPTION 

1 5119190201900 AMINO ACID 6.5% PARENTERAL NUTRITION 
INJECTION 500 ML BOTTLE FOR NEONATE 

AND INFANT 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI VAMINOLACT 500 ML 

2 5119190201200 AMINO ACID 8% (HEPATAMINE) INJECTION 
500ML BOTTLE OR BAG 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI AMINOSTERIL N HEPA 8% 
500 ML 

3 5119190201300 AMINO ACIDS 10% INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 
2000 ML BAG FOR ADULT 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER 10% TRAVASOL 

4 5119190200400 AMINO ACIDS 10% PARENTERAL NUTRITION 
100 ML BOTTLE FOR NEONATE AND INFANT 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI AMINOVEN INFANT 100ML 

5 5119190202000 AMINO ACIDS 10% PARENTERAL NUTRITION 
250 ML BOTTLE OR BAG FOR NEONATE AND 

INFANT 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER PRIMENE 10%, FOR 
NEWNATES & INFAN 

5 5119190202000 AMINO ACIDS 10% PARENTERAL NUTRITION 
250 ML BOTTLE OR BAG FOR NEONATE AND 

INFANT 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI AMINOVEN INFANT 250ML 

6 5119190201700 AMINO ACIDS 15% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION, 1000 ML BOTTLE FOR ADULT 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI AMINOVEN 15% 1000ML 

7 5119190200700 AMINO ACIDS 15% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION, 500 ML BOTTLE FOR ADULT 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI AMINOVEN 15% 500ML 

7 5119190200700 AMINO ACIDS 15% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION, 500 ML BOTTLE FOR ADULT 

Medical Supplies & Services 
Co. Ltd -Orig- 

B.BRAUN AMINO ACIDS 15% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUS 

8 5119190507300 ASCORBIC ACID 500MG INJECTION No bid accepted     

9 5119160200900 BALANCED SALT SOLUTION PLUS STERILE 
EYE SOLUTION 

AL KAMAL IMPORT OFFICE 
CO.,LTD. -Orig- 

ALCON BSS PLUS 500ML 

10 5119160201800 BALANCED SALT STERILE SOLUTION FOR 
IRRIGATION 500 ML BOTTLE OR BAG 

PRESERVATIVE FREE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

Balance Salt Solution 500 ml 

11 5118240100000 CALCIUM CHLORIDE DIHYDRATE 10% (1 
G/10 ML, 6.8 MMOL/10 ML CALCIUM) 

INJECTION, 10 ML SYRINGE 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

MARTINDALE 
PHARMA 

CALCIUM CHLORIDE 10% 
PREFILLED SYRINGE 

http://www.nupco.com/


NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0035/22  

TENDER   NAME: IV FLUIDS & TPN                                                                                                                                                                                           FINAL RESULT STAGE 2  

 

January 5, 2023 
www.nupco.com 

2 of 19 

 

SN NUPCO CODE ITEM SPECIFICATION VENDOR NAME MANUFACTURER TRADE DESCRIPTION 

12 5118240100100 CALCIUM CHLORIDE DIHYDRATE 10% (1 
G/10 ML, 6.8 MMOL/10 ML CALCIUM) 
INJECTION, 10 ML VIAL OR AMPOULE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

CALCIUM CHLORIDE 10% 
Plastic Ampoule 

13 5119191500200 CALCIUM GLUCONATE 100 MG/ML (10%) 
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 100 ML 

NO QUOTE     

14 5119191500300 CALCIUM GLUCONATE 100 MG/ML (10%) 
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 250 ML 

NO QUOTE     

15 5118240300000 CALCIUM GLUCONATE MONOHYDRATE 10% 
(1 G/10 ML, 2.2 MMOL/10 ML) INJECTION 

10 ML AMPOULE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

CALCIUM GLUCONATE 10% 
10ML AMPOULE 

16 5112230100400 CARDIOPLEGIC SOLUTION 1000ML BOTTLE 
OR BAG 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER CARDIOPLEGIC SOLUTION, 
1000 ML, B 

17 5119160300900 CENTERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1000 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND 
SOYBEAN OIL 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER OLIMEL N9E - 1000 ML, BAG 

18 5119160301000 CENTERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 2000 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND 
SOYBEAN OIL 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER OLIMEL N9E - 2000 ML, BAG 

19 5119160301100 CENTERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 500 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, DEXTROSE, IV LIPIDS OLIVE 
OIL AND SOYBEAN OIL FOR PEDIATRIC 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NUMETA G16%E- 500 ML, 
BAG 

20 5119160334700 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1000 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, DEXTROSE, IV LIPIDS OLIVE 
OIL AND SOYBEAN OIL FOR PEDIATRIC 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NUMETA G19%E- 1,000 ML, 
BAG 
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21 5119160334800 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1012 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, EXTRA NITROGEN AND IV 
LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH MEDIUM CHAIN 

TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE OIL, SOYBEAN OIL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFKABIVEN  EXTRA 
NITROGEN 1012 ML 

22 5119160334900 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1250 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, AND IV LIPIDS FISH BASED 
WITH MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND, 

SOYBEAN OIL 

No bid accepted     

23 5119160335000 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1500 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND 
SOYBEAN OIL 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER TRIOMEL N7,  1,500 ML, 
BAG 

24 5119160335100 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1518 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, EXTRA NITROGEN AND IV 
LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH MEDIUM CHAIN 

TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE OIL, SOYBEAN OIL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFKABIVEN  EXTRA 
NITROGEN 1518 ML 

25 5119160335200 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1875 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, AND IV LIPIDS FISH BASED 
WITH MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND, 

SOYBEAN OIL 

No bid accepted     

26 5119160335300 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1970 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH 
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE 

OIL, SOYBEAN OIL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFKABIVEN CENTERAL 
1970 ML 
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27 5119160335400 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 2025 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, EXTRA NITROGEN, IV LIPIDS 
FISH BASED WITH MEDIUM CHAIN 

TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE OIL, SOYBEAN OIL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFKABIVEN  EXTRA 
NITROGEN 2025 ML 

28 5119160335500 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 2463 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH 
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE 

OIL, SOYBEAN OIL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFKABIVEN CENTERAL 
2463 ML 

29 5119160335600 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 300 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, DEXTROSE, IV LIPIDS OLIVE 
OIL AND SOYBEAN OIL FOR PEDIATRIC 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NUMETA G13%E- 300 ML, 
BAG 

30 5119160335700 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 625 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, AND IV LIPIDS FISH BASED 
WITH MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND, 

SOYBEAN OIL 

No bid accepted     

31 5119160335800 CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 986 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH 
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE 

OIL, SOYBEAN OIL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFKABIVEN CENTERAL 
986 ML 

32 5146160500000 CHROMIUM 4MCG/ML INJECTION 10 ML 
VIAL 

NO QUOTE     

33 5119160600000 COPPER 0.4 MG/ML INJECTION 10 ML VIAL GIRGAS TRADING EST -Orig- PFIZER INC COPPER TRACE 

34 5050170100700 CUSTODIOL HTK (HISTIDINE, TRYPOTOPHAN, 
KETOGLUTARATE) 1000 ML SOLUTION 

Mohammed Hammad Al-
Hammad Medical Co. -Orig- 

S.A.L.F S.p.A 
LABORATORIO 

- Servator H 

35 5119190500800 CYANOCOBALAMIN 1 MG/ML INJECTION, 1 
ML AMPOULE 

Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Vitamin B12 STEROP 1mg 
1ml 
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36 5113230100000 DEXTRAN-40 10%, SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION, 500 ML BOTTLE 

NO QUOTE     

37 5119160104000 DEXTROSE 10% (50 G/500 ML) INJECTION 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 1000 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 10% (50 G/500 
ML) INJ 1000ML 

38 5119160100800 DEXTROSE 10% (50 G/500 ML) INJECTION: 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION, 500 ML BOTTLE 

OR BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 10% 500ML 
PLASTIC BOTTLE 

39 5119160700400 DEXTROSE 10% INJECTION 10 ML AMPOULE NO QUOTE     

40 5119160100700 DEXTROSE 25% (62.5 G/250 ML) INJECTION: 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION, 250 ML BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 25% 250ML 
GLASS BOTTLE 

41 5119160207200 DEXTROSE 5 % IN 100 ML MINIBAG PLUS Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER DEXT 5%  INJ, USP, 100 ML 
MINI-BA 

42 5119160208000 DEXTROSE 5 % IN 50 ML MINIBAG PLUS Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER DEXT 5%  INJ, USP, 50 ML 
MINI-BAG 

43 5119160100900 DEXTROSE 5% (12.5 G/250 ML): 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 250 ML BOTTLE 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

DEXTROSE 5% -250 ML 

44 5119160100400 DEXTROSE 5% (2.5 G/50 ML): INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION 50 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

Dextrose 5% 50ml Bag 

45 5119160100000 DEXTROSE 5% (25 G/500 ML) INJECTION: 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION, 500 ML BAG 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

DEXTROSE 5% -500 ML 
BOTTLE 

45 5119160100000 DEXTROSE 5% (25 G/500 ML) INJECTION: 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION, 500 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% 500ML 
PLASTIC BOTTLE 

46 5119160100500 DEXTROSE 5% (5 G/100 ML): INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION 100 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% 100ML BAG 
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47 5119160209000 DEXTROSE 5% PIGGY BAG 25ML Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER DEX 5%  INJ USP, 25 ML, 
BAG 

48 5119170402100 DEXTROSE 5% RINGER LACTATE 1000 ML 
BAG OR BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN RINGER 
LACTATE 1000ML BAG 

49 5119170402000 DEXTROSE 5% RINGER LACTATE 500 ML 
BOTTLE 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

5% Dextrose and Lactated 
Ringer's Inj 

49 5119170402000 DEXTROSE 5% RINGER LACTATE 500 ML 
BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN RINGER 
LACTATE 500ML PB 

50 5119160102000 DEXTROSE 5% WATER 1000 ML BAG Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% 1000ML BAG 

51 5119160210000 DEXTROSE 5% WITH SODIUM CHLORIDE 
0.45% WITH POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 10 MEQ 

INTRAVENOUS SOLUTION 500 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

D5% IN 1/2 NS WITH KCL 
10mEq 500ML BAG 

52 5119180200800 DEXTROSE 5% WITH SODIUM CHLORIDE 
0.45% WITH POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 20 MEQ 

INTRAVENOUS SOLUTION 1000 ML BAG 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER 20 MEQ KCL IN 5% DEX & 
0.45% NACL 

53 5119160101100 DEXTROSE 50% INJECTION IN SYRINGE PRE-
FILLED SYRINGE 50 ML  

NO QUOTE     

54 5119160100600 DEXTROSE 50% INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 50 
ML VIAL 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 50% 50ML VIAL 

55 5119160101500 DEXTROSE 50% INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 
500 ML BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 50% 500ML 
PLASTIC BOTTLE 

56 5119160102400 DEXTROSE 70% INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 
2000ML BAG 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER Dextrose 70% Injection, USP 
in 2, 

http://www.nupco.com/


NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0035/22  

TENDER   NAME: IV FLUIDS & TPN                                                                                                                                                                                           FINAL RESULT STAGE 2  

 

January 5, 2023 
www.nupco.com 

7 of 19 

 

SN NUPCO CODE ITEM SPECIFICATION VENDOR NAME MANUFACTURER TRADE DESCRIPTION 

57 5119199900300 FAT EMULSION 20% (EGG YOLK 
PHOSPHOLIPID, GLYCEROL, SOYA OIL, 

MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES): 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 100 ML BOTTLE 

Medical Supplies & Services 
Co. Ltd -Orig- 

B.BRAUN LIPOFUNDIN MCT/LCT 20% , 
glass bo 

58 5119199900800 FAT EMULSION 20% (EGG YOLK 
PHOSPHOLIPID, GLYCEROL, SOYA OIL, 

MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES): 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 250 ML BOTTLE 

Medical Supplies & Services 
Co. Ltd -Orig- 

B.BRAUN LIPOFUNDIN MCT/LCT 20% , 
glass bo 

59 5119199900700 FAT EMULSION 20% (EGG YOLK 
PHOSPHOLIPID, GLYCEROL, SOYA OIL, 

MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES): 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500 ML BOTTLE 

Medical Supplies & Services 
Co. Ltd -Orig- 

B.BRAUN LIPOFUNDIN MCT/LCT 20% , 
glass bo 

60 5119190400200 FAT EMULSION 20% LONG CHAIN 
TRIGLYCERIDES AND OLIVE OIL BOTTLE 100 

ML 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER CLINOLEIC 20% 100ML BAG 

61 5119190400300 FAT EMULSION 20% LONG CHAIN 
TRIGLYCERIDES AND OLIVE OIL BOTTLE 250 

ML 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER CLINOLEIC 20% 250ML BAG 

62 5119190400400 FAT EMULSION 20% LONG CHAIN 
TRIGLYCERIDES AND OLIVE OIL BOTTLE 500 

ML 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER CLINOLEIC 20% 500ML BAG 

63 5119190400600 FAT EMULSION 20% MEDIUM CHAIN 
TRIGLYCERIDES, LONG CHAIN 

TRIGLYCERIDES WITH FISH OIL 100ML 
BOTTLE 

No bid accepted     

64 5119190400700 FAT EMULSION 20% MEDIUM CHAIN 
TRIGLYCERIDES, LONG CHAIN 

TRIGLYCERIDES WITH FISH OIL 250ML 
BOTTLE 

No bid accepted     
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65 5119190400800 FAT EMULSION 20% MEDIUM CHAIN 
TRIGLYCERIDES, LONG CHAIN 

TRIGLYCERIDES WITH FISH OIL 500ML 
BOTTLE 

No bid accepted     

66 5119190400000 FAT EMULSION 20% SOY BEAN, MEDIUM 
CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES, OLIVE OIL, FISH OIL 

100 ML BOTTLE 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFLIPID  20% 100 ML 

67 5119190400100 FAT EMULSION 20% SOY BEAN, MEDIUM 
CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES, OLIVE OIL, FISH OIL 

250 ML BOTTLE 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFLIPID  20% 250 ML 

68 5119190400500 FAT EMULSION 20% SOY BEAN, MEDIUM 
CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES, OLIVE OIL, FISH OIL 

500ML BOTTLE 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFLIPID  20% 500 ML 

69 5119190502900 FOLIC ACID 5 MG/ML INJECTION, 1 ML VIAL Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Folic Acid 5 mg/ml Injection, 
1 m 

70 5050170100400 GLUTAMINE ALANINE 20G/100ML BOTTLE Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI DIPEPTIVEN 

71 5119190200600 GLYCINE 1.5% 2000 ML FOR IRRIGATION 
BAG OR BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

GLYCINE 1.5% FOR 
IRRIGATION 2000ML BAG 

72 5050170101100 GLYCINE 1.5% 3000 ML FOR IRRIGATION 
BAG OR BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

GLYCINE 1.5% FOR 
IRRIGATION 3000ML BAG 

73 5117160600100 MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 10% INJECTION, 20 
ML AMPOULE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 
10% 20ML AMPOULE 

74 5050160600000 MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 2 GRAM, SODIUM 
CHLORIDE 0.9% 50 ML PREMIXED BAG 

NO QUOTE     

75 5050160600100 MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 4 GRAM, SODIUM 
CHLORIDE 0.9% 100 ML PREMIXED BAG 

NO QUOTE     
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76 5114156600000 MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 50% INJECTION, 5 
ML TO 10 ML AMPOULE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 
50% 5ML AMPOULE 

77 5114156600100 MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 50% INJECTION, 50 
ML VIAL 

NO QUOTE     

78 5119150900200 MANNITOL 20% IN 250 ML GLASS BOTTLE Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

MANNITOL 20% 250ML 
GLASS BOTTLE 

79 5119150900000 MANNITOL 20% IN 500 ML GLASS BOTTLE Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

MANNITOL 20% 500ML 
GLASS BOTTLE 

80 5119150900100 MANNITOL 25% IN 50 ML VIAL NO QUOTE     

81 5119230000000 MULTIPLE ELECTROLYTES INJECTION 1000 
ML PLASMALYTE 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER PLASMALYTE 1,000 ML 
VIAFLO NON-PV 

82 5119160301600 MULTIVITAMINS (LIPID AND WATER 
SOLUBLE) FOR ADULT INJECTION FOR TPN 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER CERNEVIT FOR ADULT 

83 5119190505800 MULTIVITAMINS (LIPID SOLUBLE) FOR 
ADULT 10 ML FOR TPN 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI VITALIPID ADULT 

84 5119160300700 MULTIVITAMINS (LIPID SOLUBLE) FOR 
PEDIATRIC 10 ML FOR TPN 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI VITALIPID INFANT 

85 5119190505700 MULTIVITAMINS (WATER SOLUBLE) FOR 
ADULT 10 ML FOR TPN 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SOLUVIT-N 

86 5119160300800 MULTIVITAMINS (WATER SOLUBLE) FOR 
PEDIATRIC 10 ML FOR TPN 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SOLUVIT-N 

87 5119190506100 MULTIVITAMINS FOR PEDIATRIC (A, B1, B2, 
B3, B5, B6, B7, B12, C, D3, E, K1, FOLIC ACID) 

INJECTION: CONCENTRATED, 4 ML & 1 ML 
VIAL FOR TPN 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig-  

BAXTER 
  

PAED MULTI 12 W/VITAMIN 
K 5mL Via 
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88 5119160335900 PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1000 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND 
SOYBEAN OIL 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER PERIOLIMEL N4E-1000ML 
BAG 

89 5119160301300 PEIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1500 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND 
SOYBEAN OIL 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER PERIOLIMEL N4E-1500ML 
BAG 

90 5119160336000 PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 2000 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND 
SOYBEAN OIL 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER PERIOLIMEL N4E - 2000ML 
BAG 

91 5119160301200 PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1206ML BAG WITH IV LIPIDS 

FISH BASED WITH MEDIUM CHAIN 
TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE OIL, SOYBEAN OIL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFKABIVEN PERIPHERAL 
1206 ML 

92 5119160336100 PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1250 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH 
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND, 

SOYBEAN OIL 

Medical Supplies & Services 
Co. Ltd -Orig- 

B.BRAUN OMEFLEX PERI N3CN 1250 
ML 

93 5119160336200 PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1448 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH 
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE 

OIL, SOYBEAN OIL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFKABIVEN PERIPHERAL 
1448 ML 

94 5119160336300 PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1875 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH 
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND, 

SOYBEAN OIL 

Medical Supplies & Services 
Co. Ltd -Orig- 

B.BRAUN OMEFLEX PERI N3CN 1875 
ML 
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95 5119160301400 PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 1904ML BAG WITH IV LIPIDS 

FISH BASED WITH MEDIUM CHAIN 
TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE OIL, SOYBEAN OIL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI SMOFKABIVEN PERIPHERAL 
1904 ML 

96 5119160336400 PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER PARENTERAL 
NUTRITION 2500 ML BAG WITH 

ELECTROLYTES, IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH 
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND, 

SOYBEAN OIL 

Medical Supplies & Services 
Co. Ltd -Orig- 

B.BRAUN OMEFLEX PERI N3CN 2500 
ML 

97 5113190600100 PLASMA EXPANDER MODIFIED GELATIN 
INFUSION BAG 500 ML 

Medical Supplies & Services 
Co. Ltd -Orig- 

B.BRAUN GELASPAN 4% EP 500ML 
Plasma-adapt 

98 5119180400000 POTASSIUM ACETATE 3.93 G/20 ML 
(POTASSIUM 40 MMOL/20 ML) INJECTION: 

CONCENTRATED, 20 ML VIAL 

No bid accepted     

99 5119180200400 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 20 MEQ IN 
DEXTROSE 5% SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% 

INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500 ML BAG 

No bid accepted     

100 5119180201300 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 20 MMOL, SODIUM 
CHLORIDE 0.9% 100 ML PREMIXED BAG 

No bid accepted     

101 5119180201400 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 20 MMOL, SODIUM 
CHLORIDE 0.9% 250 ML PREMIXED BAG 

NO QUOTE     

102 5119180200100 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 2MEQ/ML INJECTION 
10 ML 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 15% 
INJECTION 10 ML 

102 5119180200100 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 2MEQ/ML INJECTION 
10 ML 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 15% 
10ML AMPOULE 

103 5119180201100 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 2MEQ/ML INJECTION 
20 ML 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 15% 
20ML AMPOULE 
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104 5119180204100 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 40 MMOL; SODIUM 
CHLORIDE 0.9% 1000 ML BAG 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER  40 MEQ KCL IN 0.9% NACL 
INJ, USP 

105 5119180204000 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 40 MMOL; SODIUM 
CHLORIDE 0.9% 500 ML BAG 

No bid accepted     

106 5119180202600 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE CONCENTRATED 
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 2MEQ/ML, 250 

ML BOTTLE OR BAG 

NO QUOTE     

107 5117162800200 POTASSIUM PHOSPHATE (POTASSIUM 4.4 
MMOL/ML + PHOSPHATE 3 MMOL/ML) 5 TO 

15 ML INJECTION 

Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Potassium Phosphate 
3mmol/ml 5ml 

108 5117162800000 POTASSIUM PHOSPHATE 2 MMOL/ML 
INJECTION 10 TO 20 ML AMPOULE 

Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Potassium Phosphate 
4.4mEq/ml 20m 

109 5119160400200 RINGER LACTATE INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 
1000 ML BAG OR BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

RINGER LACTATE 1000ML 
BAG 

110 5119160400100 RINGER LACTATE INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 
500 ML BAG OR BOTTLE 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

Lactated Ringer 

110 5119160400100 RINGER LACTATE INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 
500 ML BAG OR BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

RINGER LACTATE 500ML 
PLASTIC BOTTLE 

111 5124121800200 SELENIUM 10 TO 50MCG/ML INJECTION Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

AGUETTANT SELENIUM INJECTABLE A 10 
µg/mL 

112 5119170300000 SODIUM ACETATE 2 MEQ/ML INJECTION IN 
20 ML VIAL 

NO QUOTE     

113 5119156600000 SODIUM ACETATE 2 MEQ/ML 50 ML VIAL  NO QUOTE     

114 5117150400600 SODIUM BICARBONATE 4.2% 
[0.5MMOL/1ML] 10 ML SYRINGE 

Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Sodium Bicarbonate 4.2% 
10ml Pre- 

115 5117150400800 SODIUM BICARBONATE 5% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION 250 ML BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM BICARBONATE 5% 
250ML GLASS BOTTLE 
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116 5117150401200 SODIUM BICARBONATE 8.4% [1MMOL/1ML] 
10ML SYRINGE 

Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Sodium Bicarbonate 8.4% 
10ml Pre- 

117 5117150401100 SODIUM BICARBONATE 8.4% [1MMOL/1ML] 
250 ML BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM BICARBONATE 
8.4% 250ML GB 

118 5117150400200 SODIUM BICARBONATE 8.4% IN 50 ML PRE 
FILLED SYRINGE                              

NO QUOTE     

119 5117150400300 SODIUM BICARBONATE 8.4% INJECTION 50 
ML VIAL 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM BICARBONATE 
8.4% 50ML VIAL 

120 5119160101900 DEXTROSE 10% SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.18% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 250 ML BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 10% IN 1/5 NS 
250ML GB 

121 5119160101200 DEXTROSE 5% SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.18% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 250 ML BOTTLE OR 

BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN 1/5 NS 
250ML BAG 

122 5119160101000 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.225%, DEXTROSE 
SOLUTION 10% IN 250 ML BOTTLE OR BAG, 

WITHOUT IV SET 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 10% IN 1/4 NS 
250ML BAG 

123 5119160102100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.225%, DEXTROSE 
SOLUTION 5% IN 250 ML BOTTLE OR BAG, 

WITHOUT IV SET 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN 1/4 NS 
250ML BAG 

124 5119160102900 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.225% DEXTROSE 5% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 1000 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN 1/4 NS 
1000ML BAG 

125 5119160100300 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.225%, DEXTROSE 5%: 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500 ML BOTTLE OR 

BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN 1/4 NS 
500ML PB 

126 5119160101300 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45%, DEXTROSE 
SOLUTION 5% IN 250 ML BOTTLE OR BAG, 

WITHOUT IV SET 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN 1/2 NS 
250ML BAG 
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127 5119160101700 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% DEXTROSE 10% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION, 250 ML BOTTLE 

OR BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 10% IN 1/2 NS 
250ML BAG 

128 5119160102500 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% DEXTROSE 5% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 1000 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN 1/2 NS 
1000ML BAG 

129 5119160100200 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% DEXTROSE 5% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION, 500 ML BOTTLE 

OR BAG 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% 
DEXTROSE 5% INTRAV 

129 5119160100200 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% DEXTROSE 5% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION, 500 ML BOTTLE 

OR BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN 1/2 NS 
500ML PB 

130 5119160203000 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION 500 ML BOTTLE OR BAG 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

0.45% w/v Sodium Chloride 
Injection 

130 5119160203000 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION 500 ML BOTTLE OR BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

1/2 NORMAL SALINE 500ML 
PLASTIC BOTTLE 

131 5119160203700 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% INTRAVENOUS 
INJECTION 1000 ML BAG 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NACL 0.45% INJECTIO 1000 
ML, BAG 

132 5113190600000 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% (77 MMOL/500 
ML, 4.5 G/500 ML) HYDROXYETHYL STARCH 
6% (30 G/500 ML) INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 

500 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

PLASMEX 6% (HES) 500ML 
PLASTIC BOTTLE 

133 5119160202500 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 1000 ML FOR 
IRRIGATION BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 
FOR IRR 1000ML BAG 

133 5119160202500 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 1000 ML FOR 
IRRIGATION BAG 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NACL 0.9%  FOR IRRIG  
1000ML BAG 

134 5119160206400 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 1000 ML FOR 
IRRIGATION BOTTLE 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NACL 0.9% IRRIG., 1,000ML 
BOTTLE 
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134 5119160206400 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 1000 ML FOR 
IRRIGATION BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 
FOR IRR 1000ML PB 

135 5119160202600 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 2000 ML FOR 
IRRIGATION BOTTLE OR BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 
FOR IRR 2000ML BAG 

136 5119160209300 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 3000 ML FOR 
IRRIGATION BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 
FOR IRR 3000ML BAG 

136 5119160209300 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 3000 ML FOR 
IRRIGATION BAG 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NACL 0.9%  FOR IRRIG, 
3000ML BAG 

137 5119160203500 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 500 ML 
IRRIGATION BOTTLE 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NACL 0.9% 500 ML IRRIG, 
BOTTLE 

138 5119160101400 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% DEXTROSE 5% IN 
250 ML BOTTLE OR BAG WITHOUT IV SET 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN NORMAL 
SALINE 250ML BAG 

139 5119160102600 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% DEXTROSE 5% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 1000 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN NORMAL 
SALINE 1000ML BAG 

140 5119160100100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% DEXTROSE 5% 
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 5% IN NORMAL 
SALINE 500ML BAG 

141 5119160204700 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% IN 100 ML 
MINIBAG PLUS 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NACL0.9% IN 100 ML 
MINIBAG PLUS 

142 5119160209100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% IN 25 ML PIGGY 
BAG 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER NACL 0.9% IN 25 ML PIGGY 
BAG 

143 5119160204800 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% IN 50 ML MINIBAG 
PLUS 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER . QUAD PACK  WITH 
ADAPTOR 

144 5119160202700 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 10 ML 
AMPOULE 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 
INJECTION 10 ML AMP 
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144 5119160202700 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 10 ML 
AMPOULE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

NORMAL SALINE 10ML 
AMPOULE 

145 5119160201700 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 10 ML 
SYRINGE 

Health Mart Medical -Orig- Jiangsu Embrace 
Science 

Embrace Pre-Filled Flush 
Syringes 

145 5119160201700 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 10 ML 
SYRINGE 

International Medical Supplies 
Co -Orig- 

BD BD PosiFlush™ SP Prefilled 
Saline 

146 5119160207300 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 10 ML 
VIAL PRESERVATIVE FREE 

No bid accepted     

147 5119160200500 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 3 ML 
SYRINGE 

Health Mart Medical -Orig- Jiangsu Embrace 
Science 

Embrace Pre-Filled Flush 
Syringes 

147 5119160200500 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 3 ML 
SYRINGE 

International Medical Supplies 
Co -Orig- 

BD BBD PosiFlush™ SP Prefilled 
Salin 

148 5119160200600 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 5 ML 
SYRINGE 

Health Mart Medical -Orig- Jiangsu Embrace 
Science 

Embrace Pre-Filled Flush 
Syringes 

148 5119160200600 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 5 ML 
SYRINGE 

International Medical Supplies 
Co -Orig- 

BD BBD PosiFlush™ SP Prefilled 
Salin 

149 5119160207400 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 5 ML 
VIAL PRESERVATIVE FREE 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 
INJECTION 5 ML AMP 

149 5119160207400 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJECTION 5 ML 
VIAL PRESERVATIVE FREE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

NORMAL SALINE 5ML 
AMPOULE 

150 5119160200200 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION 100 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

NORMAL SALINE 100ML 
BAG 

151 5119160200300 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION 50 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

NORMAL SALINE 50ML BAG 

http://www.nupco.com/


NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0035/22  

TENDER   NAME: IV FLUIDS & TPN                                                                                                                                                                                           FINAL RESULT STAGE 2  

 

January 5, 2023 
www.nupco.com 

17 of 19 

 

SN NUPCO CODE ITEM SPECIFICATION VENDOR NAME MANUFACTURER TRADE DESCRIPTION 

152 5119160200100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION 500 ML BOTTLE OR BAG 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INJ 
500ML BOTTLE 

152 5119160200100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INTRAVENOUS 
INFUSION 500 ML BOTTLE OR BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

NORMAL SALINE 500ML 
PLASTIC BOTTLE 

153 5119160201500 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INTRAVENOUS 
INJECTION 1000 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

NORMAL SALINE 1000ML 
BAG 

154 5119160202300 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% INTRAVENOUS 
INJECTION 250 ML BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

NORMAL SALINE 250ML 
BAG 

155 5119160203400 SODIUM CHLORIDE 14.61% INJECTION 50 
ML VIAL 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 14.61% 
50ML VIAL 

156 5119160202900 SODIUM CHLORIDE 3% INJECTION 10 ML 
AMPOULE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 3% 
10ML AMPOULE 

157 5119160202200 SODIUM CHLORIDE 3% INTRAVENOUS 
INJECTION 500 ML BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 3% 
500ML PLASTIC BOTTLE 

158 5119160209400 SODIUM CHLORIDE 4MEQ/ML (23.4%) 
INJECTION 30 TO 50 ML 

NO QUOTE     

159 5119199900600 SODIUM GLYCEROPHOSPHATE (SODIUM 2 
MMOL/ML, PHOSPHATE 1 MMOL/ML) 20 

ML VIAL 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI GLYCOPHOS 

160 5117162200300 SODIUM PHOSPHATE 3 MMOL/ML AS 
PHOSPHATE 10 TO 15 ML INJECTION 

No bid accepted     

161 5132160800000 SODIUM TETRADECYL SULPHATE 3% INJ 
(STD) 2ML 

NO QUOTE     

http://www.nupco.com/


NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0035/22  

TENDER   NAME: IV FLUIDS & TPN                                                                                                                                                                                           FINAL RESULT STAGE 2  

 

January 5, 2023 
www.nupco.com 

18 of 19 

 

SN NUPCO CODE ITEM SPECIFICATION VENDOR NAME MANUFACTURER TRADE DESCRIPTION 

162 5119150900300 SORBITOL MANNITOL IRRIGATION 
SOLUTION 540MG/100ML IN 3000 ML 

NO QUOTE     

163 5119160101600 STERILE DEXTROSE SOLUTION FOR 
INJECTION 10 % IN 250 ML BOTTLE OR BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

DEXTROSE 10% 250ML BAG 

164 5119160202400 STERILE SODIUM CHLORIDE SOLUTION 
0.225% 500 ML BOTTLE OR BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

1/4 NORMAL SALINE 500ML 
PLASTIC BOTTLE 

165 5119160500100 STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION 10 ML 
AMPOULE 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

STERILE WATER FOR 
INJECTION 10 ML AMPOUL 

165 5119160500100 STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION 10 ML 
AMPOULE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

WATER FOR INJECTION 
10ML AMPOULE 

166 5119160500400 STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION 1000ML 
BAG 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

WATER FOR INJECTION 
1000ML BAG 

167 5119160500900 STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION 2000 ML 
BAG 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER ST. WATER FOR INJ, USP, 
2000 ML 

168 5119160501200 STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION 5 ML 
AMPOULE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

WATER FOR INJECTION 5ML 
AMPOULE 

169 5119160501000 STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION 50 ML VIAL NO QUOTE     

170 5119160500200 STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION 500 ML BAG 
OR BOTTLE 

Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

WATER FOR INJECTION 
500ML PLASTIC BOTTLE 

170 5119160500200 STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION 500 ML BAG 
OR BOTTLE 

AlRazi pharmaceutical 
industry -Orig- 

ALRAZI PHARMA  
INDUSTRIES FACTORY 

CO. 

STERILE WATER FOR 
INJECTION 500ML Bottle 

171 5119199800100 TRACE ELEMENT FOR TPN USE 10ML VIAL 
FOR ADULT 

Saudi Pharmaceutical 
Company -Orig- 

FRESENIUS KABI ADDAVEN 
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SN NUPCO CODE ITEM SPECIFICATION VENDOR NAME MANUFACTURER TRADE DESCRIPTION 

172 5119199800200 TRACE ELEMENT FOR TPN USE 10ML VIAL 
FOR PEDIATRICS 

Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

BAXTER Junyelt® 10 ML AMPOULE 
Mix of 5 

173 5119190501000 VITAMIN B1 (THIAMINE HYDROCHLORIDE) 
100 MG/2 ML INJECTION 2 ML AMPOULE 

Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Vitamin B1 Sterop 100mg 
2ml 

174 5119190503700 VITAMIN B6 (PYRIDOXINE) 50 MG/ML 2 ML 
INJECTION 

Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Vitamin B6 Sterop 100mg 
2ml 

175 5050151200500 VITAMIN E (TOCOPHEROL) INTRAVENOUS 
INJECTION 100 MG/ML AMPOULE 

NO QUOTE     

176 5119160500300 WATER FOR IRRIGATION 1000 ML BAG Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

WATER FOR IRRIGATION 
1000ML BAG 

177 5147350400200 WATER FOR IRRIGATION 1000 ML BOTTLE Pharmaceutical Solutions 
Industry Ltd. -Orig- 

PHARMACEUTICAL 
SOLUTIONS 
INDUSTRY 

WATER FOR IRRIGATION 
1000ML PB 

178 5124130301200 ZINC CHLORIDE 1MG/ML INJ GIRGAS TRADING EST -Orig- PFIZER ZINC TRACE FT 

179 5124130301600 ZINC GLUCONATE 1 MG/ML 10ML VIAL Arabian Health Care Supply 
Company -Orig- 

AGUETTANT ZINC INJECTABLE A 1 mg/mL 

180 5124130300300 ZINC SULPHATE 1MG/ML INJECTION Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Zinc Sulphate 1mg/ml 5ml 
Ampoule 

181 5124130300400 ZINC SULPHATE CONCENTRATED SOLUTION 
FOR INJ 5MG/ML, 5ML VIAL 

Yahmaa Medical Co. -Orig- Sterop Zinc Sulphate for Injection 
5mg/m 
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