SN	NUPCO Code	Item Description	Equipment Group	Vendor Name	Vendor No	Catalog No	Manufacturer	COUNTRY	REASON OF CANCELLED
1	4215151000000	SHIELD PROTECTIVE VISIBLE LIGHT CURE HAND - HELD	ITEMIZED	MASA MEDICAL EST Orig-	400665	HNPHS-103	SHANGHAI HUA INDUSTRIAL CO.LTD	China	
2	4228190403200	POUCH 4.5X9 SELF SEAL 1000 POUCH/BOX	ITEMIZED	Asnan Medical Company -Orig-	400172	YSP-115230	ANQING YIPAK PACKAGING MATERIAL CO., LTD	China	
3	4228190403400	POUCH STERILIZATION 6.5X10 1000 POUCH/BOX	ITEMIZED	Asnan Medical Company -Orig-	400172	YSP-165255	ANQING YIPAK PACKAGING MATERIAL CO., LTD	China	
3	4228190403400	POUCH STERILIZATION 6.5X10 1000 POUCH/BOX	ITEMIZED	MASA MEDICAL EST Orig-	400665	HN010	SHANGHAI HUA INDUSTRIAL CO.LTD	China	
4	4215161425300	BUR FINISHING STEEL LONG TAPERED ROUND ISO# 310 - 204 - 001 - 071 - 016	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED  DESCRIPTION
5	4215180508800	BUR POLISHER LENS SHAPE FOR COMPOSITE RA ISO# 658 - 204 - 303 - 502 - 100	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED  DESCRIPTION
6	4215161441900	BUR POLISHER WHEEL RUBBER BROWN PRE - POLISHER ISO# 658 - 900 - 303 - 515 - 170	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED  DESCRIPTION
7	4215150002700	BUR EXCAVATING ROUND HP # 8	ITEMIZED	HUSN AL EMIRAT TRADING COMPANY - Orig-	400482	C 1 104 023	HOPF, RINGLEB & CO. GMBH & CI	Germany	
8	4215150068500	BUR EXCAVATING CROSSCUT FISSURE TAPERED RA #1	ITEMIZED	Medical Choice Est Orig-	400611	C33-204-008	RDT GmbH	Austria	
9	4215161475000	BUR SURGICAL AND ENDODONTIC LENGTH CARBIDE RIGHT ANGLE BUR SURGICAL LENGTH 2 DIAMETER 1.2 MM	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
10	4215150092300	BUR CARBIDE FG (FRICTION GRIP) TAPERED FISSURE HEAD ISO NO: 500314168006 SIZE (012)	ITEMIZED	Commercial and Maintenance CoOrig	400278	103212	DFS	Germany	
10	4215150092300	BUR CARBIDE FG (FRICTION GRIP) TAPERED FISSURE HEAD ISO NO: 500314168006 SIZE (012)	ITEMIZED	CIGALAH HEALTHCARE COMPANY -Orig-	401209	500-314-168-006-012	JOTA	Switzerland	
11	4215165800600	FLOSS THREADER	ITEMIZED	LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig-	400580	UL0029	LAYAN	China	
12	4215247702300	GUTTA PERCHA BAR FOR DENTAL ENDODONTIC OBTURA II SYSTEM	ITEMIZED	LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig-	400580	BL-GPB1	GOLDENT	China	

SN	NUPCO Code	Item Description	Equipment Group	Vendor Name	Vendor No	Catalog No	Manufacturer	COUNTRY	REASON OF CANCELLED
13	4215293000400	ENDODONTIC MICRO - SURGICAL INSTRUMENT KIT PROVIDED WITH PREFABRICATED METAL CASSETTE WITH SELF - LOCK (AUTOCLAVABLE) CONTAIN THE FOLLOWING ITEMS 20 KIS DE DOUBLE ENDED HANDLE 1 KIS SE SINGLE ENDED HANDLE 1 KISSCAL SCAPEL HANDLE 1 KISSTAR STAR COLLET HANDLE 2 K WRENCH KIS INSTRUMENTS 2 KB 1 BURNISHER. 052 INCH 1.3 MM BALL 1 KB 2 BURNISHER. 056 INCH 1.4 MM BALL 1 KC 1 COLUMBIA CURETTE LEFT 1 KC 2 COLUMBIA CURETTE RIGHT 1 KC 3 EXT GRACEY CURETTE 13 LEFT 1 KC 4 EXT GRACEY CURETTE 14 RT 1 KC 5 SMALL ENDO E XC LEFT 1 KC 6 SMALL ENDO EXC RIGHT 1 KC 7 LARGE ENDO EXC LEFT 1 KC 8 LARGE ENDO EXC RIGHT 1 KC 9 MOLT 2 CURETTE 1 KC 10 MOLT 4 CURETTE 1 KC 11 MOLT CURETTE OFFSET L 1 KC 12 MOLT CURETTE OFFSET R 1 KC 13 CURRETTE SCALER 2.0 LEFT 1 KC 14 CURR ETTE SCALER 2.0 RIGHT 1 KC 15 SURG CURETTE OFFSET 1.5 R 1 KE 1 PRICHA	ITEMIZED	LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig-	400580	DA-MSK	DENTON INTRUMENT	Pakistan	
14	4215160001400	SPACE MAINTAINER PREFABRICATED KIT STAINLESS STEEL BAND ASSORTED KIT FOR DECIDUOUS (PRIMARY) MOLARS ANATOMICALLY CONTOURED PRE - WELDED RETAINER TUBE ON BAND WITH THE FOLLOWING COMPONENTS 120 - 144 BANDS - NARROW PERFORMED MAINTAINER WIRE (20) - PREFORMED MAINTAINER WIRES WITH DROP - LOOP (30) .NARROW PREFORMED MAINTAINER WIRES WITH RESTS (20) - NARROW PREFORMED MAINTENANCE WIRES WITH DISTAL SHOES (20 EACH) - CRIMPING PLIERS FOR THE TUBES (1)	ITEMIZED	AL-MADAR Co. for Medical Equipment - Orig-	401026	387-150	DENOVO	USA	
15	4215270003000	INDELIBLE PENCIL	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
16	4215270003500	UNIVERSAL PLASTIC FORK BITE REGISTRATION	ITEMIZED	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation
17	4215181300000	JIFFY TUBES STRAIGHT	ITEMIZED	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation
18	4215260000100	CAVITY CLEANSER WITH CHLORHEXIDINE ANTIBACTERIAL SOLUTION 7ML BOTTLE	ITEMIZED	Company AWAFI AL- SALAMA Commerical Limit -Orig-	400574	6011605D	KASHAF ALKAWASHEF FOR INDUSTRY CO	Saudi Arabia	

SN	NUPCO Code	Item Description	Equipment Group	Vendor Name	Vendor No	Catalog No	Manufacturer	COUNTRY	REASON OF CANCELLED
19	4215150042400	GUTTA PERCHA POINT SUBJECTED TO A PATENTED PROCESS OF IMPREGNATING AND COATING WITH BIOCERAMIC NANOPARTICLES. STIFFER THAN NORMAL GUTTA PERCHA. SIZE 30 . 06 TAPER	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
20	4215150042300	GUTTA PERCHA POINT SUBJECTED TO A PATENTED PROCESS OF IMPREGNATING AND COATING WITH BIOCERAMIC NANOPARTICLES. STIFFER THAN NORMAL GUTTA PERCHA. SIZE 30 . 04 TAPER	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
21	4215161005100	5.25% MEDICAL SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE CANAL IRRIGATION SOLUTION 500 ML	ITEMIZED	Company AWAFI AL- SALAMA Commerical Limit -Orig-	400574	PV-MP-CHX00501	PHARMAVITALITY	Saudi Arabia	
22	4215161004900	3% MEDICAL SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE CANAL IRRIGATION SOLUTION 500 ML	ITEMIZED	Company AWAFI AL- SALAMA Commerical Limit -Orig-	400574	PV-MP-CHX00301	PHARMAVITALITY	Saudi Arabia	
23	4215150070000	ENDODONTIC HAND SPREADER STAINLESS STEEL SINGLE ENDED SIZE 25	ITEMIZED	LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig-	400580	DA-2605	DENTON INTRUMENT	Pakistan	
24	4215150052300	ENDODONTIC HAND SPREADER STAINLESS STEEL, SINGLE ENDED SIZE D11	ITEMIZED	CIGALAH HEALTHCARE COMPANY -Orig-	401209	386440	CORICAMA	Italy	
24	4215150052300	ENDODONTIC HAND SPREADER STAINLESS STEEL, SINGLE ENDED SIZE D11	ITEMIZED	LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig-	400580	DA-2607	DENTON INTRUMENT	Pakistan	
25	4215150052100	ENDODONTIC BUCHANAN ROOT CANAL PLUGGER SET A TAPERED NICKEL - TITANIUM END AND A STAINLESS STEEL END SIZE 2	ITEMIZED	Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company - Orig-	400038	974-0059	KERR	USA	
26	4215150015200	OBTURA DELIVERY NEEDLE, 25 GAUGE	ITEMIZED	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation
27	4215150015100	OBTURA DELIVERY NEEDLE, 23 GAUGE	ITEMIZED	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation
28	4215150013200	ENDODONTICS ULTRASONIC BUC3 TIP	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
29	4215150013100	ENDODONTICS ULTRASONIC BUC1 TIP	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
30	4215150013000	ENDODONTICS ULTRASONIC BUC 3 A TIP	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
31	4215150012900	ENDODONTICS ULTRASONIC BUC 2 A TIP	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
32	4215150012800	ENDODONTICS ULTRASONIC BUC 2 TIP	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
33	4215150012700	ENDODONTICS ULTRASONIC BUC 1 A TIP	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
34	4215150092600	ENDODONTICS ULTRASONIC BUC ASSORTED TIPS (BUC1 - BUC 3 A)	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION

SN	NUPCO Code	Item Description	Equipment Group	Vendor Name	Vendor No	Catalog No	Manufacturer	COUNTRY	REASON OF CANCELLED
35	4215165100100	BRASS WIRE SEPARATOR 0.5 MM DIAMETER 50G SPOOL	ITEMIZED	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation
36	4215150022700	COTTON ROLL #4 FOR DENTAL	ITEMIZED	Al Razi Medical Supplies Co -Orig-	400837	CW001-5A	ZOGEAR	China	
37	4215250801500	DENTAL LONG NEEDLE METRIC GAUGE 25 (0.50 X 35 MM) STERILE 100	ITEMIZED	MASA MEDICAL EST Orig-	400665	HNDN25LM	SHANDONG WUZHOU MEDICAL EQUIPMENT CO LTD	China	
38	4215250801700	DENTAL LONG NEEDLE METRIC GAUGE 27 (0.40X35MM) STERILE LONG 100	ITEMIZED	ALSHIFA MEDICAL PRODUCTS CO.(CJS) - Orig-	400375	F 0504273500	AL SHIFA MEDICAL PRODUCTS COMPANY	Saudi Arabia	
39	4215250801100	DENTAL SHORT NEEDLE METRIC GAUGE 30 (0.30 X 25 MM) STERILE 100	ITEMIZED	ALSHIFA MEDICAL PRODUCTS CO.(CJS) - Orig-	400375	F 0504302500	AL SHIFA MEDICAL PRODUCTS COMPANY	Saudi Arabia	
40	4215250801200	DENTAL LONG NEEDLE METRIC GAUGE 30 (0.30 X 35 MM) STERILE 100	ITEMIZED	MASA MEDICAL EST Orig-	400665	HNDN30LM	SHANDONG WUZHOU MEDICAL EQUIPMENT CO LTD	China	
41	5313150400000	WAXED DENTAL FLOSS OF 15 - 50 METERS	ITEMIZED	LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig-	400580	UL0005	LAYAN	China	
42	4215165800000	FLOSS DENTAL SUPER UNWAXED 15 - 50 METERS	ITEMIZED	Medical Choice Est Orig-	400611	34060	P&G	Ireland	
43	4215271702100	PREFORMED KOBAYASHI LIGATURE WIRE LONG SIZE 0.010 INCH	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED  DESCRIPTION
44	4215271701900	PREFORMED KOBAYASHI LIGATURE WIRE LONG SIZE 0.014 INCH	ITEMIZED	Medical &Pharmaceutical Services Ba -Orig-	400323	271-0014	ORMCO	Mexico	
45	4215271214500	STAINLESS STEEL BAND FOR FIRST DECIDUOUS MOLAR (UPPER AND LOWER Rt lt) SIZE 4	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DESCRIPTION NEED TO BE REVISED
46	4215271214600	STAINLESS STEEL BAND FOR FIRST DECIDUOUS MOLAR (UPPER AND LOWER Rt lt) SIZE 5	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DESCRIPTION NEED TO BE REVISED
47	4215271214800	STAINLESS STEEL BAND FOR FIRST DECIDUOUS MOLAR (UPPER AND LOWER Rt lt) SIZE 3	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DESCRIPTION NEED TO BE REVISED
48	4215271214900	STAINLESS STEEL BAND FOR SECOND DECIDUOUS MOLAR (UPPER AND LOWER Rt lt) SIZE 3	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DESCRIPTION NEED TO BE REVISED
49	4215271215000	STAINLESS STEEL BAND FOR SECOND DECIDUOUS MOLAR (UPPER AND LOWER Rt lt) SIZE 4	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DESCRIPTION NEED TO BE REVISED
50	4215271215100	STAINLESS STEEL BAND FOR SECOND DECIDUOUS MOLAR (UPPER AND LOWER Rt lt) SIZE 5	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DESCRIPTION NEED TO BE REVISED

SN	NUPCO Code	Item Description	Equipment Group	Vendor Name	Vendor No	Catalog No	Manufacturer	COUNTRY	REASON OF CANCELLED
51	4215271215200	STAINLESS STEEL BAND FOR SECOND DECIDUOUS MOLAR (UPPER AND LOWER Rt It) SIZE 6	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DESCRIPTION NEED TO BE REVISED
52	4215169302200	LEDERMIX PASTE CONTAINING OF TRIAMCINOLONE ACETONIDE AND DEMECLOCYCLINE HCL USED AS INTRACANAL MEDICAMENT	ITEMIZED	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation
53	4215161003600	10-MDP CONTAINING SELF ADHESIVE	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DESCRIPTION NEED TO BE REVISED
54	4215181001100	COMPOSITE POLISHING PASTE	ITEMIZED	MASA MEDICAL EST Orig-	400665	50001	PREVEST DENPRO	India	
55	4215248000900	HEAVY BODY TRAY MATERIAL (PURPLE) - 50 ML 20 GARANT MIXING TIPS GREEN	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DESCRIPTION NEED TO BE REVISED
56	4215161009000	INTRAORAL POLISHING CERAMIC KIT	ITEMIZED	Thimar Al Jazirah Company -Orig-	400030	RA305	EVE	Germany	
57	4231160702600	15%-20% FERRIC SULPHATE EQUIVALENT SOLUTION	ITEMI <mark>ZE</mark> D	Company AWAFI AL- SALAMA Commerical Limit -Orig-	400574	PV-MP-FCC00201	PHARMAVITALITY	Saudi Arabia	
58	4215161004100	SILVER DIAMINE FLUORIDE FILLING 38%	ITEMIZED	Maward al-elag medical company - Orig-	400923	635IN3000	ELEVATE ORAL CARE	USA	
59	4215245300900	DENTAL COMPOSITE FILLING MATERIAL KIT PACKABLE FOR POSTERIOR TEETH RADIOPAQUE KIT CONSISTS OF THE FOLLOWING: 4 COMPOSITE SYRINGE - COLOR A 2 A 3 A 3.5 C 2 ONE SYRINGE 37% ETCHING GEL ONE SINGLE - BOTTLE (PRIMER BONDING) DENTIN ADHESIVE 50 DISPOSABLE MICRO BRUSHES ETCHING GEL NE EDLE TIPS	ITEMIZED	Abdulrehman Algosaibi G.T.C -Orig-	400019	1801	VOCO DENTAL	Germany	
60	4215190400200	DISCLOSING GEL WITH PLAQUE INDICATOR	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED  DESCRIPTION
61	4215161475700	INTERMEDIATE RESTORATIVE MATERIAL POWDER AND LIQUID KIT	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER
62	4215150005400	FILM PERIAPICAL FOR DENTAL X - RAY SIZE 2	ITEMIZED	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation
63	4215161033000	X - RAY FILM DENTAL 27 X 54 MM OCCLUSAL FILM	ITEMIZED	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation	No Quotation
64	4215169700000	SURGICAL ASPIRATOR TIPS SIZE 14 INCHES	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER
65	4215271819700	ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, 0.018X0.025INCH, STAINLESS STEEL, UPPER	ITEMIZED	Medical &Pharmaceutical Services Ba -Orig-	400323	210-0713	ORMCO	Mexico	

ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, 0.018X0.025INCH, STAINLESS STEEL, LOWER ITEMIZED Reverse Ba -Orig-  ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, 0.016X.022, REVERSE CURVE ITEMIZED Reverse Gurve ITEMIZED Reverse Ba -Orig-  ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, 0.016X.022, REVERSE CURVE ITEMIZED Reverse Gurve ITEMIZED Reverse Ba -Orig-  ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, 0.016X.022, REVERSE CURVE ITEMIZED Reverse Gurve ITEMIZED Reverse Ba -Orig-  Medical Reverse Curve Reverse Curve Reverse Curve ITEMIZED Reverse Ba -Orig-  ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, 0.017X.025, REVERSE CURVE ITEMIZED Reverse Ba -Orig-  Medical Reverse Curve Reverse Curve Reverse Curve Reverse Curve Reverse Curve Reverse Ba -Orig-  Medical Reverse Curve Reverse Ba -Orig-  Medical Reve	
ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, .016X.022, REVERSE CURVE, UPPER, TMA  LOWER TMA ARCHWIRE 0.016X0.022INCH, REVERSE CURVE  ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, .016X.022, REVERSE CURVE  LOWER TMA ARCHWIRE 0.016X0.022INCH, REVERSE CURVE  ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, .017X.025, REVERSE CURVE  CURVE, UPPER, TMA  ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, .017X.025, REVERSE CURVE  Services Ba -Orig-  Medical  ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, .017X.025, REVERSE CURVE  Services Ba -Orig-  Services Ba -Orig-  Services Ba -Orig-	
68 4215271820400 LOWER TMA ARCHWIRE 0.016X0.022INCH, REVERSE CURVE Services Ba -Orig-  69 4215271820800 ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, .017X.025, REVERSE CURVE ITEMIZED & Pharmaceutical CURVE, UPPER, TMA  CURVE, UPPER, TMA  LOWER TMA ARCHWIRE 0.016X0.022INCH, ITEMIZED & Pharmaceutical A00323 216-0003 ORMCO Mexico  Medical & Pharmaceutical A00323 215-0004 ORMCO Mexico  Services Ba -Orig-	
69 4215271820800 ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, .017X.025, REVERSE ITEMIZED &Pharmaceutical 400323 215-0004 ORMCO Mexico  CURVE, UPPER, TMA Services Ba -Orig-	
Madical	
Medical 70 4215271820500 ARCHWIRE, ORTHODONTIC, .017X.025, REVERSE ITEMIZED &Pharmaceutical 400323 216-0004 ORMCO Mexico CURVE, LOWER, TMA Services Ba -Orig-	
71 4215210703700 TEMPORARY LUTING CEMENT GC FREEGENOL ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED	PRICE CONCERN
72 4215200002700 IMAGING DIGITAL PLATE SIZE 3 FOR DURR ITEMIZED Abdulrehman 400019 73445-3 AIR TECHNIQUES USA SCANNER OR EQUIVALENT Algosaibi G.T.C -Orig-	
IMAGING DIGITAL PLATE SIZE 3 FOR DURR 72 4215200002700 SCANNER OR EQUIVALENT Services Ba -Orig-	
73 4215200002800 IMAGING DIGITAL PLATE SIZE 2 FOR DURR TEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER
74 4215200002900 IMAGING DIGITAL PLATE SIZE 1 FOR DURR ITEMIZED Abdulrehman 400019 73445-1 AIR TECHNIQUES USA Algosaibi G.T.C -Orig-	
Medical 74 4215200002900 IMAGING DIGITAL PLATE SIZE 1 FOR DURR ITEMIZED &Pharmaceutical 400323 2130-041-50 DÜRR DENTAL Japan Scanner Or EQUIVALENT Services Ba -Orig-	
75 4215200003000 IMAGING DIGITAL PLATE SIZE 4 FOR DURR ITEMIZED Abdulrehman 400019 73445-4 AIR TECHNIQUES USA Algosaibi G.T.C -Orig-	
IMAGING DIGITAL PLATE SIZE 4 FOR DURR 75 4215200003000 SCANNER OR EQUIVALENT Services Ba -Orig-	
76 4215200003100 IMAGING DIGITAL PLATE SIZE 4 FOR DIGORA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER
77 4215161600500 INTERPROXIMAL REDUCTION (IPR) GAUGE ITEMIZED LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig- LAYAN DIPR-07 LAYAN China	
78 4215270008800 ORTHO TONGUE TAMERS APPLIANCE ITEMIZED Medical Choice Est 400611 01.06.0001.4 Aditek Ortodontia Brazil Orig-	
NITI ORTHO FORM RECTANGULAR UPPER .016 X ITEMIZED Alturki Medical Group 400478 SE03161601 IMD China .016 UPPER -Orig-	

SN	NUPCO Code	Item Description	Equipment Group	Vendor Name	Vendor No	Catalog No	Manufacturer	COUNTRY	REASON OF CANCELLED
80	4215271824200	NITI ORTHO FORM RECTANGULAR LOWER .016 X .016 LOWER	ITEMIZED	Alturki Medical Group -Orig-	400478	SE03161602	IMD	China	
81	4215271824300	NITI ORTHO FORM RECT. UPPER .018 X .025 UPPER	ITEMIZED	Alturki Medical Group -Orig-	400478	SE03182501	IMD	China	
82	4215271824400	NITI ORTHO FORM RECTANGULAR LOWER .018 X .025 LOWER	ITEMIZED	Alturki Medical Group -Orig-	400478	SE03182502	IMD	China	
83	4215270008900	CLASS II CORRECTOR DEVICE X-SHORT 22MM LEFT (FATIGUE RESISTANT DEVICE)	ITEMIZED	Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-	400104	885-009	3M Unitek	USA	
84	4215270009000	CLASS II CORRECTOR DEVICE X-SHORT 22MM KIT (FATIGUE RESISTANT DEVICE)	ITEMIZED	Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-	400104	885-150	3M Unitek	USA	
85	4215270009100	CLASS II CORRECTOR SHORT DEVICE 25MM KIT (FATIGUE RESISTANT DEVICE)	ITEMIZED	Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-	400104	885-143	3M Unitek	USA	
86	4215270009200	CLASS II CORRECTOR SHORT DEVICE 25MM RIGHT (FATIGUE RESISTANT DEVICE)	ITEMIZED	Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-	400104	885-112	3M Unitek	USA	
87	4215270009300	CLASS II CORRECTOR MEDIUM DEVICE 29MM KIT (FATIGUE RESISTANT DEVICE)	ITEMIZED	Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-	400104	885-144	3M Unitek	USA	
88	4215270009400	CLASS II CORRECTOR MEDIUM DEVICE 29 MM RIGHT (FATIGUE RESISTANT DEVICE)	ITEMIZED	Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-	400104	885-114	3M Unitek	USA	
89	4215161203500	LATEX FREE LIP AND CHEEK DISPOSABLE RETRACTOR ASSORTED	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
90	4215245317500	LIGHT-CURED, RESIN-MODIFIED CALCIUM SILICATE FILLED LINER DESIGNED FOR USE IN DIRECT AND INDIRECT PULP CAPPING AND AS A PROTECTIVE LINER	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
91	4215200003200	DIGITAL X-RAY RVG SENSOR SIZE 0	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER
92	4215200003300	DIGITAL X-RAY RVG SENSOR SIZE 2	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER
93	4215200003400	DIGITAL X-RAY SENSOR DISPOSABLE SLEEVES SIZE 0	ITEMIZED	LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig-	400580	802-1408	LAYAN	China	
94	4215200003500	DIGITAL X-RAY SENSOR DISPOSABLE SLEEVES SIZE 2	ITEMIZED	LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig-	400580	802-1409RN	LAYAN	China	
95	4215247100200	LIGHT CURE COMPOSITE WETTING RESIN, SYRINGE	ITEMIZED	Medical Vision Est Orig-	400364	3059-1	ULTRADENT	USA	
96	4215250802600	NEEDLE 29 GAUGE, FLEXIBLE, STAINLESS STEEL, 25MM SIDEPORT TIP FOR CALCIUM HYDROXIDE PASTE APPLICATION	ITEMIZED	Medical Vision Est Orig-	400364	5114	ULTRADENT	USA	
97	4215245317600	FINISHING AND POLISHING COMPOSITE CURED URETHANE DIMETHACRYLATE RESIN - SHAPE POINTS	ITEMIZED	Asnan Medical Company -Orig-	400172	624065X	DENTSPLY	USA	

SN	NUPCO Code	Item Description	Equipment Group	Vendor Name	Vendor No	Catalog No	Manufacturer	COUNTRY	REASON OF CANCELLED
98	4215245317700	FINISHING AND POLISHING COMPOSITE CURED URETHANE DIMETHACRYLATE RESIN - SHAPE CUPS	ITEMIZED	Asnan Medical Company -Orig-	400172	624055X	DENTSPLY	USA	
99	4215245317800	FINISHING AND POLISHING COMPOSITE CURED URETHANE DIMETHACRYLATE RESIN - SHAPE DISCS	ITEMIZED	Asnan Medical Company -Orig-	400172	624045X	DENTSPLY	USA	
100	4215291700800	HIGH-VOLUME EVACUATORS MADE FROM A "SOFT-TOUCH" PLASTIC, UNIQUE SIDE VENTS AND "S"-CURVED EDGES ELIMINATE SOFT-TISSUE LOCK, DISPOSABLE	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER
101	4215280000800	BIOABSORBABLE DEHYDRATED BILAYER ACELLULAR HUMAN AMNION AND CHORION PLACENTAL MEMBRANE RETAINS 300+ ANTI- INFLAMMATORY AND REGULATORY PROTEINS, HYALURONIC ACID THAT PROVIDES PROTECTIVE BARRIER AND RESTORE HARD AND SOFT TISSUES, SIZE 16MM DISC	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHES TENDER'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS
102	4215280000900	LYOPHILIZED BIOABSORBABLE ACELLULAR HUMAN PLACENTAL EXTRACELLULAR MATRIX FLAKES CONTAINED COLLAGENS, FIBRONECTIC, LAMINI, ELASTIN, GLYCOSAMINOGLYCANS, HYALURONIC ACID, AND MATRIX BOUND REGULATORY PROTEINS THAT RESTORE HARD AND SOFT TISSUE, SIZE 250 CONTAINER	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHES TENDER'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS
103	4215270009500	CLASS II CORRECTOR FATIGUE RESISTANT DEVICE	ITEMIZED	Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-	400104	885-141	3M Unitek	USA	
103	4215270009500	CLASS II CORRECTOR FATIGUE RESISTANT DEVICE	ITEMIZED	AL-MADAR Co. for Medical Equipment - Orig-	401026	39-T10-5M	DYNAFLEX	USA	
104	4215260200000	COVER PLASTIC FOR RVG X - RAY SENSOR SZ 1 - 5/8 W 8 - 3/8 L	ITEMIZED	LAYAN MEDICAL COMPANY -Orig-	400580	802-1418	LAYAN	China	
105	4215150016100	VISTA SCAN DIGITAL FILM COVER SIZE 2	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER
106	4215271800000	ARCH PALATAL PREFORMED SZ 2	ITEMIZED	Commercial and Maintenance CoOrig	400278	728-006-00	Dentaurum	Germany	
107	4215245400100	CALCIUM - SILICATE BASED MATERIAL TO BE USED IN VARIOUS CLINICAL APPLICATIONS SUCH AS ROOT PERFORATIONS APEXIFICATION RESORPTIONS RETROGRADE FILLINGS PULP CAPPING PROCEDURES AND DENTINE REPLACEMENT	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER

SN	NUPCO Code	Item Description	Equipment Group	Vendor Name	Vendor No	Catalog No	Manufacturer	COUNTRY	REASON OF CANCELLED
108	4215160300300	LINER CAVITY CALCIUM HYDROXIDE DYCAL	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	DUPLICATED WITH OTHER TENDER
109	4215242503000	RESIN DENTURE ACRYLIC RELINE CHAIRSIDE HARD FLEXACRYL	ITEMIZED	AL-Mira Centre For Trading Co.Ltd -Orig-	400238	GC-346000	GC EUROPE N.V	Japan	
110	4215210300100	TRAY ADHESIVE MATERIAL DESIGNED TO ADHERE TO POLYVINYL SILOXANE IMPRESSION MATERIAL TO ACRYLIC TRAY	ITEMIZED	Masar Medical Co Orig-	400434	909394	DMG CHEMISCH- PHARMAZEUTISCHE FABRIK GMBH	Germany	
110	4215210300100	TRAY ADHESIVE MATERIAL DESIGNED TO ADHERE TO POLYVINYL SILOXANE IMPRESSION MATERIAL TO ACRYLIC TRAY	ITEMIZED	Medical Vision Est Orig-	400364	626155	DENTSPLY	USA	
111	4215150042200	GUTTA PERCHA POINT SUBJECTED TO A PATENTED PROCESS OF IMPREGNATING AND COATING WITH BIOCERAMIC NANOPARTICLES. STIFFER THAN NORMAL GUTTA PERCHA. SIZE 25 /. 06 TAPER	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
112	4215150042100	GUTTA PERCHA POINT SUBJECTED TO A PATENTED PROCESS OF IMPREGNATING AND COATING WITH BIOCERAMIC NANOPARTICLES. STIFFER THAN NORMAL GUTTA PERCHA. SIZE 25 /. 04 TAPER	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
113	4215150042000	GUTTA PERCHA POINT SUBJECTED TO A PATENTED PROCESS OF IMPREGNATING AND COATING WITH BIOCERAMIC NANOPARTICLES. STIFFER THAN NORMAL GUTTA PERCHA. SIZE 20 /. 06 TAPER	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
114	4215150041800	GUTTA PERCHA POINT SUBJECTED TO A PATENTED PROCESS OF IMPREGNATING AND COATING WITH BIOCERAMIC NANOPARTICLES. STIFFER THAN NORMAL GUTTA PERCHA. SIZE 20 /. 04 TAPER	ITEMIZED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	CANCELLED	NO BID MATCHED DESCRIPTION
115	4228150905500	STERILIZATION POUCH: 1. SELF SEALING WITH BLUE TINTED TRANSPARENT FILM FOR EASY DETECTION OF ANY TEARS CAUSED BY THE INSTRUMENTS, 2. EXTERNAL A ND INTERNAL INDICATOR, 3. MULTIPLE SEAL FOR MAXIMUM PROTECTION, 4. SIZE: 3.5 X 4 INCH, 1000 POUCH/BOX	ITEMIZED	Asnan Medical Company -Orig-	400172	YSP-090100	ANQING YIPAK PACKAGING MATERIAL CO., LTD	China	