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1 4220341004000
CARTRIDGES, FOR ACTIVATED CLOTTING TIME, DISPOSABLE. 

MACHINES TO BE PROVIDED FREE OF CHARGE TO EACH REQUESTED 
CENTER

EA ITEMIZED 400217
alshoumoukh trading for 

technical & -Orig-
57XX

HELENA LABORATORIES 
CORP.

USA

2 4220341114200
CATHETER, DIAGNOSTIC, NIH, WITH MARKER, ASSORTED SIZES AS 

PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
EA ITEMIZED 400369

UNITED MEDICAL 
INDUSTRIES CO. LTD. -

HNBXX-XX-XXX-P-4S-
NIH

Cook Incorporated USA

3 4220340304700
INTRODUCER SHEATH, RADIOPAQUE TIP, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, 

ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
PC ITEMIZED 400085

Gulf Medical CO. LTD. -
Orig-

CP-08403 CP-08503-A 
CP-08603-P CP-085

ARROW-Teleflex USA

3 4220340304700
INTRODUCER SHEATH, RADIOPAQUE TIP, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, 

ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
PC ITEMIZED 400019

Abdulrehman Algosaibi 
G.T.C -Orig-

401511M Cordis Cardinal Health Mexico

4 4220341013100

STENT POSITIONING SYSTEM, ENABLES MORE ACCURATE 
INTRAVASCULAR STENT PLACEMENT, OVERALL LENGTH 120-130CM, 

0.018IN NITINOL WIRE, DISTAL NITINOL GOLD-PLATED LEGS, 
COMPATIBLE WITH 6-8FR GUIDING CATHETER, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED NO BID MATCHES

5 4220343359600
CATHETER, DIAGNOSTIC ANGIOGRAPHIC, SHORT EXCHANGE AREA 

FOR THE WIRE (TIP ONLY), MULTI-TRACK OR EQUIVALENT, 
ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED NO BID MATCHES

6 4220344711000
BREAST TISSUE MARKER, WITH HYDROGEL PLUG, PRE-LOADED, 
PROVIDES LONG TERM UNMATCHED ULTRASOUND VISIBILITY

EA ITEMIZED 400982
Veins Medical Company 

L.T.D -Orig-
4010-02-XX-XX

MAMMOTOME DEVICOR 
MEDICAL PRODUCTS

USA

7 4220341013200
CATHETER DEVICE, FOR CHRONIC TOTAL OCCLUSION, TO CREATE 
INTRALUMINAL PLACEMENT, BRAIDED, 120-150 CM, DISPOSABLE, 

STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400019

Abdulrehman Algosaibi 
G.T.C -Orig-

OTB59120A Cordis Cardinal Health Mexico

8 4220341062800
CATHETER, DIAGNOSTIC, WOVEN, WITH END AND TWO SIDE HOLE, 

ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

9 4220341088900
DRAINAGE CATHETER BILIARY SET, RADIOPAQUE, INCLUDES 

GUIDEWIRE AND STIFFENING CANNULA, ASSORTED SIZE AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400007
Attieh Medico Co. Ltd. -

Orig-

755308040+651406000
/755310040+65140600

0/
Argon Medical Devices USA

9 4220341088900
DRAINAGE CATHETER BILIARY SET, RADIOPAQUE, INCLUDES 

GUIDEWIRE AND STIFFENING CANNULA, ASSORTED SIZE AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400456
Al Zaizaphon Medical Est 

-Orig-
CCL2-XXXXXXX URESIL USA

10 4220341089300

GASTROJEJUNOSTOMY SET, PERCUTANEOUS, INCLUDES: CATHETER 
10.2FR X 100 CM, SEEKING CATHETER 7FR X 110 CM, EXTRA STIFF 
GUIDEWIRE 0.038 IN X 260 CM, NEEDLE 18G X 9 CM, PEEL AWAY 

INTRODUCER, DILATOR, SUTURE ANCHOR SET, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400114
Al Madar Medical 

Services Company -Orig-
98437 AVANOS Mexico

11 4223160907000 GASTROJEJUNOSTOMY INTRODUCER KIT, ASSORTED SIZE PC ITEMIZED 400114
Al Madar Medical 

Services Company -Orig-
98438 AVANOS Mexico

12 4220341018200

GASTROSTOMY SET PERCUTANEOUS INCLUDES: GASTROSTOMY 
CATHETER 12 TO 14FR X 30 CM STIFF GUIDEWIRE 0.038IN X 145 CM 

NEEDLE 18G X 7 C M FEEDING CONNECTOR DILATOR CATHETER 
FIXATION DEVICE SUTURE ANCHOR SET SHOULD BE PROVIDED 

STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400114
Al Madar Medical 

Services Company -Orig-
98431 AVANOS Mexico

13 4227200601100 GASTROSTOMY INTRODUCER KIT, ASSORTED SIZE PC ITEMIZED 400114
Al Madar Medical 

Services Company -Orig-
98430 AVANOS Mexico

14 4220341012000

GUIDEWIRE, MICRO, 100% HYDROPHILIC COATING, POLYURETHANE 
COATING, NITINOL CORE, TAPERED ANGLED TIP, STIFF, 0.018IN, 

DISPOSABLE, STERILE, THE SPECIFIC GUIDEWIRE LENGTHS MUST BE 
DECIDED BY THE RECEIVING CENTER BEFORE DELIVERY

EA ITEMIZED 400104
Al-Jeel Medical & 

Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-
RF-PA18XX3M Terumo Japan
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15 4220342605300
GUIDEWIRE, PERIPHERAL INTERVENTION, WORKHORSE/FLOPPY, 

0.014IN, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, ASSORTED RANGE AND SIZES AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST

PC ITEMIZED 400019
Abdulrehman Algosaibi 

G.T.C -Orig-
507300S Cordis Cardinal Health Ireland

15 4220342605300
GUIDEWIRE, PERIPHERAL INTERVENTION, WORKHORSE/FLOPPY, 

0.014IN, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, ASSORTED RANGE AND SIZES AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST

PC ITEMIZED 400046
Medical Supplies & 

Services Co. Ltd -Orig-
20781XX Abbott Vascular USA

16 4220342605200
GUIDEWIRE, PERIPHERAL INTERVENTION, INTERMEDIATE TIP LOAD, 
0.014IN, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, ASSORTED RANGE AND SIZES AS PER 

HOSPITAL REQUEST
PC ITEMIZED 400272

Medtronic Saudi Arabia -
Orig-

NXXXXXX Medtronic USA

16 4220342605200
GUIDEWIRE, PERIPHERAL INTERVENTION, INTERMEDIATE TIP LOAD, 
0.014IN, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, ASSORTED RANGE AND SIZES AS PER 

HOSPITAL REQUEST
PC ITEMIZED 400019

Abdulrehman Algosaibi 
G.T.C -Orig-

527300E Cordis Cardinal Health Ireland

17 4220340401400
GUIDEWIRE, PERIPHERAL INTERVENTION, HIGH TIP LOAD FOR CTO 

CASES, 0.014IN, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, ASSORTED RANGE AND SIZES AS 
PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

EA ITEMIZED 400046
Medical Supplies & 

Services Co. Ltd -Orig-
10124XX Abbott Vascular USA

18 4220340440900
GUIDEWIRE, PERIPHERAL INTERVENTION, WORKHORSE/FLOPPY, 

0.018IN, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, ASSORTED RANGE AND SIZES AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST

EA ITEMIZED 400104
Al-Jeel Medical & 

Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-
RF-GX18XX3M Terumo Japan

18 4220340440900
GUIDEWIRE, PERIPHERAL INTERVENTION, WORKHORSE/FLOPPY, 

0.018IN, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, ASSORTED RANGE AND SIZES AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST

EA ITEMIZED 400272
Medtronic Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
NXXXXXX Medtronic USA

19 4220340434200
GUIDEWIRE, PERIPHERAL INTERVENTION, INTERMEDIATE TIP LOAD, 
0.018IN, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, ASSORTED RANGE AND SIZES AS PER 

HOSPITAL REQUEST
EA ITEMIZED 400272

Medtronic Saudi Arabia -
Orig-

NXXXXXX Medtronic USA

20 4220340418800
GUIDEWIRE, PERIPHERAL INTERVENTION, HIGH TIP LOAD FOR CTO 

CASES, 0.018IN, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, ASSORTED RANGE AND SIZES AS 
PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

21 4220341093300
INFUSION WIRE, MULTIPLE SIDE HOLES, 0.035IN, DISPOSABLE, 

STERILE, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

22 4220341090800
NEEDLE, BREAST LOCALIZATION, DOUBLE HOOK, FOR 

PREOPERATIVE MARKING, 20G TO 21G, ASSORTED LENGTH, 
DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400007
Attieh Medico Co. Ltd. -

Orig-
MRZ2006/MRZ2009/M

RZ2011
Sterylab S.R.L Italy

23 4214250403200
NEEDLE, COAXIAL, ASSORTED SIZES AND LENGTHS AS PER HOSPITAL 

REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400781 TART MEDICAL EST -Orig-

MCXS1415LX / 
MCXS1420LX / 

MCXS1615LX / M

ARGON MEDICAL 
DEVICES, INC.

USA

23 4214250403200
NEEDLE, COAXIAL, ASSORTED SIZES AND LENGTHS AS PER HOSPITAL 

REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400007

Attieh Medico Co. Ltd. -
Orig-

AGS1411/AGS1415/AG
S1611/AGS1615/AGS16

Sterylab S.R.L Italy

23 4214250403200
NEEDLE, COAXIAL, ASSORTED SIZES AND LENGTHS AS PER HOSPITAL 

REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400023

Arabian Trade House -
Orig-

101xxx Wellgo Germany

24 4220341019400

PERCUTANEOUS VASCULAR SHEATH SET, INTRODUCER SHEATH 
LENGTH: NOT LESS THAN 23CM, RADIOPAQUE TIP, ASSORTED SIZES 
5F -11F, SILICONE HEMOSTATIC VALVE, SIDE-PORT WITH SIDE-ARM 
AND 3 WAY-STOPCOCK, NON-TRAUMATIC DILATOR, DISPOSABLE, 

STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400019
Abdulrehman Algosaibi 

G.T.C -Orig-
401623M Cordis Cardinal Health Mexico

25 4220341092700

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 5 FR, TRIPLE LUMEN, 

NOT LESS THAN 55CM LENGTH, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60CM DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer 

& Company -Orig-
3385108QD BD-Bard Mexico
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26 4222150406000

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 6 FR, TRIPLE LUMEN, 

NOT LESS THAN 55CM LENGTH, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60CM DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

PC ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer 

& Company -Orig-
6396355 BD-Bard Mexico

26 4222150406000

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 6 FR, TRIPLE LUMEN, 

NOT LESS THAN 55CM LENGTH, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60CM DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

PC ITEMIZED 400023
Arabian Trade House -

Orig-
H965457420 Angiodynamics USA

27 4220341092400

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 5 FR, DUAL LUMEN, NOT 

LESS THAN 55CM LENGTH, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer 

& Company -Orig-
6295355 BD-Bard Mexico

27 4220341092400

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 5 FR, DUAL LUMEN, NOT 

LESS THAN 55CM LENGTH, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

EA ITEMIZED 400451
Farabi Trading 

Establishment -Orig-
MR82035201 MEDCOMP USA

28 4220341092900

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 3FR, SINGLE LUMEN, 

LENGTH NOT LESS THAN 55CM, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

EA ITEMIZED 400023
Arabian Trade House -

Orig-
H965458020 Angiodynamics USA

29 4220341025600
STENT, ESOPHAGEAL, COVERED, WITH REFLUX CONTROL VALVE, 

SELF-EXPANDABLE, LOW PROFILE, SINGLE-HANDED DELIVERY 
SYSTEM, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

EA ITEMIZED 400023
Arabian Trade House -

Orig-
ESAXXXXXX S&G South Korea

30 4220340700400

SYRINGE, HIGH PRESSURE, 1 ML CAPACITY, FIXED MALE LUER LOCK, 
BARREL MATERIAL: POLYCARBONATE, TIP MATERIAL: SILICONE, 
PLUNGER MATERIAL: ABS, VARIOUS COLORS AS PER HOSPITAL 

REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD

31 4220340700700

SYRINGE, HIGH PRESSURE, 3 ML CAPACITY, FIXED MALE LUER LOCK, 
BARREL MATERIAL: POLYCARBONATE, TIP MATERIAL: SILICONE, 
PLUNGER MATERIAL: ABS, VARIOUS COLORS AS PER HOSPITAL 

REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD

32 4220340701000

SYRINGE, HIGH PRESSURE, 5-6 ML CAPACITY, FIXED MALE LUER 
LOCK, BARREL MATERIAL: POLYCARBONATE, TIP MATERIAL: 

SILICONE, PLUNGER MATERIAL: ABS, VARIOUS COLORS AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD

33 4220340700500

SYRINGE, HIGH PRESSURE, 10 ML CAPACITY, FIXED MALE LUER 
LOCK, BARREL MATERIAL: POLYCARBONATE, TIP MATERIAL: 

SILICONE, PLUNGER MATERIAL: ABS, VARIOUS COLORS AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD
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34 4220340700600

SYRINGE, HIGH PRESSURE, 20 ML CAPACITY, FIXED MALE LUER 
LOCK, BARREL MATERIAL: POLYCARBONATE, TIP MATERIAL: 

SILICONE, PLUNGER MATERIAL: ABS, VARIOUS COLORS AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD

35 4220340700800

SYRINGE, HIGH PRESSURE, 30 ML CAPACITY, FIXED MALE LUER 
LOCK, BARREL MATERIAL: POLYCARBONATE, TIP MATERIAL: 

SILICONE, PLUNGER MATERIAL: ABS, VARIOUS COLORS AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD HOLD

36 4220341092600

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 5FR, SINGLE LUMEN, 

LENGTH NOT LESS THAN 55CM, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

EA ITEMIZED 400023
Arabian Trade House -

Orig-
H965458920 Angiodynamics USA

36 4220341092600

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 5FR, SINGLE LUMEN, 

LENGTH NOT LESS THAN 55CM, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

EA ITEMIZED 400451
Farabi Trading 

Establishment -Orig-
MR82035101 MEDCOMP USA

37 4220340559400
TRANSCATHETER CEREBRAL PROTECTION DEVICE, USED TO 
CAPTURE AND REMOVE THROMBUS AND DEBRIS IN TAVI 

PROCEDURE
EA ITEMIZED 401074

Boston Scientific Gulf 
Trading -Orig-

CMS15-10C BOSTON SCIENTIFIC Costa Rica

38 4214253200600
 PERICARDIOCENTESIS KIT, FOR PEDIATRIC, TO REMOVE FLUIDS 

FROM THE PERICARDIUM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE. 
PC ITEMIZED NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE

39 4220344710600
BONE NEEDLE PENETRATION SET, 12G, INCLUDING PENETRATION 
CANNULA AND STYLET, DRILL, AND DEPTH GAUGE, DISPOSABLE, 

STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400217

alshoumoukh trading for 
technical & -Orig-

12-1272 APRIOMED Sweden

40 4220344710700
BONE BIOPSY SET, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST, 

DISPOSABLE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400106

Mohammed Hammad Al-
Hammad Medical Co. -

VVJT0810,VVJT0815,VV
JT1110,VVJT1115,VVJT

VIGEO SRL Italy

41 4220341088600
DRAINAGE CONNECTION TUBE, WITH ONE WAY STOPCOCK, NOT 

LESS THAN 30 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400007

Attieh Medico Co. Ltd. -
Orig-

401013050 - 
404018030-401013025

Argon Medical Devices USA

42 4214250002500
VERTEBROPLASTY NEEDLE, USED TO INJECT CEMENT INTO THE 
VERTEBRAL BODY, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

PC ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED NO BID MATCHES

43 4229600641000
OCCLUSION BALLOON, FOR ABDOMINAL/THORACIC AORTA, POST 
STENT DILATATION, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

EA ITEMIZED 400299
Arabian Medical and 

Pharmaceutical Co. -Orig-
CODA-2-9.0-35-120-32 
& CODA-2-10.0-35-14

COOK MEDICAL USA

43 4229600641000
OCCLUSION BALLOON, FOR ABDOMINAL/THORACIC AORTA, POST 
STENT DILATATION, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

EA ITEMIZED 400398 Med surg Supplies -Orig- MOB37
W.L. GORE & ASSOCIATES 

INC., USA
USA

44 4220341099400
SHEATH, FOR ABDOMINAL AORTIC ANEURYSM STENTING, 

HYDROPHILIC COATED, GOOD SUPPORT WITH SMOOTH 
TRANSITION, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

45 4229440000100
ENDOVASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM, FOR NON-SURGICAL 

ARTERIOVENOUS FISTULAS CREATION, WITH ALL NEEDED 
ACCESSORIES.

PC ITEMIZED 400272
Medtronic Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
AMI6005 Medtronic

European 
Union
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46 4229440000200

ENDOVASCULAR AVF SET, INCLUDES: TWO DISPOSABLE 4F 
CATHETERS, VENOUS CATHETER WITH RADIO-FREQUENCY 

ELECTRODE, ARTERIAL CATHETER WITH CERAMIC BACKSTOP, EACH 
CATHETER IS MAGNETIZED FOR AIDED ALIGNMENT, MEDICAL DRIVE 
SYSTEM (INCLUDING THE GENERATOR, ARM BOARD, AND FIXATION 

STRAPS) TO EVERY ORDERING CENTER, STERILE

PC ITEMIZED 400023
Arabian Trade House -

Orig-
WQ* BD - BARD USA

47 4220341605400
PULSED FIELD ABLATION (PFA) CATHETER, WITH ALL NEEDED 

ACCESSORIES, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, ASSORTED SIZES AND SHAPES 
AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

PC ITEMIZED 400272
Medtronic Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
PSCC100 Medtronic USA

47 4220341605400
PULSED FIELD ABLATION (PFA) CATHETER, WITH ALL NEEDED 

ACCESSORIES, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, ASSORTED SIZES AND SHAPES 
AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

PC ITEMIZED 401074
Boston Scientific Gulf 

Trading -Orig-
41MXXX BOSTON SCIENTIFIC USA

48 4220350601600

CARDIAC CONTRACTILITY MODULATION SYSTEM, FOR HEART 
FAILURE PATIENTS, THE SYSTEM CONSISTS OF IMPLANTABLE PULSE 
GENERATOR AND CHARGER, THE SYSTEM HAS TO BE COMPATIBLE 

WITH CONVENTIONAL LEADS

EA ITEMIZED 400248
Arabian Medical 
Supplies Co -Orig-

10-B501-3-XX IMPULSE DYNAMICS USA

49 4220350203100
 MYOCARDIAL PACING LEAD, FOR LONG TERM VENTRICULAR 

PACING AND SENSING, BIPOLAR, SUTURELESS, ASSORTED SIZES AS 
PER HOSPITAL REQUEST 

PC ITEMIZED NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE

50 4229542704900
CATHETER SET, HYSTERO-SALPINGOGRAPHY BALLOON CATHETER, 
LATEX FREE, SMOOTH TIP, OPEN OR CLOSED TIP, ASSORTED SIZES 

AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
EA ITEMIZED 400081

SARABEEL COMMERCIAL 
EST. -Orig-

022728 OR 022726 MEDGYN USA USA

51 4220184300100
NIPPLE MARKER, USED TO IDENTIFY NIPPLE LOCATION DURING 
MAMMOGRAPHY, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, ASSORTED SIZES AND 

SHAPES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
PC ITEMIZED 400081

SARABEEL COMMERCIAL 
EST. -Orig-

1XX OR 6XX OR 7XX BEEKLEY MEDICAL USA

52 4222150405900

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 4FR, SINGLE LUMEN, 

LENGTH NOT LESS THAN 55CM, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

PC ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer 

& Company -Orig-
6194355 BD-Bard Mexico

52 4222150405900

PICC (PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL CATHETER), POWER 
INJECTABLE PICC WITH VALVE, UNCUFFED, 4FR, SINGLE LUMEN, 

LENGTH NOT LESS THAN 55CM, INCLUDES: COMPATIBLE PEEL AWAY 
SHEATH, 21-22 G NEEDLE, 0.018IN GUIDEWIRE, GUIDEWIRE LENGTH 

NOT LESS THAN 60 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, (NON-SILICONE 
MATERIAL)

PC ITEMIZED 400023
Arabian Trade House -

Orig-
H965458120 Angiodynamics USA

53 4229554100000
IMPLANTABLE PORT KIT, RADIO TRANSLUCENT, WITH ATTACHABLE 

POLYURETHANE CATHETER, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL 
REQUEST

PC ITEMIZED 400451
Farabi Trading 

Establishment -Orig-
MRCTI80041 MEDCOMP USA

53 4229554100000
IMPLANTABLE PORT KIT, RADIO TRANSLUCENT, WITH ATTACHABLE 

POLYURETHANE CATHETER, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL 
REQUEST

PC ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer 

& Company -Orig-
060XXXXCE BD-Bard Mexico

54 4229150000900
BONE BIOPSY NEEDLE, COAXIAL, CURVED, FOR VERTEBRAL BODY 

BIOPSY AND INFUSION, INTRODUCER NEEDLE SIZE 10G X 10-13 CM, 
STERILE

PC ITEMIZED 400456
Al Zaizaphon Medical Est 

-Orig-
DCBNS-13-19.0-C IZI MEDICAL USA

55 4229440300600
TRANSCATHETER BICAVAL VALVES SYSTEM, FOR TRICUSPID 

INSUFFICIENCY AND CAVAL REFLUX, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER 
HOSPITAL REQUEST

PC ITEMIZED 400236 ikar trading est -Orig- SVCXX / IVCXX
P&F PRODUCTS & 

FEATURES
Germany
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56 4220341114700
CORONARY ATHERECTOMY SYSTEM, COMPLETE KIT, DISPOSABLE, 

STERILE.
EA ITEMIZED 400236 ikar trading est -Orig- DBEC-125

CARDIOVASCULAR 
SYSTEM INC.

USA

56 4220341114700
CORONARY ATHERECTOMY SYSTEM, COMPLETE KIT, DISPOSABLE, 

STERILE.
EA ITEMIZED 401074

Boston Scientific Gulf 
Trading -Orig-

H74939300XXXXX BOSTON SCIENTIFIC Ireland

57 4229591214900
STENT, VENOUS, SELF-EXPANDABLE, OBLIQUE END, ASSORTED SIZES 

AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
PC ITEMIZED 400209

Saudi Sicli Medical 
Company -Orig-

8414-01-8080
OPTIMED MEDIZINISCHE 

INSTRUMENTE GMBH
Germany

58 4220344717900
STENT, PERIPHERAL, BALLOON MOUNTED, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER 

HOSPITAL REQUEST
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

59 4220341108800
GUIDEWIRE, DEFLECTING TIP, 100-180 CM, ASSORTED DIAMETERS 

AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED NO BID MATCHES

60 4220340815300
 PERCUTANEOUS VASCULAR SHEATH SET, 3-3.5 FR, WITH 

HEMOSTATIC VALVE, SIDE-PORT WITH SIDE-ARM AND 3 WAY-
STOPCOCK, NON-TRAUMATIC TIP, ASSORTED LENGTHS, STERILE 

PC ITEMIZED NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE

61 4220341090900
NEEDLE, BREAST LOCALIZATION, FOR PREOPERATIVE MARKING, 20G 

TO 21G, ASSORTED LENGTHS, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400007

Attieh Medico Co. Ltd. -
Orig-

MRN2106/MRN2109 Sterylab S.R.L Italy

61 4220341090900
NEEDLE, BREAST LOCALIZATION, FOR PREOPERATIVE MARKING, 20G 

TO 21G, ASSORTED LENGTHS, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400781 TART MEDICAL EST -Orig-

244050 / 244075 / 
244100 / 244125

ARGON MEDICAL 
DEVICES, INC.

USA

62 4220345300100
TRANSSEPTAL ACCESS SYSTEM, INTEGRATED TRANSSEPTAL 

DILATOR/NEEDLE, COMPATIBLE WITH ALL INDUSTRY-LEADING 
INTRODUCERS, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST

PC ITEMIZED 400272
Medtronic Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
90030X Medtronic USA

63 4220341605300
CATHETER, ENABLES PULSED FIELD AND RADIOFREQUENCY 

NAVIGATION, BIDIRECTIONAL, IRRIGATED, MULTI-ELECTRODES, 
HIGH DENSITY MAPPING AND ABLATION.

PC ITEMIZED 400272
Medtronic Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
AFR-00001 Medtronic USA

64 4229440300700
TRANSCATHETER PULMONARY VALVE SYSTEM, SELF-EXPANDABLE, 
TO TREAT SEVERE PULMONARY REGURGITATION, ASSORTED SIZES 

AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
PC ITEMIZED 400272

Medtronic Saudi Arabia -
Orig-

Harmony-XX Medtronic Mexico

65 4229591200100
STENT, PRE-MOUNTED, FOR AORTIC COARCTATION, ASSORTED 

BARE/COVERED AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

66 4220350800000  WIRE CUTTER, DISPOSABLE, STERILE EA ITEMIZED NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE

67 4220351000000
 ACCESSORY KIT, FOR TRANSVENOUS REMOVAL OF IMPLANTED 

LEADS, KIT INCLUDES COIL EXPANDER, AND PIN GAUGES, 
DISPOSABLE, STERILE 

PC ITEMIZED NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE

68 4220340581200
BALLOON, PTCA, SUPER HIGH PRESSURE, FOR HIGHLY RESISTANT 

CORONARY STENOSIS, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
PC ITEMIZED 400049

Dallah Health Care Co. -
Orig-

XX0-0XX-004 SIS MEDICAL Switzerland

69 4220340404300
GUIDEWIRE, TEFLON COATED, J-TIP OR STRAIGHT, 0.018 INCH, 

DISPOSABLE, STERILE, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

70 4220340300100

SHEATH INTRODUCER KIT, CONTAINS 10-11 CM LONG SHEATH, 
STERILE SLEEVE FOR USE WITH TPM OR SWAN-GANZ CATHETERS, J-

TIP 45 CM GUIDE WIRE 0.035 INCH, WITH DILATOR, THIN WALL 
PUNCTURE NEEDLE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER 

HOSPITAL REQUEST

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED
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71 4220344401700

PERCUTANEOUS SHEATH INTRODUCER SET, 9-14 FR, 11-30 CM 
LONG, WITH COMPETENT VALVE THAT PREVENT BACK BLEED EVEN 

IF SMALLER FRENCH CATHETER IS INSERTED, 3 WAYS STOPCOCK 
SIDE ARM, J-TIP 45 CM GUIDE WIRE 0.035 INCH, WITH DILATOR, 

THIN WALL PUNCTURE NEEDLE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED NO BID MATCHES

72 4220342800100
VALVE, HEMOSTATIC, 2 - WAYS FOR PTCA, INNER LUMEN DIAMETER 

> 3 MM, WITH TORQUE DEVICE AND INTRODUCER NEEDLE, 
DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

73 4220342800200
 VALVE, HEMOSTATIC, 3 - WAYS FOR PTCA, INNER LUMEN 

DIAMETER > 3 MM, WITH TORQUE DEVICE AND INTRODUCER 
NEEDLE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE             

EA ITEMIZED NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE

74 4214251300600
PUNCTURE NEEDLE, SHORT BEVEL, WIDE INTERNAL DIAMETER, 
SELDINGER TECHNIQUE, 18GA X 6-7 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE.

EA ITEMIZED 400369
UNITED MEDICAL 

INDUSTRIES CO. LTD. -
Orig-

SDN-18-7.0 Cook Incorporated USA

75 4220340702300
INJECTOR SYRINGE, ANGIOGRAPHIC, 150 ML WITH ASPIRATION 

TUBE, COMPATIBLE WITH MEDRAD MARK V. PROVIS OR 
EQUIVALENT, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

PC ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHES 

TENDER'S TERMS AND 
CONDITIONS

76 4220343321400

CORONARY CATHETER, FOR CTO CROSSING, TO DELIVER A 
GUIDEWIRE VIA TRUE LUMEN OR SUBINTIMAL PATHWAYS, 

HYDROPHILIC COATED, MULTI-WIRE COILED SHAFT, FAST SPINNING, 
0.014 INCH GUIDEWIRE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 401074
Boston Scientific Gulf 

Trading -Orig-
H749M2000B0 BOSTON SCIENTIFIC USA

77 4220344000700
 MICRO DILATATION CATHETER, HYDROPHILIC COATED, KINK 

RESISTANT, 150-170 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE 
PC ITEMIZED NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE

78 4220340201800

CORONARY SINUS CATHETER, DIAGNOSTIC, 5 FR, 1 MM TIP 
ELECTRODE, FIXED OR DEFLECTED TIP, LENGTH 60 CM, SUFFICIENT 

CONNECTORS MUST BE SUPPLIED FOC FOR EVERY CENTER, 
DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED NO BID MATCHES

79 4220341601100

3D MAPPING AF KIT INCLUDING: 1) NAVIGATION IRRIGATED 
CATHETER, 3.5 TIP ELECTRODE, 8 FR. SPACING 2-5-2. LENGTH: 

115CM. UNI-DIRECTIONAL & BI- DIRECTIONAL. ASSORTED CURVES 
AND COLORS. 2) 3D MAPPING PATCH. 3) CIRCULAR 3D MAPPING 

CATHETER, 7 FR, 12& 22 POLES. LENGTH 115CM, DEFLECTABLE TIP, 
15-25 TIP ELECTRODE. SPACING: 2-6-2 & 8MM. (TYPES WILL BE 

SPECIFIED BY END USER UPON DELIVERY, ENOUGH CONNECTORS 
COMPATIBLE WITH CATHETER IN EVERY CASE MUST BE PROVIDED 

FREE OF CHARGE), DISPOSABLE, STERILE.

PC ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED NO BID MATCHES

80 4220350000700

IMPLANTABLE PACEMAKER, WITH BLUETOOTH/WIRELESS 
TECHNOLOGY, SINGLE PACEMAKER; 1-MAXIMUM BATTERY LIFE 

REQUIRED; 2- PROGRAMMERS /SOFTWARE UPGRADE AND ENOUGH 
PRINTING PAPERS MUST BE PROVIDED FREE OF CHARGE TO ALL 

CENTERS; 3- TECHNICAL AND EDUCATIONAL SUPPORT SHOULD BE 
PROVIDED TO THE HOSPITAL STAFF IN ALL CENTERS WITH EXPERT 

TEAM (CERTIFIED); 4- COMPLETE SYSTEM WITH (RA AND RV LEADS, 
INTRODUCER SHEATHS AND SURGICAL CABLES); 5-FULLY MRI 

COMPATIBLE

PC ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED
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81 4220350000600

IMPLANTABLE PACEMAKER, WITH BLUETOOTH/WIRELESS 
TECHNOLOGY, DUAL PACEMAKER; 1-MAXIMUM BATTERY LIFE 

REQUIRED; 2- PROGRAMMERS /SOFTWARE UPGRADE AND ENOUGH 
PRINTING PAPERS MUST BE PROVIDED FREE OF CHARGE TO ALL 

CENTERS; 3- TECHNICAL AND EDUCATIONAL SUPPORT SHOULD BE 
PROVIDED TO THE HOSPITAL STAFF IN ALL CENTERS WITH EXPERT 

TEAM (CERTIFIED); 4- COMPLETE SYSTEM WITH (RA AND RV LEADS, 
INTRODUCER SHEATHS AND SURGICAL CABLES); 5-FULLY MRI 

COMPATIBLE

PC ITEMIZED 400282
Wateen Medical Co. -

Orig-
407153 BIOTRONIK Germany

81 4220350000600

IMPLANTABLE PACEMAKER, WITH BLUETOOTH/WIRELESS 
TECHNOLOGY, DUAL PACEMAKER; 1-MAXIMUM BATTERY LIFE 

REQUIRED; 2- PROGRAMMERS /SOFTWARE UPGRADE AND ENOUGH 
PRINTING PAPERS MUST BE PROVIDED FREE OF CHARGE TO ALL 

CENTERS; 3- TECHNICAL AND EDUCATIONAL SUPPORT SHOULD BE 
PROVIDED TO THE HOSPITAL STAFF IN ALL CENTERS WITH EXPERT 

TEAM (CERTIFIED); 4- COMPLETE SYSTEM WITH (RA AND RV LEADS, 
INTRODUCER SHEATHS AND SURGICAL CABLES); 5-FULLY MRI 

COMPATIBLE

PC ITEMIZED 400272
Medtronic Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
W3DR01 Medtronic USA

82 4220341089500

CATHETER FIXATION DEVICE, CUTANEOUS, 6 - 24 FR NEEDLELESS 
ROTATIONAL CATHETER SECUREMENT DEVICE FOR PERCUTANEOUS 

CATHETERS, ANTI - MIGRATION, PREV ENTS MOVEMENT AND 
ACCIDENTAL REMOVAL OF THE CATHETER, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400381 First Medical Co. -Orig- 51250B Bioderm, Inc. USA
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