TENDER NO.: NPT0029-23
TENDER NAME: SURGICAL CONSUMABLES SUPPLEMENTARY TENDER

PRELIMINARY RESULT

G
NUPCO Code Item Description uom It;r:;:e{:i Quantity Vendor No Vendor Name Manufacturer Catalog No NUPCO REMARK
CATHETER, CENTRAL VENOUS CATHETER KIT, CONTENTS; 2.7
FR EXTERNAL CATHETER SEGMENT, SINGLE LUMEN, | CANCELLE NO BID MATCHED
1 | 4231150200100 | GUIDEWIRE, INTRODUCER, DILATOR, TUNNELER, SILICONE |~ """ | CANCELLED o |cAnceLLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED  |WITH THE REQUIRED
ADHESIVE, END CAP, SYRINGE 3ML, NEEDLE BLUNT 18G X 25 SPECIFICATIONS
MM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
CATHETER, CENTRAL VENOUS CATHETER KIT, CONTENTS; 4.2
FR EXTERNAL CATHETER SEGMENT, SINGLE LUMEN, Farouk Maamon
2 | 4231150200300 | GUIDEWIRE, INTRODUCER, DILATOR, TUNNELER, SILICONE |  EA ITEMIZED 460 400038 | Tamer & Company - Bard 0600520CE Mexico
ADHESIVE, END CAP, SYRINGE 3ML, NEEDLE BLUNT 18G X 25 Orig-
MM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
SET, CATHETER, THERAPY, PERIPHERALLY INSERTED CENTRAL
3 | 4222150403600 |CATHETER (PICCLINE), 6 FR, DOUBLE LUMEN, 60 CM LENGTH,| ITEMIZED 1020 400023 |Arabian TradeHouse-| o onbyNAMICS | M001456670 USA
PEEL AWAY SHEATH 7 FR, 21 G NEEDLE, 0.018 INCH Orig-
GUIDEWIRE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
Farouk Maamon
CATHETER, KIT, CHEMOTHERAPY, FOR PEDIATRIC, 6 FR WITH ‘
4 | 4214320300400 | o 0% SILICONE. MRI COMPATIBLE, STERILE | E° ITEMIZED 358 400038 | Tamer %Ecg)mpany ; Bard 0605640CE Mexico
CATHETER, KIT, CHEMOTHERAPY, VENOUS ACCESS PORT orofessional Medical
5 | 4214330101300 | SYSTEM, 8.5 FR, WITH ATTACHED PORT, SILICONE, MRI EA MEMIZED | 1212 | a4ooas2 | [IUERRT ECE BBRAUN 04430395 Germany
COMPATIBLE, STERILE P [P
CATHETER, KIT, CHEMOTHERAPY, VENOUS ACCESS PORT orofessional Medical
6 | 4214330101400 | SYSTEM, FOR PEDIATRIC, 4.5 FR, WITH ATTACHED PORT, EA ITEMIZED 650 400492 | [0 EON e BBRAUN 04433742 Germany
POLYURETHANE, MRI COMPATIBLE, STERILE P p-orie
NO BID MATCHED
CONTAINER FOR SURGICAL SPECIMEN 10 LITER WITH SEALED | CANCELL CANCELLE
7 | 4110412600200 AP WHITE DISPOSABLE NON-STERILE to | CANCELLED o |cAncELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED  |WITH THE REQUIRED
SPECIFICATIONS
o | 4110411801900 | CONTAINER, FOR SURGICAL SPECIMEN, 350-500 ML, PUSH | TEMIZED % 400150 Saudi Mais For | Saudi Mais Co.for 760.0500C soudi Arabia
AND TURN CAP, TRANSPARENT, DISPOSABLE, NON-STERILE Medical Products -Orig| Medical Products
o | 4110411802400 | CONTAINER, FOR SURGICAL SPECIMEN, 500 ML, PUSHAND | cemizen | 11375 | 400190 Saudi Mais For | Saudi Mais Co.for 260.500M soudi Arabia
TURN CAP, NON-TRANSPARENT, DISPOSABLE, NON-STERILE Medical Products -Orig| Medical Products
Mohammed Hammad
10 | 4229541505200 |COVER MINIC-ARM FLUOROSCOPY CLEAR SHOULD COVER C-| - ITEMIZED | 1620 | 400106 | Al-Hammad Medical ECOLAB 8888MEU Dominican Rep.
SHAPE STERILE A
Co. -Orig-
CUSTOM PACK BIOPSY PROCEDURE; 1 TRAY, 3 SYRINGE
DIFFERENT SIZES, 2 NEEDLES 20G - 24G, SCALPEL BLADE, 2 Arabian Medical
11 | 4229421100500 | SPECIMEN VIALS, 6 MICROSCOPIC SLIDES, 2 SPONGE STICKS, | PC ITEMIZED | 7755 | 400273 |Products Manufactur - ENAYAH CPT-06706-094 | Saudi Arabia
4 GAUZE PADS, 2 TOWELS, 1 ADHESIVE FENESTRATED DRAPE, Orig-
DRESSING 5 X 5 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
DRAIN, PENROSE, LATEX RUBBER, RADIOPAQUE, 0.75 X 18 | CANCELL CANCELLE
12 | 4229545303700 INCH, DISPOSABLE, STERILE tp | CANCELLED o |cAnceLLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED
DRAIN, PENROSE, LATEX RUBBER, RADIOPAQUE, 1 X 18 INCH, Saudi Mais For Saudi Mais Co.for o
13 | 4229545303800 EA ITEMIZED 290 400190 056-2518 Saudi Arab
DISPOSABLE, STERILE Medical Products -Orig| Medical Products audi Arabla
14 | 4213170114100 | DRAPE SURGICALINCISE DRAPE ANTIMICROBIAL ADHESIVE | memizZED | 13634 | acors | AMeel Medical & N c651E7 Ush
SIZE: 60 X 85 CM (+/- 5 CM) STERILE Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-
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DRAPE, CARDIO VASCULAR, ALONG WITH PLASTIC POCKETS . . .
Universal Trading & Anhui MedPurest .
15 4213170106000 FROM RIGHT AND LEFT SIDE, 77 X 133 INCH (+/-10 INCH), EA ITEMIZED 1000 400544 k . MDCD-1037 China
I.T. Co. -Orig- Medical Technology
POCKETS LENGTH 100 -130 INCH, STERILE, DISPOSABLE
DRAPE, CARDIO VASCULAR, ALONG WITH PLASTIC POCKETS Company AWAFI AL- | ANHUI MEDPUREST
15 4213170106000 FROM RIGHT AND LEFT SIDE, 77 X 133 INCH (+/-10 INCH), EA ITEMIZED 1000 400574 SALAMA Commerical MEDICAL MDCD-1050 China
POCKETS LENGTH 100 -130 INCH, STERILE, DISPOSABLE Limit -Orig- TECHNOLOGY
DRAPE, FLUID MANAGEMENT WARMER DRAPE, TO MEASURE
THE FLOW IN / OUT, DRAPE SIZE 142 CM X 157 CM (+ / - 10 Mohammed Hammad
16 4213170120800 |[CM), IT SHOULD BE COMPATIBLE WITH HOSPITAL MACHINES, EA ITEMIZED 50000 400106 Al-Hammad Medical ECOLAB CTD200 Dominican Rep.
(ONE MACHINE FREE OF CHARGE WITH EVERY 240 EACH), Co. -Orig-
SINGLE USE, STERILE
17 4229541511700 DRAPE, MICROSCOPE, FOR OPMI, 137 X 381 CM, CANCELL CANCELLED CANCELLE CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED
DISPOSABLE, STERILE ED D
DRAPE, STOCKINETTE EXTREMITY, VOLUME LARGE 32 X 120 Company AWAFI AL- | ANHUI MEDPUREST
18 4213170120500 CM (+/-5 CM), IMPERVIOUS, WITH PLASTIC COVERING, EA ITEMIZED 900 400574 SALAMA Commerical MEDICAL MDSD-1041 China
DISPOSABLE, STERILE Limit -Orig- TECHNOLOGY
DRAPE, STOCKINETTE EXTREMITY, VOLUME LARGE 32 X 120 Farouk Maamon
18 4213170120500 CM (+/-5 CM), IMPERVIOUS, WITH PLASTIC COVERING, EA ITEMIZED 900 400038 Tamer & Company - Molnlycke 611205 Thailand
DISPOSABLE, STERILE Orig-
DRAPE, STOCKINETTE EXTREMITY, VOLUME MEDIUM 22 X 75 Farouk Maamon
19 4213210300200 CM (+/-5 CM), IMPERVIOUS, WITH PLASTIC COVERING, EA ITEMIZED 1800 400038 Tamer & Company - Molnlycke 611105 Thailand
DISPOSABLE, STERILE Orig-
DRAPE, STOCKINETTE EXTREMITY, VOLUME MEDIUM 22 X 75 Company AWAFI AL- | ANHUI MEDPUREST
19 4213210300200 CM (+/-5 CM), IMPERVIOUS, WITH PLASTIC COVERING, EA ITEMIZED 1800 400574 SALAMA Commerical MEDICAL MEDE-1042 China
DISPOSABLE, STERILE Limit -Orig- TECHNOLOGY
DRAPE, SURGICAL, U SHAPE (SPLIT SHEET), PLASTIC, Company AWAFI AL- | ANHUI MEDPUREST
20 4213210300300 TRANSPARENT, WITH ADHESIVE AROUND SLOT, 100-120 X EA ITEMIZED 7660 400574 SALAMA Commerical MEDICAL MDSD-1035 China
150-180 CM, STERILE Limit -Orig- TECHNOLOGY
DRAPE, SURGICAL, U SHAPE (SPLIT SHEET), PLASTIC, Arabian Medical
20 4213210300300 TRANSPARENT, WITH ADHESIVE AROUND SLOT, 100-120 X EA ITEMIZED 7660 400273 | Products Manufactur - ENAYAH 89331-OM Saudi Arabia
150-180 CM, STERILE Orig-
. . ALWEQAYA FOR
271 4213170120900 DRAPE, UTILITY, SURGICAL, PLASTIC, TRANSPARENT, 40- 45 EA ITEMIZED 45000 200330 Medlf:al Solutions And SPECIALIZED IMWMCDR/07- EETE
CM X 30 - 34 CM, FLUID RESIST, STERILE Services Comp -Orig- UTD1
PHARMACEUTICAL
DRAPE, VERTICAL ISOLATION, TRANSPARENT PLASTIC Arabian Medical
22 4213170105200 POLYETHYLENE FILM 330 X 240 CM (+/-10CM), INCISE AREA EA ITEMIZED 750 400273 |Products Manufactur - ENAYAH 89651-01P Saudi Arabia
30 X 40 CM, STERILE, DISPOSABLE Orig-
DRAPE, VERTICAL ISOLATION, TRANSPARENT PLASTIC Usivaree Tt 2 Anhui MedPurest
22 4213170105200 POLYETHYLENE FILM 330 X 240 CM (+/-10CM), INCISE AREA EA ITEMIZED 750 400544 . . MDSD-1046 China
I.T. Co. -Orig- Medical Technology
30 X 40 CM, STERILE, DISPOSABLE
. MEGADYNE
23 | 4214380500000 |E-ECTRODE BALL, COATED PTFE, FOR COAGULATION, ROUND| ITEMIZED 200 400308 | Medsuresupplies- |\ ol prODUCT, 0015 USA
TIP, SIZE 2 INCH, DISPOSABLE, STERILE Orig- INC.
ELECTROSURGERY BIPOLAR FORCEPS HIGHLY POLISHED TIPS,
LIGHT CLOSING FORCE, WELL BALANCED AND NYLON
2 4229551306500 COATING RESIST ABRASION, 0.4-1MMTIP X 8 - 11 CM, EA ITEMIZED 2666 400398 Med surg §upplles— BOWA-electronic 605-020 (e
STERILE (UNIVERSAL PLUG TO FIT ALL TYPES OF Orig- GmbH & Co. KG.
ELECTROSURGERY MACHINES MUST BE PROVIDED FOC
WHENEVER NECESSARY)
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FLUID WARMING SYSTEM, INCLUDE BASIN WITH DRAPE, 6 - 8 Mohammed Hammad
25 4222170301000 LITERS, IT SHOULD BE COMPATIBLE WITH HOSPITAL KIT ITEMIZED 35000 400106 Al-Hammad Medical ECOLAB ITB100 USA
MACHINES, (ONE MACHINE FREE OF CHARGE WITH EVERY Co. -Orig-
200 KIT), SINGLE USE, STERILE
GLOVES SURGICAL, MOISTURIZER, LATEX, NON - POWDERED, Al-Jeel Medical &
26 4213220513100 SIZE: 6.0 INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN INNER PACK PAA ITEMIZED 200000 400104 Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- Ansell 330049060 Malaysia
DISPOSABLE, STERILE
GLOVES SURGICAL, MOISTURIZER, LATEX, NON - POWDERED, Al-Jeel Medical &
27 4213220513200 SIZE: 6.5 INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN INNER PACK PAA ITEMIZED 800000 400104 Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- Ansell 330049065 Malaysia
DISPOSABLE, STERILE
GLOVES SURGICAL, MOISTURIZER, LATEX, NON - POWDERED, Al-Jeel Medical &
28 4213220513300 SIZE: 7.0 INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN INNER PACK PAA ITEMIZED 800000 400104 Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- Ansell 330049070 Malaysia
DISPOSABLE, STERILE
GLOVES SURGICAL, MOISTURIZER, LATEX, NON - POWDERED, Al-Jeel Medical &
29 4213220513400 SIZE: 7.5 INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN INNER PACK PAA ITEMIZED 800000 400104 Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- Ansell 330049075 Malaysia
DISPOSABLE, STERILE
GLOVES SURGICAL, MOISTURIZER, LATEX, NON - POWDERED, Al-Jeel Medical &
30 4213220513500 SIZE: 8.0 INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN INNER PACK PAA ITEMIZED 500000 400104 Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- Ansell 330049080 Malaysia
DISPOSABLE, STERILE
GLOVES SURGICAL, MOISTURIZER, LATEX, NON - POWDERED, Al-Jeel Medical &
31 4213220513600 SIZE: 8.5 INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN INNER PACK PAA ITEMIZED 100000 400104 Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- Ansell 330049085 Malaysia
DISPOSABLE, STERILE
HANDPIECE, MALLEABLE BEAM, SINGLE FUNCTION, 15.2 CM Cure Development
32 4229514330000 [ X 3M CORD, COMPATIBLE WITH ARGEON MACHINE, STERILE, EA ITEMIZED 1000 400062 ; . Conmed 134006 USA
International Ltd. -Orig
DISPOSABLE
HANDPIECE, MALLEABLE BEAM, SINGLE FUNCTION, 7.6 CM X Cure Development
33 4229514330100 | 3M CORD, COMPATIBLE WITH ARGEON MACHINE, STERILE, EA ITEMIZED 100 400062 _ . Conmed 134003 USA
International Ltd. -Orig
DISPOSABLE
HEMOSTASIS, HEMOSTATIC MATRIX PLUS, FLEX TIP, BOVINE- L .
34 4229610007400 | DERIVED GELATIN MATRIX AND HUMAN THROMBIN, 10 ML, EA ITEMIZED 60 400022 _ BAXTER 1503354 Austria
Supply Company -Orig
STERILE
HEMOSTATIC, ABSORBABLE, OXIDIZED CELLULOSE -NON- BARAKAT
35 4231160701800 REGENERATED-, LIGHT RETICULUM, SIZE: 5 X 35 CM (+/- 1 EA ITEMIZED 6100 400788 [ALDAMMAM TRADING| SYNTHESIA A.S H-T535 Czech Republic
CM), STERILE Co Ltd -Orig-
HEMOSTATIC, ABSORBABLE, OXIDIZED CELLULOSE -NON- Universal Trading &
35 4231160701800 REGENERATED-, LIGHT RETICULUM, SIZE: 5 X 35 CM (+/- 1 EA ITEMIZED 6100 400544 IT. Co. -Orig- BIOSTER 10226 Czech Republic
CM), STERILE
HEMOSTATIC, ABSORBABLE, OXIDIZED CELLULOSE -NON- BARAKAT
36 4229552512900 | REGENERATED-, MULTILAYER TRIUM, FIBRILLAR ADVANCED EA ITEMIZED 200 400788 [ALDAMMAM TRADING| SYNTHESIA A.S F1010 Czech Republic
MATERIAL, SIZE: 10 X 10 CM (+/- 1 CM), STERILE Co Ltd -Orig-
HEMOSTATIC, POWDER, CONSISTING OF HYDROGEN . | ding &
37 | 4231160703800 | CALCIUM SALT, OXIDIZED NON-REGENERATED CELLULOSE, | EA ITEMIZED 200 400544 U"'I‘ﬁ_rscaoigri;g BIOSTER 60114 Czech Republic
SIZE: 3G, STERILE
MECHANICAL CLOSED LOOP FILTRATION PROCESSING No
38 4216170000100 SYSTEM HARVEST AND FILTRATE 500 MACRON OF Quotatio NO_ No. No. No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
AUTOLOGOUS MICRO-FRAGMENTED ADIPOSE TISSUE, 60ML, n Quotation | Quotation| Quotation
KIT, STERILE
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39 4229552513000

Item Description

MESH, TISSUE REINFORCEMENT WITH UNIQUE
BIOSYNTHETIC WEB SCAFFOLD FOR INTRAPERITONEAL
HIATUS, HERNIA RECONSTRUCTION MADE OF 67%
POLYGLYCOLIC ACID (PGA): 33% TRIMETHYLENECARBONATE
(TMC) 1MM THICKNESS, COLLAGEN REPLACEMENT RATIO 1:1
SIZE 20 CM X 20 CM CUSTOMIZED SEMI CIRCULAR DESIGN,
STERILE, DISPOSABLE

EA

Group /
Itemized

ITEMIZED

Quantity Vendor No

30 400398

Vendor Name

Med surg Supplies -
Orig-

Manufacturer

W.L. Gore &
Associates Inc.

Catalog No

FS2020E

USA

PRELIMINARY RESULT

NUPCO REMARK

40 4229552513100

MESH, TISSUE REINFORCEMENT WITH UNIQUE
BIOSYNTHETIC WEB SCAFFOLD FOR INTRAPERITONEAL
HIATUS, HERNIA RECONSTRUCTION MADE OF 67%
POLYGLYCOLIC ACID (PGA): 33% TRIMETHYLENECARBONATE
(TMC) 1IMM THICKNESS, COLLAGEN REPLACEMENT RATIO 1:1
SIZE 20 CM X 30 CM CUSTOMIZED SEMI CIRCULAR DESIGN,
STERILE, DISPOSABLE

EA

ITEMIZED

30 400398

Med surg Supplies -
Orig-

W.L. Gore &
Associates Inc.

FS2030E

USA

41 4214380500100

NEEDLE ELECTRODE, PTFE COATED, SHARP TIP, HEAD MICRO
CUTTING FOR SPECIFIC USE, MODIFIED WITH INSULATED
COVER, SIZE 15 CM - 17 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

1300 400398

Med surg Supplies -
Orig-

MEGADYNE
MEDICAL PRODUCT,
INC.

0016M

USA

42 4219181000600

PAD, DEBLADE, SHARP, FOAM DOUBLE COATED ADHESIVE
TAPE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

CANCELL
ED

CANCELLED

CANCELLE

D CANCELLED

CANCELLED

CANCELLED

CANCELLED

CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED
WITH THE REQUIRED
SPECIFICATIONS

43 4229310719300

PANNICULUS RETRACTOR DEVICE USED FOR RELIABLE
RETRACTION OF THE PANNICULUS DURING SURGICAL
PROCEDURE WHICH WILL RETRACT AND HOLD THE
PANNICULUS FOR THE DURATION OF THE OPERATION
WITHOUT THE NEED FOR TAPES OR CLAMPS DISPOSABLE
STERILE

PC

ITEMIZED

250 400723

MEDICAL
INNOVATIONS
TRADING COMPANY -
Orig-

CLINICAL
INNOVATIONS LLC

PRS-1030

USA

44 4220341070500

PLEURAL AND PERITONEAL CATHETER INSERTION SET,
INCLUDES 1 X SILICONE CATHETER 16 FR X 40-45 CM WITH
METAL TUNNELLER, 1 X 18G GUIDEWIRE INSERTION NEEDLE,
1 X J-TIP GUIDEWIRE, 1 X SHEATH/DILATOR, 1 PAIR OF
GLOVES ( REGULAR SIZE), 1 X SCALPEL, 2 X SYRINGE, 1 X
FENESTRATED DRAPE, 2 X SQUARE DRAPE, 3 X SAFETY
NEEDLE, 8 - 10 GAUZE SWAB, 1 X NEEDLEVISE SHARPS
DEVICE, 1 X NEEDLE DRIVER, 1 X GALLIPOT, 2 X SPONGE
SWABS, 1 X DRAINAGE LINE, 1 X VALVE CAP, 1 X TUNNELLING
FORCEPS, 1 X FOAM CATHETER PAD, 1 X CLEAR-FILM
DRESSING, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

800 400511

Modern Quality
TradingEst -Orig-

OTHERS_ROCKET
MEDICAL

R54400-16-MT

United Kingdom

44 4220341070500

PLEURAL AND PERITONEAL CATHETER INSERTION SET,
INCLUDES 1 X SILICONE CATHETER 16 FR X 40-45 CM WITH
METAL TUNNELLER, 1 X 18G GUIDEWIRE INSERTION NEEDLE,
1 X J-TIP GUIDEWIRE, 1 X SHEATH/DILATOR, 1 PAIR OF
GLOVES ( REGULAR SIZE), 1 X SCALPEL, 2 X SYRINGE, 1 X
FENESTRATED DRAPE, 2 X SQUARE DRAPE, 3 X SAFETY
NEEDLE, 8 - 10 GAUZE SWAB, 1 X NEEDLEVISE SHARPS
DEVICE, 1 X NEEDLE DRIVER, 1 X GALLIPOT, 2 X SPONGE
SWABS, 1 X DRAINAGE LINE, 1 X VALVE CAP, 1 X TUNNELLING
FORCEPS, 1 X FOAM CATHETER PAD, 1 X CLEAR-FILM
DRESSING, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

800 400023

Arabian Trade House -
Orig-

BD

50-7050 & 50-
9050

USA
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. . ALWEQAYA FOR
45 | 4231210801200 | POUCH FLUID COLLECTION TRIANGLE, WITH SUCTION PORT | - TEMIZED | 4021 | 4oozzo |Medicdl SolutionsAnd] oo aen | iIMwMCDR/07-PO1 Egypt
60 X 60 CM (+/- 10 CM), STERILE Services Comp -Orig-
PHARMACEUTICAL
POUCH, FLUID COLLECTION TRIANGLE, WITH SUCTION PORT Arabian Medical
45 4231210401200 ! 60 X 60 CM (+/- 10 CM),'STERILE PC ITEMIZED 4021 400273 | Products Mfanufactur - ENAYAH E1003-48 Saudi Arabia
Orig-
No
46 4229633400500 PROCTOSCOPE, LARGE, WITH LIGHT, DISPOSABLE, NON- Quotatio No' NOA No' No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
STERILE n Quotation |Quotation| Quotation
Med surg Supplies - .
47 4229633400000 PROCTOSCOPE, LARGE, WITH LIGHT, DISPOSABLE, STERILE PC ITEMIZED 7284 400398 Orig- OBP Medical. C060100 USA
RETRACTOR INTEGRATED CORDLESS LED LIGHT SOURCE LED
LIGHT SOURCE PRODUCES NO DAMAGING HEAT ON/OFF
SWITCH INTEGRATED SMOKE EVACUATION CHANNEL Med S i
48 | 4229310719400 | REINFORCED NYLON MATERIAL PROVIDES EXCEPTIONAL PC | ITEMIZED 370 400398 € S”E)grig‘fpp *®$" 1 0BP Medical. €100230 USA
STRENGTH AND RIGIDITY ANGLED TIP WITH GRIP FOR
IMPROVED TISSUE ADHERENCE LIGHTWEIGHT SIZE: 40 X 20
MM SINGLE USE -STERILE
RETRACTOR WOUND FIRM FLEXIBLE FOR THYROIDS No No No No
49 4229310720300 SURGERY PROTECTING THE WOUND MARGIN FROM Quotatio Quotation | Quotation | Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
CONTACT CONTAMINATION 11-17 CM DISPOSABLE STERILE n
RETRACTOR WOUND FIRM FLEXIBLE FOR THYROIDS No No No No
50 4229310720400 SURGERY PROTECTING THE WOUND MARGIN FROM Quotatio Quotation | Quotation | Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
CONTACT CONTAMINATION 1-3 CM DISPOSABLE STERILE n
RETRACTOR WOUND FIRM FLEXIBLE FOR THYROIDS No N
51 4229310720500 SURGERY PROTECTING THE WOUND MARGIN FROM Quotatio 0, No' No' No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
Quotation |Quotation| Quotation
CONTACT CONTAMINATION 2.5-6 CM DISPOSABLE STERILE n
RETRACTOR WOUND FIRM FLEXIBLE FOR THYROIDS No
52 4229310720600 SURGERY PROTECTING THE WOUND MARGIN FROM Quotatio No' NOA No' No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
Quotation |Quotation| Quotation
CONTACT CONTAMINATION 2-4 CM DISPOSABLE STERILE n
RETRACTOR WOUND FIRM FLEXIBLE FOR THYROIDS No
53 4229310720700 SURGERY PROTECTING THE WOUND MARGIN FROM Quotatio NO, NO, NO, No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
Quotation |Quotation| Quotation
CONTACT CONTAMINATION 5-9 CM DISPOSABLE STERILE n
RETRACTOR WOUND FIRM FLEXIBLE FOR THYROIDS No
54 4229310720800 SURGERY PROTECTING THE WOUND MARGIN FROM Quotatio No' NOA No' No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
Quotation |Quotation| Quotation
CONTACT CONTAMINATION 9-14 CM DISPOSABLE STERILE n
SEALANT, SURGICAL, ABSORBABLE, ADHESION BARRIER, GEL, bi Ith
55 | 4229551000900 2 X 8 ML SYRINGES, AND ONE APPLICATOR, SYNTHETIC EA ITEMIZED 50 a00022 | A@ I'a" Health Care BAXTER 934075 + 0600021 USA
POLYETHYLENE GLYCOLS, STERILE Supply Company -Orig
SET BIOPSY PERCUTANEOUS FOR LIVER CONSISTS OF:
SCALPEL FOR SKIN INCISION ASPIRATION SYRINGE 10 ML SELF
LOCKING RATCHET CATCH DOUBLE PISTON SEAL IN ORDER
TO MAINTAIN THE HIGH NEGATIVE PRESSURE INJECTION NO BID MATCHED
56 4214251800900 | NEEDLE FOR ASPIRATION OF SALINE G20 X 1.5 INCH (0.9 X 39 CAI:;ELL CANCELLED CAN;ELLE CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED WITH THE REQUIRED
MM) LOCK FITTING BIOPSY NEEDLE 90 MM LENGTH THIN SPECIFICATIONS
WALL NEEDLE FOR MINIMAL TRAUMA EXTREMELY Y SHARP
BEVEL FOR PERFECT SPECIMEN REMOVAL SPACER
DISPOSABLE STERILE
December 27, 2023
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57 4222151210600

SET, BIOPSY, FOR SKIN : 1 X TRAY WITH INTEGRAL GALLIPOT,
5 X GAUZE 10 X 10 CM, 2 X HAND TOWEL, 1 X TROLLEY
COVER, 1 X FRAZIER SKIN HOOK 5 INCH, SHARP, 1 X # 3
SCALPEL HANDLE 5 INCH, 1 X HALSEY NEEDLE HOLDER 5

INCH, SERRATED JAWS, 1 X FORCEPS ADSON 1 X 2 TOOTHED

5INCH, 1 X FORCEPS ADSON NON TOOTHED 5 INCH, 1 X IRIS

SCISSORS 4 % INCH, CURVED, SHARP/SHARP, 1 X SCISSOR
DRESSING STITCH SHARP/BLUNT TIP 4 % INCH, 1 X
MOSQUITO CURVED 3 % INCH, 1 X DRAPE APERTURE 50 X 55
CM, 3 INCH, 4 INCH BIOPSY PUNCHES, WRAP : BLUE WRAP 90
X 90 CM, ALL DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

500

400038

Farouk Maamon
Tamer & Company -
Orig-

Molnlycke

97135130-00

Czech Republic

58 4214330000800

SET, HIPEC, BIFURCATED LINE, ALUMINUM FREE, SET
INCLUDES: HEAT EXCHANGER, 250 CM (+/- 10 CM) STRAIGHT
INFLOW PATIENT LINE, 250 CM (+/- 10 CM) BIFURCATED
OUTFLOW PATIENT LINE, 4500 ML (+/- 100 ML) RESERVOIR, IT
SHOULD BE COMPATIBLE WITH HOSPITAL MACHINES,
STERILE

No
Quotatio
n

No
Quotation

No
Quotation

No
Quotation

No Quotation

No Quotation

No Quotation

No Quotation

59 4219250101100

SHEATH COVER, WITH A ROUND RIGID FIXATION RING,
OPTICAL WINDOW FOR HIGH-SENSITIVITY IMAGING SYSTEM
LENS PROTECTION, USED FOR PARATHYROID DETECTION, IT

SHOULD BE COMPATIBLE WITH HOSPITAL MACHINES,

DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

100

400398

Med surg Supplies -
Orig-

Fluoptics SAS,
France

ADD-031

France

60 4213210200000

SHEET, FOR OR AND STRETCHER TABLE, ABSORBENT WITH
ELASTIC BAND FITTED, SHEET SIZE 110 X 230 CM (+ / - 10 CM),
INCLUDE KNEE, BODY AND ARM BOARD STRAPS, HEADREST
COVER, SINGLE USE

KIT

ITEMIZED

12000

400106

Mohammed Hammad
Al-Hammad Medical
Co. -Orig-

ECOLAB

ABGS4090N-EU

China

61 4216160806400

SOLUTION, FOR THE FLUSHING AND COLD STORAGE OF
ABDOMINAL ORGANS, NON-PYROGENIC, EURO-COLLINES
ELECTROLYTE ADDITIVE SOLUTION, THE SOLUTION HAS AN

OSMOLALITY OF 310 + 15 MOSM/KG, 1 LITER BAG

EA

ITEMIZED

400

400173

Company Medical
Cooperation Ltd. -Orig

ORGAN RECOVERY
SYSTEMS

SPS-1

USA

62 4111620003100

STAPLER FOR CIRCUMCISION AND SUTURING FOR MALES.
HIGH QUALITY BIOCOMPATIBILITY MATERIAL WITH HOST
SHELL NAIL-CABIN PROTECTIVE CAP THE END CUTTING BODY
CIRCULAR BLADE NAIL-CABIN SUTURING NAIL CONCAVE SEAT
ADJUSTING KNOB FLEXIBLE HANDGRIP SAFETY PIN.
SUTURING NAIL WITH 316L STAINLESS STEEL. DEVICE MUST
SIMULTANEOUSLY COMPLETE CIRCUMCISION CUTTING AND
SUTURING IN THE SAME TIME. NO STITCHES
REQUIRED.SIMPLE TO OPERATE SAFE PAINLESS AND
EFFICIENT. THE STAPLER WILL FALL DOWN AFTER 5-7 DAYS
WITHOUT INTERVENTION. BOTH PENIS AND FORESKIN
FRENUM ARE COMPLETELY PROTECTED BY NAIL BASE SIZE 12
DISPOSABLE STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

200

400814

Kinza International -
Orig-

JIANGXI LANGHE ME
DICAL INSTRUMENT
Co.

FHQ12

China

December 27, 2023
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62

NUPCO Code

4111620003100

Item Description

STAPLER FOR CIRCUMCISION AND SUTURING FOR MALES.
HIGH QUALITY BIOCOMPATIBILITY MATERIAL WITH HOST
SHELL NAIL-CABIN PROTECTIVE CAP THE END CUTTING BODY
CIRCULAR BLADE NAIL-CABIN SUTURING NAIL CONCAVE SEAT
ADJUSTING KNOB FLEXIBLE HANDGRIP SAFETY PIN.
SUTURING NAIL WITH 316L STAINLESS STEEL. DEVICE MUST
SIMULTANEOUSLY COMPLETE CIRCUMCISION CUTTING AND
SUTURING IN THE SAME TIME. NO STITCHES
REQUIRED.SIMPLE TO OPERATE SAFE PAINLESS AND
EFFICIENT. THE STAPLER WILL FALL DOWN AFTER 5-7 DAYS
WITHOUT INTERVENTION. BOTH PENIS AND FORESKIN
FRENUM ARE COMPLETELY PROTECTED BY NAIL BASE SIZE 12
DISPOSABLE STERILE

uom

EA

Group /
Itemized

ITEMIZED

Quantity Vendor No

200 400398

Vendor Name

Med surg Supplies -
Orig-

Manufacturer

Dongguan ZSR
Biomedical
Technology Compa

Catalog No

ZSR-DCA-12C

China

PRELIMINARY RESULT

NUPCO REMARK

63

4111620003200

STAPLER FOR CIRCUMCISION AND SUTURING FOR MALES.
HIGH QUALITY BIOCOMPATIBILITY MATERIAL WITH HOST
SHELL NAIL-CABIN PROTECTIVE CAP THE END CUTTING BODY
CIRCULAR BLADE NAIL-CABIN SUTURING NAIL CONCAVE SEAT
ADJUSTING KNOB FLEXIBLE HANDGRIP SAFETY PIN.
SUTURING NAIL WITH 316L STAINLESS STEEL. DEVICE MUST
SIMULTANEOUSLY COMPLETE CIRCUMCISION CUTTING AND
SUTURING IN THE SAME TIME. NO STITCHES
REQUIRED.SIMPLE TO OPERATE SAFE PAINLESS AND
EFFICIENT. THE STAPLER WILL FALL DOWN AFTER 5-7 DAYS
WITHOUT INTERVENTION. BOTH PENIS AND FORESKIN
FRENUM ARE COMPLETELY PROTECTED BY NAIL BASE SIZE 14
DISPOSABLE STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

200 400814

Kinza International -
Orig-

JIANGXI LANGHE ME
DICAL INSTRUMENT
Co.

FHQ15

China

63

4111620003200

STAPLER FOR CIRCUMCISION AND SUTURING FOR MALES.
HIGH QUALITY BIOCOMPATIBILITY MATERIAL WITH HOST
SHELL NAIL-CABIN PROTECTIVE CAP THE END CUTTING BODY
CIRCULAR BLADE NAIL-CABIN SUTURING NAIL CONCAVE SEAT
ADJUSTING KNOB FLEXIBLE HANDGRIP SAFETY PIN.
SUTURING NAIL WITH 316L STAINLESS STEEL. DEVICE MUST
SIMULTANEOUSLY COMPLETE CIRCUMCISION CUTTING AND
SUTURING IN THE SAME TIME. NO STITCHES
REQUIRED.SIMPLE TO OPERATE SAFE PAINLESS AND
EFFICIENT. THE STAPLER WILL FALL DOWN AFTER 5-7 DAYS
WITHOUT INTERVENTION. BOTH PENIS AND FORESKIN
FRENUM ARE COMPLETELY PROTECTED BY NAIL BASE SIZE 14
DISPOSABLE STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

200 400398

Med surg Supplies -
Orig-

Dongguan ZSR
Biomedical
Technology Compa

ZSR-DCA-14C

China

64

4229547702100

STIMULATING PROBE, FLUSH TIP, MONOPOLAR, STANDARD
PRASS, TIP SIZE 0.5MM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

No
Quotatio
n

No
Quotation

No No
Quotation | Quotation

No Quotation

No Quotation

No Quotation

No Quotation

65

4231200501500

STRIP, REINFORCED SKIN CLOSURE, 1/4 X 4 INCH (6 MM X 100
MM), STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

208000 400104

Al-Jeel Medical &
Trading Co. Ltd -Orig-

3M

R1546

USA

65

4231200501500

STRIP, REINFORCED SKIN CLOSURE, 1/4 X 4 INCH (6 MM X 100
MM), STERILE

EA

ITEMIZED

208000 400187

Medical Elements
Contracting Compan -
Orig-

ASPEN SURGICAL
PRODUCTS, INC.

751046PBX

USA

66

4214440000000

SUCTION DEVICE, FOR REMOVING LARGE AMOUNT OF
FLUIDS FROM THE FLOOR, CAN EASILY BE MOVED AROUND,
SIZE: 2.5 -3 M, NON-STERILE, DISPOSABLE

EA

ITEMIZED

200 400187

Medical Elements
Contracting Compan -
Orig-

ASPEN SURGICAL
PRODUCTS, INC.

90030

USA

December 27, 2023
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Item Description

uom

Group /

Itemized

Quantity Vendor No

Vendor Name

Manufacturer

Catalog No

PRELIMINARY RESULT

NUPCO REMARK

TUBE, FOR CHEST, PVC TAPER-TROCAR, CATHETERS, THERMO ERMS AND
67 | 4214410200200 | SENSITIVE, STRAIGHT CATHETER, SIZE 12 FRENCH, 2 EYELETS, | CANCELL| -\ ) oy | CANCELLEY ey CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED | CONDITIONS ARE
BLUE RADIOPAQUE STRIPE CONFIRMS PLACEMENT UPON X- |  ED D NOT MEr
RAY, INDIVIDUALLY PACKED, STERILE
SKIN MARKER PEN , GENTIAN VIOLET INK QUICK DRYING AND HUSN AL EMIRAT DONGGUAN
68 | 4229540200000 | DOES NOT RUN , LARGE INK RESERVOIR , STANDARD TIP pC ITEMIZED | 300000 | 400482 | TRADING COMPANY - TONDAUS TRO3 China
WITH RULER, STERILE Orig- MEDITECH CO,.LTD
ADAPTER, WITH SIDE ARM, FOR FLEXIBLE AND RIGID No o o o
69 4231211800000 | URETEROSCOPES, ADMIT 6 FR, CAN BE CONNECTED TO LUER | Quotatio i . i No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
Quotation |Quotation| Quotation
LOCK SYRINGE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE n
70 | 4220340519000 | CATHETER, BALLOON KIT, HIGH PRESSURE, ULTRAMAX OR | CANCELL| -\ g ey | CANCELLE| ey CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED
EQUIVALENT, 15 FR, LENGTH 4 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE ED D
CATHETER, BALLOON KIT, HIGH PRESSURE, ULTRAMAX OR Boston Scientific Gulf
71 | 4220340519100 ' ’ ’ EA ITEMIZED 210 401074 BOSTON SCIENTIFIC |  M0062251270 USA
EQUIVALENT, 15 FR, LENGTH 6 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE Trading -Orig-
Farouk Maamon
CATHETER, BALLOON KIT, HIGH PRESSURE, ULTRAMAX OR )
7L | 4220340519100 | Lo T ENGTH 6 ML DISPOSABLE, STERILE EA ITEMIZED 210 400038 | Tamer %ﬁcg)mpany ; Bard 997506 Mexico
72 | 4220340519200 | CATHETER, BALLOON KIT, HIGH PRESSURE, ULTRAMAXOR |\ ITEMIZED 200 401074 | Boston Scientific Gulf | oo or o scienTiFic | Moo62251280 USA
EQUIVALENT, 18 FR, LENGTH 6 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE Trading -Orig-
Farouk Maamon
72 | 4220340519200 | CATHETER, BALLOON KIT, HIGH PRESSURE, ULTRAMAXOR | ITEMIZED 200 400038 | Tamer & Company - Bard 997606 Mexico
EQUIVALENT, 18 FR, LENGTH 6 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE orin
CATHETER, DILATION, URETERAL, CONTAINS 7 FR, 60-70 CM
73 | 4214390201000 BALLOON CATHETER, 6 MM, GUIDEWIRE 0.038 INCH | CANCELL| -\ | ey | CANCELLE | (e 16D CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED USA DUPLICATED
DIAMETER, 145 TEFLON COATED, STOPCOCK CONNECTING |  ED D
TUBE
CYSTO-NEPHRO SCOPE, FLEXIBLE, WITH INNER DIAMETER
NOT LESS THAN 6.8 FR AND OUTER DIAMETER NOT MORE
THAN 16 FR, WITH SEPARATE SUCTION CONTROL BUTTON,
Medical Supplies &
74 | 4229632800100 IRRIGATION PORT AND DUAL INTERANCE WORKING EA ITEMIZED 900 400046 SIS HugeMed CY-M52 China
CHANNEL, DEFLECTION NOT LESS THAN 210 DEGREE Services Co. Ltd -Orig-
UP/DOWN, USE WITH LAPTOP/TABLE AND MONITOR
DISPOSABLE STERILE (ONE SCREEN FREE OF CHARGE WITH
EVERY 100 PC)
CYSTO-NEPHRO SCOPE, FLEXIBLE, WITH INNER DIAMETER
NOT LESS THAN 6.8 FR AND OUTER DIAMETER NOT MORE
THAN 16 FR, WITH SEPARATE SUCTION CONTROL BUTTON,
IRRIGATION PORT AND DUAL INTERANCE WORKING Attieh Medico Co. Ltd. ‘
74 | 4229632800100 CHANNEL, DEFLECTION NOT LESS THAN 210 DEGREE EA ITEMIZED 900 400007 orig. PUSEN PC200 China
UP/DOWN, USE WITH LAPTOP/TABLE AND MONITOR
DISPOSABLE STERILE (ONE SCREEN FREE OF CHARGE WITH
EVERY 100 PC)
UNITED MEDICAL
GRASPER, FLEXIBLE URETEROSCOPIC CUP BIOPSY FORCEPS,
75 | 4229490830300 FR 3 2.6 FR, 110 120 CM, SINGLE USE, STERILE EA ITEMIZED 100 400369 INDUSTR(I::ErSigCO. LTD. -| Cook Incorporated BLB-024115 USA
Mohammed Hammad
GUIDEWIRE, PTFE COATED, 0.028 INCH X 100 - 150CM A EN-340028,EN-
76 | 4229351601000 | oo IATRIC UROLOGY, DISPOSABLE, STERILE EA ITEMIZED | 1762 | 400106 Al-Hacmomagr:\;educal UROTECH BN Germany
December 27, 2023
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PRELIMINARY RESULT

G
NUPCO Code Item Description uom It;r:;:e{:l Quantity Vendor No Vendor Name Manufacturer Catalog No NUPCO REMARK
HYDROPHILIC COATING, URETERIC BALLOON DILATOR, 5 FR,
TAPERED TIP WITH GUIDE WIRE 0.038 INCH, RADIO-OPAQUE, Farouk Maamon
77 | 4229340702500 | MARKERS AT BOTH END OF THE BALLOON, BURST PRESSURE | EA ITEMIZED 68 400038 | Tamer & Company - Bard 998504 Mexico
20 ATM, INFLATED BALLOON DIAMETER 4 - 5 MM AND Orig-
LENGTH 4 CM WITH INFLATION DEVICE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
HYDROPHILIC COATING, URETERIC BALLOON DILATOR, 7 FR,
TAPERED TIP WITH GUIDE WIRE 0.038 INCH, RADIO-OPAQUE UNITED MEDICAL
78 | 4229340702400 | MARKERS AT BOTH END OF THE BALLOON, BURST PRESSURE | EA ITEMIZED | 1200 | 400369 |INDUSTRIES CO.LTD.-| Cook Incorporated 10014 USA
20ATM, INFLATED BALLOON DIAMETER 6 - 7 MM AND Orig-
LENGTH 6 CM WITH INFLATION DEVICE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
HYDROPHILIC COATING, URETERIC BALLOON DILATOR, 7 FR,
TAPERED TIP WITH GUIDE WIRE 0.038 INCH, RADIO-OPAQUE Farouk Maamon
78 | 4229340702400 | MARKERS AT BOTH END OF THE BALLOON, BURST PRESSURE | EA ITEMIZED | 1200 | 400038 | Tamer & Company - Bard 998606 Mexico
20ATM, INFLATED BALLOON DIAMETER 6 - 7 MM AND Orig-
LENGTH 6 CM WITH INFLATION DEVICE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
IMPLANT, PENILE, INFLATABLE, ANTIBIOTIC-IMPREGNATED, Boston Scientific Gulf
79 | 4214271801300 ' ’ ’ | kT | ITEMIZED 60 401074 BOSTON SCIENTIFIC 72404XXX USA
ASSORTED SIZES Trading -Orig-
No
IRRIGATION TUBING, MANUAL PUMP, PRESSURE CONTROL No No No
80 4229516201100 ! ! tati N tati N tati N tati N tati
CHAMBER, 1 SPIKE, SINGLE USE, STERILE Q”°na | Quotation |Quotation| Quotation OIOIEEES OIOITEEES R OIOITEETES
Mohammed Hammad RP-401250,RP-
SET, NEPHROSTOMY, POLYURETHANE PIGTAIL, 30 CM (+/- A .
81 | 4222150501000 EA ITEMIZED 552 400106 | Al-Hammad Medical UROTECH 400840-FI,RP- G
5CM), RADIO - OPAQUE, SIZE: CH 12, DISPOSABLE, STERILE ammad Viedica g ermany
Co. -Orig- 400850-FI
a || mrmsemmmey || S NSO FIRURET MBI L S0y | o ITEMIZED 552 400222 | ‘anatAL-Arab Co.- COLOPLAST RIA112 France
5CM), RADIO - OPAQUE, SIZE: CH 12, DISPOSABLE, STERILE Orig-
SET, STENT, INDWELLING, POLYURETHANE, DOUBLE
URETERAL, PIGTAIL STENT, OPEN ENDED, TAPERED TIP, WITH Mohammed Hammad
82 | 4220341203500 HOLES IN THE BODY, LOCKABLE PUSHER, WITH LONG SET | ITEMIZED 300 400106 | Al-Hammad Medical UROTECH EN-360626 Germany
GUIDEWIRE, RADIO-OPAQUE, SIZE: CH 6.0, 26CM, Co. -Orig-
DISPOSABLE, STERILE
SET, STENT, INDWELLING, POLYURETHANE, DOUBLE
URETERAL, PIGTAIL STENT, OPEN ENDED, TAPERED TIP, WITH Janat ALArab Co
82 | 4220341203500 HOLES IN THE BODY, LOCKABLE PUSHER, WITH LONG SET | ITEMIZED 300 400222 o : COLOPLAST BCAA64 France
GUIDEWIRE, RADIO-OPAQUE, SIZE: CH 6.0, 26CM, g
DISPOSABLE, STERILE
SET, STENT, INDWELLING, POLYURETHANE, DOUBLE
83 | 4214273308400 |YRETERAL, PIGTAIL STENT, OPEN ENDED, TAPERED TIP, WITH) ITEMIZED 500 ao1074 | Boston seientific Gulf | o o scienTiFic | Moo61752520 USA
HOLES IN THE BODY, WITHOUT GUIDEWIRE, SIZE: CH 4.7 - 5, Trading -Orig-
24 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
SET, STENT, INDWELLING, POLYURETHANE, DOUBLE
URETERAL, PIGTAIL STENT, OPEN ENDED, TAPERED TIP, WITH Janat AL-Arab Co. -
83 | 4214273308400 2 o b b EA ITEMIZED 500 400222 COLOPLAST BCAJ43 F
HOLES IN THE BODY, WITHOUT GUIDEWIRE, SIZE: CH 4.7 - 5, Orig- rance
24 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
SET, STENT, INDWELLING, POLYURETHANE, DOUBLE
84 | 4214273308500 | YRETERAL, PIGTAIL STENT, OPEN ENDED, TAPERED TIP, WITH) ITEMIZED 500 ao1074 | Boston scientific Gulf | o o scienTiFic | Moo61752530 USA
HOLES IN THE BODY, WITHOUT GUIDEWIRE, SIZE: CH 4.7 - 5, Trading -Orig-
26 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
December 27, 2023
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SET, STENT, INDWELLING, POLYURETHANE, DOUBLE
o0 | 4214973308500 | URETERAL, PIGTAIL STENT, OPEN ENDED, TAPERED TIP, WITH| TEMIZED s00 200222 | JanatALArab Co.- COLOPLAST scAld erance
HOLES IN THE BODY, WITHOUT GUIDEWIRE, SIZE: CH 4.7 - 5, Orig-
26 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
SET, STENT, INDWELLING, POLYURETHANE, DOUBLE
URETERAL, PIGTAIL STENT, OPEN ENDED, TAPERED TIP, WITH Boston Scientific Gulf
85 | 4229590319000 ’ ’ , ' EA ITEMIZED 500 401074 BOSTON SCIENTIFIC |  M0061752830 USA
HOLES IN THE BODY, WITHOUT GUIDEWIRE, SIZE: CH 8, 26 Trading -Orig-
CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
SET, URETERIC, STONE DISLODGER, WITH RETRACTABLE, UNITED MEDICAL
86 | 4214271200400 | NITINOL FOUR WIRES BASKET, WITHOUT TIP, SIZE: 4 - 4.5 EA ITEMIZED 800 400369 | INDUSTRIES CO. LTD. -| Cook Incorporated | NTSE-045065-UDH USA
FRENCH, LENGTH 60 - 90 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE Orig-
SET, URETERIC, STONE DISLODGER, WITH RETRACTABLE, |\ . CANCELLE NO BID MATCHED
87 | 4214271201200 | NITINOL FOUR WIRES BASKET, WITHOUT TIP, SIZE: 5 - 5.5 tp | CANCELLED o |canceLen CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED  |WITH THE REQUIRED
FRENCH, LENGTH 60 - 90 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE SPECIFICATIONS
STENT, URETERAL, MULTI-LENGTH, 4 FRENCH, 2232.CM, |, CANCELLE NO BID MATCHED
88 | 4229590316100 WITH NITINOL COATING SET, WITH PTFE COATED to | CANCELLED o |cAncELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED  |WITH THE REQUIRED
GUIDEWIRE, STERILE SPECIFICATIONS
UNITED MEDICAL
89 | 4229500319100 | STV METAL FOR TREAT URINARY TRACT OBSTRUCTIONS, | ITEMIZED | 1000 | 400369 |INDUSTRIES CO.LTD.-| Cook Incorporated | RMS-0600XX-R USA
ASSORTED SIZES, DISPOSABLE, STERILE org
TART MEDICAL EST - Ay i
90 | 4229553201000 |TESTICULAR PROSTHESIS, SILICONE, ASSORTED SIZES, STERILE|  EA ITEMIZED 20 400781 on PROMEDON S.A. |MEDIUM /T-LARGE|  Argentina
& / T-XLARGE
TUBING SET FOR TWO IRRIGATION PACKS, CANNULA, o
. N N N
91 | 4231220700800 TUBING CLAMP, Y- PIECE, PUMP SUCTION, PRESSURE |\ i ° ° ° No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
CHAMBER MALE LUER- LOCK ADAPTOR TO FIT WITH n Quotation |Quotation| Quotation
ENDOMAT / ENDOMAT SELECT/ EQUIMAT MACHINE.
TUBING SET FOR TWO IRRIGATION PACKS, CANNULA, o
TUBING CLAMP, Y- PIECE, PUMP SUCTION, PRESSURE ) No No No _ _ _ _
92 4229493300100 CHAMBER MALE LUER- LOCK ADAPTOR TO FIT WITH Quor':atlo Quotation | Quotation| Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
HYSTEROFLOW// HYSTEROBALANCE (I OR I1) MACHINE.
URETHROCYSTOSCOPY, FLEXIBLE, FOR STENT REMOVAL,
Janat AL-Arab Co. -
93 | 2220631100800 | W' INTEGRATED GRASPER, USE WITH LAPTOP/TABLEAND | ITEMIZED 500 400222 | “AnatATArab Lo COLOPLAST ALFAOL Malaysia
MONITOR DISPOSABLE STERILE (ONE SCREEN FREE OF Orig-
CHARGE WITH EVERY 100 PC)
o4 | 4229547701600 | MRILEAD WITH 4 ELECTRODES, COMPATIBLE WITH SACRAL | CROUP 1 120 100272 Medtronic Saudi VEDTRONIC o78AL28 A
NERVE STIMULATION RECHARGEABLE (STAGE I) Arabia -Orig-
o5 | a2r0547701500 | MR!LEAD WITH 4 ELECTRODES, COMPATIBLE WITH SACRAL | CROUP 1 120 20027 Medtronic Saudi Medtronic Inc 6788128 Ush
NERVE STIMULATION NON-RECHARGEABLE (STAGE I) Arabia -Orig-
96 | 4229547701200 | EXTENSION TO BE USED WITH MRI LEAD, COMPATIBLE WITH | -\ GROUP 1 120 400272 Medtronic Saudi Medtronic Inc 3560030 USA
SACRAL NERVE STIMULATION RECHARGEABLE (STAGE I) Arabia -Orig-
97 | 4229547701100 | FXTENSION TO BE USED WITH MRILEAD, COMPATIBLE WITH |-\ GROUP 1 120 400272 Medtronic Saudi Medtronic Inc 3560022 USA
SACRAL NERVE STIMULATION NON-RECHARGEABLE (STAGE 1) Arabia -Orig-
EXTERNAL STIMULATOR, SINGLE USE, COMPATIBLE WITH Vedtronic Saudi
98 | 4229547701300 | SACRAL NERVE STIMULATION RECHARGEABLE AND NON- EA GROUP 1 120 400272 e o Medtronic Inc 353101 USA
RECHARGEABLE (STAGE I) &
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CONTROLLER TO ADJUST THE STIMULATION OF EXTERNAL
99 | 4229547701000 STIMULATOR, COMPATIBLE WITH SACRAL NERVE EA GROUP 1 120 400272 Medtronic Saudi Medtronic Inc HH901A USA
STIMULATION RECHARGEABLE AND NON-RECHARGEABLE Arabia -Orig-
(STAGE 1)
SACRAL NERVE STIMULATION DEVICE RECHARGEABLE -
STAGE II, BATTERY UP TO 10 YEARS RECHARGEABLE, MRI Medtronic Saudi
100 | 4229547702000 | COMPATIBLE ON 3 TESLA, CONNECTED TO MRI LEAD WITH4 | EA GROUP 1 80 400272 o o Meditronic Inc 97810 USA
ELECTRODE WIRELESS PROGRAMING UP TO 4 PROGRAM g
PULSE
RECHARGER BLUETOOTH TO CHARGE THE SACRAL NERVE Medtronic Saudi
101 | 4229547701800 STIMULATION, COMPATIBLE WITH SACRAL NERVE EA GROUP 1 80 400272 i Medtronic Inc RS5200 USA
STIMULATION DEVICE RECHARGEABLE (STAGE I1) &
FIXATION BELT LARGE SIZE USED WITH RECHARGER, Vedtronie Saudi
102 | 4229547701400 | COMPATIBLE WITH SACRAL NERVE STIMULATION DEVICE EA GROUP 1 80 400272 o Meditronic Inc FP900OL USA
RECHARGEABLE (STAGE Il) €
PATIENT CONTROLLER TO CONTROL THE INTENSITY OF
Medtronic Saudi
103 | 4229547701700 | STIMULATION AND CONTROL THE CHARGING, COMPATIBLE | GROUP 1 80 400272 edtronic saud Medtronic Inc TH90PO2 USA
WITH SACRAL NERVE STIMULATION DEVICES RECHARGEABLE Arabia -Orig-
AND NON-RECHARGEABLE (STAGE Il)
SACRAL NERVE STIMULATION DEVICE NON RECHARGEABLE -
STAGE I, BATTERY UP TO 5 YEARS CONNECTED TO LEAD
WITH 4 ELECTRODE WIRELESS PROGRAMMING UP TO 4 Medtronic Saudi
104 | 4229547701900 EA GROUP 1 80 400272 Meditronic | 3058 USA
PROGRAM PULSE WITH 60- 450 MICROSEC AMPLITUDE O - Arabia -Orig- ectronicinc
8.5 VOLTS FREQUENCY 2.1 - 130 HZ WEIGHTLESS THAN 25 GR
NEURO
RETRACTOR ARTICULATED, LONE STAR OR EQUIVALENT, 14 Cure Development ‘
105 | 4229310710600 EA GROUP 2 430 400062 Cooper Surgical 3307G USA
CM X 14 CM (/- 1 CM) DISPOSABLE STERILE International Ltd. -Orig| P’ >UT8'¢
RETRACTOR ARTICULATED, LONE STAR OR EQUIVALENT, 22 Cure Development )
106 | 4229310719500 PC GROUP 2 400 400062 Cooper Surgical 3302G USA
CM X 11 CM (+/-1 CM) DISPOSABLE STERILE International Ltd. -Orig| P >U8'¢
RETRACTOR ARTICULATED, LONE STAR OR EQUIVALENT, 25 Cure Development ‘
107 | 4229310719600 PC GROUP 2 400 400062 Cooper Surgical 3301G USA
CM X 11 CM (+/-1 CM) DISPOSABLE STERILE International Ltd. -Orig| P >UT8'¢
RETRACTOR ARTICULATED, LONE STAR OR EQUIVALENT, 28 Cure Development )
108 | 4229310719700 PC GROUP 2 400 400062 Cooper Surgical 3308G USA
CM X 18 CM (+/-1 CM) DISPOSABLE STERILE International Ltd. -Orig| P >U8'¢
RETRACTOR ARTICULATED, LONE STAR OR EQUIVALENT, 32- Cure Development ‘
109 | 4229310719800 PC GROUP 2 400 400062 Cooper Surgical 3304G USA
34 CM X 18-22 CM DISPOSABLE STERILE International Ltd. -Orig| —__Per >UrBIc@
RETRACTOR ELASTIC STAYS HOOK BLUNT 12MM LARGE Cure Development
110 | 4229310719900 PC GROUP 2 800 400062 Cooper Surgical 3350-1G USA
DISPOSABLE STERILE International Ltd. -Orig| —__Pc' >UrBIc@
NO BID MATCHED
RETRACTOR ELASTIC STAYS HOOK BLUNT 8MM SMALL | CANCELL CANCELLE
111 | 4229310720000 CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED  |WITH THE REQUIRED
DISPOSABLE STERILE ED D
SPECIFICATIONS
112 | 4229310720100 RETRACTOR ELASTIC STAYS HOOK SHARP 3MM SMALL PC GROUP 2 1200 a00062 | CureDevelopment | urgical 3314-1G USA
DISPOSABLE STERILE International Ltd. -Orig
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113 | 4231170400600 | "CTRACTORELASTIC STAYS HOOK SHARP SMM OR LARGE EA GROUP 2 1070 a00062 | CureDevelopment | Surgical 3311-1G USA
DISPOSABLE STERILE International Ltd. -Orig
ARTIFICIAL URINARY SPHINCTER WITH OCCLUSIVE CUFF Boston Scientific Gulf
114 | 4229551604400 b EA GROUP 3 15 401074 BOSTON SCIENTIFIC T2XXXXXX USA
ASSORTED SIZES Trading -Orig-
115 | 4214273700000 PRESSURE REGULATING BALLOON, ASSORTED SIZES EA GROUP 3 15 401074 B“ﬁ;‘ dsi:zng:?u'f BOSTON SCIENTIFIC 724000XX USA
116 | 4229551605000 CONTROL PUMP WITH ACCESSORY KIT EA GROUP 3 15 401074 B°StTc:2 ds;';";';'ich”'f BOSTON SCIENTIFIC | 72XXXXXXX USA
S OO pyr—
117 | 4229552512600 | o NSTRUCTION, THICKNESS 0.6 - 1.05 MV, size 18| A ITEMIZED 10 400083 INSTRUM;:\:T Co.ltd.-| LifeNet Health DCELL330M USA
X 20 CM, FULLY EXPANDED, STERILE &
ACELLULAR DERMAL MATRIX DERIVED FROM HUMAN
g AL AMIN MEDICAL
118 | 4229552512700 | COLLAGEN AND ELASTIN, MICROPERFORATED, FOR SOFT EA ITEMIZED 30 400083 |INSTRUMENT Co. Ltd.-|  LifeNet Health DCELL216M USA
TISSUE RECONSTRUCTION, THICKNESS 0.6 - 1.05 MM, SIZE 8 X on
20 CM, STERILE <
ACELLULAR DERMAL MATRIX DERIVED FROM HUMAN, AL AMIN MEDICAL
119 | 4229552503300 COLLAGEN AND ELASTIN, UNMESHED, FOR CHRONIC EA ITEMIZED 10 400083 |INSTRUMENT Co. Ltd.-| LifeNet Health DCELL152 USA
WOUNDS, THICKNESS 0.2 - 1.00MM, SIZE 5X 7 CM, STERILE Orig-
P e
120 | 4229552512800 | oo oucn o CRNESS 1,25 -2 M, SiZE 8 X 20CM, | A ITEMIZED 50 400083 INSTRUM;:\:T Co.ltd.-| LifeNet Health DCELL256 USA
STERILE g
BLADE DERMATOME TO BE USED WITH SKIN GRAFT ALNOZHA Medical Et.
121 | 4229520100100 MACHINE SHOULD BE COMPATIBLE WITH HOSPITAL PC GROUP 4 250 400132 o OTHERS_HUMECA 5.D80BL10 Netherlands
MACHINE DISPOSABLE STERILE &
CARRIER SKIN GRAFT SIZE 3 :1 TO BE USED WITH SKIN GRAFT ALNOZHA Medical Est.
122 | 4231270200400 ACHINE pC GROUP 4 200 400132 Ori: 1=t | OTHERS._HUMECA 6.V10-3.0 Netherlands
123 | 4231270200300 | CARRIER SKIN GRAFT SIZE 1.5:1 TO BE USED WITH SKIN PC GROUP 4 200 ao0132 |ALNOZHAMedical Est. | r oo LuMECA 6.V10-1.5 Netherlands
GRAFT MACHINE Orig-
124 | 4229352101700 | CANISTER HIGH VOLUME FOR COLLECTION FAT PROCESSING | CROUP 5 o so0132 |ALINOZHA Medical Est. | OTHERS_WELLS 20.5173.00 Ush
AND SEPARATING THE FAT AUTOCLAVABLE SIZE 1000 CC Orig- JOHNSON
125 | 4229352101800 | CANISTER HIGH VOLUME FOR COLLECTION FAT PROCESSING | CROUP 5 . 400132 |PLNOZHA Medical Est. | OTHERS_WELLS 20517400 UsA
AND SEPARATING THE FAT AUTOCLAVABLE SIZE 2000 CC Orig- JOHNSON
196 | 4229352101500 | CANISTER HIGH VOLUME FOR COLLECTION FAT PROCESSING | CROUP 5 o s00132 |ALINOZHA Medical Est. | OTHERS_WELLS 20.5175.00 Ush
AND SEPARATING THE FAT AUTOCLAVABLE SIZE 3000 CC Orig- JOHNSON
CANISTER PLASTIC WITH LID 1250-1300 CC DESIGNED FOR |  No o o o
127 4229350301200 USE WITH THE VENTX/ VASER LIPOSUCTION DEVICE OR Quotatio . . . No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
Quotation [Quotation| Quotation
EQUIVALENT n
INFILTRATION TUBE PVC WITH SINGLE SPIKE LENGTH 8-9 No o o o
128 4229351103900 FEET STERILE DISPOSABLE COMPATIBLE WITH VASER OR Quotatio . . . No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
Quotation [Quotation| Quotation
EQUIVALENT n
NANO FILTER FAT TISSUE MICROMETERS HOMOGENIZATION|  No o o o
129 4229351104000 AND FILTERING - 2.4 1.2 AND 0.6 MM STERILE DISPOSABLE |Quotatio Quotation | Quotation| Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
COMPATIBLE WITH VASER OR EQUIVALENT n
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REINJECTION TUBE PROPRIETARY TUBING DESIGNED USED |  No o o o
130 4229351104100 FOR LIPOFILLING SILICONE TUBE STERILE DISPOSABLE Quotatio . . . No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
Quotation [Quotation| Quotation
COMPATIBLE WITH VASER OR EQUIVALENT n
No
131 4229350301100 SUCTION TUBE PVC THICKNESS SMM LENGTH 8-9 FEET Quotatio No' No' No' No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
DISPOSABLE COMPATIBLE WITH VASER OR EQUIVALENT n Quotation [Quotation| Quotation
CATHETER, INTRA UTERINE INSEMINATION, OUTSIDE
132 | 4214310111300 DIAMETER 2.3-2.6 MM, STEP DOWNTO 1.5- L6 MM - | CANCELL) o) ey | CANCELLE | )\ e CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED
DISTAL 4.5 CM DIAMETER OF LENGTH, EFFECTIVE LENGTH ED D
16.8-18CM
133 | 4214310300600 | PEVICE: INTRAUTERINE, CONTRACEPTION, NON HORMONAL | _ TEMIZED o35 s00324 | Azahr Guif Medical | SMB CORPORATION oNaL | dia
STERILE Establishment -Orig- OF INDIA
Alzahr Gulf Medical | SMB CORPORATION
134 | 4214310300300 | DEVICE, INTRAUTERINE, COPPER GYN-T 380 OR EQUIVALENT |  EA ITEMIZED 1538 400824 zanr suit iedica GN31 India
Establishment -Orig- OF INDIA
No
DILATOR, VAGINAL, SILICONE, ASSORTED SIZE, SINGLE USE N N N
135 | 4214313600000 ' ' ' ' " | Quotatio ° ° ° No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation No Quotation
STERILE n Quotation | Quotation| Quotation
No
ECHO TIP NEEDLE, DOUBLE LUMEN, FOR OVUM, PICK UP No No No
136 | 4214320001400 ! ! ! tati N tati N tati N tati N tati
SIZE: 17 G, LENGTH 30 - 33 CM Q”°na '°| quotation |Quotation | Quotation OIOIEEES OIOITEEES R OIOITEETES
No
STENT BALLOON UTERINE 4 CM DIAMETER 4 CM LENGTH 9 No No No
137 | 4229590301100 tati No Quotati No Quotati No Quotati No Quotati
FR INFLATION LINE 10 ML SYRINGE STERILE Q”°na | Quotation |Quotation| Quotation © Quotation © Quotation © Quotation © Quotation
NEEDLE, BIOPSY, BONE MARROW, 14G, ADJUSTABLE, LENGTH Mohammed Hammad VVIE11410/50
138 | 4214250407700 | FROM 3/8TO 17/8 INCH, ILIAC ASPIRATION, HARVESTING | EA ITEMIZED 400 400106 | Al-Hammad Medical VIGEO ,VVIE11430/70 Italy
WITH 3 SIDE HOLES DISPOSABLE, STERILE Co. -Orig- ,WVIE11510/
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