
TENDER NO. NPT0030/23
TENDER NAME: Ophthalmic Supplementary Tender

PRELIMINARY ANNOUNCEMENT

SN NUPCO Code       Item Description UOM Group / Itemized Vendor No Vendor Name Manufacturer Catalog No Country NUPCO REMARK

1 4229550503900
IMPLANT, COLLAGEN MATRIX, TYPE I ATELOCOLLAGEN, FOR OPHTHALMIC 

SURGERIES, DRY SHEET, ROUND 12MM ( +/- 1 MM ), THICKNESS 2 MM, 
STERILE

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

2 4229550900400 IMPLANT, EYE SPHERE, METHCRLT-PMMA, ASSORTED SIZES EA ITEMIZED 400695
Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -

Orig-
OPTITECH SI-12 TO SI-24 India

3 4229550506100
IMPLANT, FOR GLAUCOMA MICROSHUNT, SYNTHETIC POLYMER, OVER ALL 
LENGTH 8, 5MM, LUMEN SIZE 70 ΜM, IMPLANT IN ANTERIOR CHAMBER, 

LOWER HIGH PRESSURE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400080 Alhamaed Medical Company -Orig-

INNFOCUS, A SANTEN 
COMPANY

GLT-001 USA

4 4229420606300

PACK, DMEK SURGERY, DISPOSABLE STERILE KIT: BENT PIPETTE FOR GRAFT 
COLLECTION AND INSERTION INTO THE ANTERIOR CHAMBER, DUAL LUER-
LOCK CONNECTOR, STRAIGHT GLASS PIPETTE INCL. BALLOON FOR GRAFT 

FLUSHING, SYRINGE WITH LUER-LOCK (2 X), 1 SYRINGE FOR GRAFT 
INTRODUCTION, 1 SYRINGE FOR BSS, 1 SYRINGE FOR (AIR INJECTION), 23G 

MVR KNIFE (STRAIGHT), 27G BLUNT CANNULA (BSS), 30G CURVED 
CANNULA FOR AIR INJECTION

EA ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION

5 4229420701900 YORUK DMEK MARKER, FOR DMEK SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400141 Al Basar For Medical Supplies -Orig- EJANACH J2893E Italy

6 4229420676800 IRRIGATION HANDPIECE, SZURMAN DMEK, FOR DMEK SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400083
AL AMIN MEDICAL INSTRUMENT Co. 

Ltd. -Orig-
A1 Medical L-1361 Germany

7 4229420679500
SPATULA, SZURMAN DMEK PREPARATION, DESCEMET LAYER GRAFT, FOR 

DMEK SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED 400085 Gulf Medical CO. LTD. -Orig- GEUDER G-38622 Germany

8 4229420674500 FORCEPS, REMKY DMEK KERATOPLASTY, FOR DMEK SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400085 Gulf Medical CO. LTD. -Orig- GEUDER G-38623 Germany
9 4229420669100 STERILIZATION TRAY SET, 5 INSTRUMENTS, FOR DMEK SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

10 4229380300700 SPATULA, DESMET SCORER, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
EPSILON EP-44-90 USA

11 4229420617800 FORCEPS, DONOR DESMET, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED 400083
AL AMIN MEDICAL INSTRUMENT Co. 

Ltd. -Orig-
A1 Medical F-1861 Germany

11 4229420617800 FORCEPS, DONOR DESMET, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED 400085 Gulf Medical CO. LTD. -Orig- GEUDER G-38624 Germany

12 4229420700500 GLIDE, SYMMETRIC, 0.9 MM, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

13 4229420669000 DISSECTOR, INSPECTION GAUGE 0.9, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

14 4229420701100 CENTERING GUIDE, VACUUM, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

15 4229420698300 POCKETING, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400239 First Gulf Company -Orig- RUMEX 10-035 USA

16 4229420693200 DISSECTOR "SEPARATOR", COUNTER CLOCKWISE, FOR INTACS SK SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400695
Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -

Orig-
VISION KR8310 China

17 4229420693300 DISSECTOR "SEPARATOR", CLOCKWISE, FOR INTACS SK SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400695
Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -

Orig-
VISION KR8309 China

18 4229420696800 MARKER, FOR INTACS SK SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

19 4229420695600 INSPECTION GAUGE, FOR INTACS SK SEPARATOR SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

20 4229420694900 HANDLE, FOR GLIDE BLADE, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

21 4229420678800 MARKER, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400195
Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -

Orig-
ALBERT HEISS H-2611/1 Germany

22 4229420655700 FORCEPS, FOR INTRA-CORNEAL INTACS RING, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400243
Experts Medical Supplies Company -

Orig-
Cilita F-2144T Russian Fed.

23 4229420692800 DISSECTOR "SEPARATOR" CLOCKWISE, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITIMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

24 4229420693400 DISSECTOR "SEPARATOR" COUNTER CLOCKWISE, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITIMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

25 4229420684500 FORCEPS, BONN, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
42.952.10 Germany

26 4229420689200 HOOK, SINSKEY, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
42.451.00 Germany

27 4229420702000 MARKER, ZONE, 11 MM, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400243
Experts Medical Supplies Company -

Orig-
Cilita C-060T Russian Fed.

28 4229420656200
CALIPER, MEASURES FROM 0MM TO 20MM IN 1MM INCREMENTS, WITH 
SCALE READING ON BOTH SIDES, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR INTACS SURGERY

EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
EPSILON EC-146 USA

29 4229420701700 SPECULUM, WIRE LID, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

30 4229420692300 FORCEPS, CASSIE .12, STR, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400083
AL AMIN MEDICAL INSTRUMENT Co. 

Ltd. -Orig-
A1 Medical F-1190 Germany
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31 4229420656800 NEEDLE HOLDER, BARRAQUER, FINE, CVD, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400084
Saudi Service & Health Care Co. Ltd -

Orig-
Appasamy AA 5130 India

32 4229420697000 FORCEPS, MCPHERSON, STRAIGHT, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
43.226.10 Germany

33 4229420701200 SCISSORS, VANNAS, STRAIGHT, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
09.140.08 Germany

34 4229420700700 SCISSORS, TENOTOMY, STRAIGHT, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
08.360.11 Germany

35 4229420699400 STERILIZATION TRAY, FOR 22 INST, FOR INTACS SURGERY EA ITIMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

36 4229420671200
STERILIZATION TRAY, FOR INTACS SEPARATOR, FOR 4 INST, FOR INTACS SK 

SEPARATOR SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED 400243

Experts Medical Supplies Company -
Orig-

Eye Technology ET-4700A
United 

Kingdom

37 4229420618100
DSAEK ARTIFICIAL ANTERIOR CHAMBER, CONTROLLED PRESSURE, 

DISPOSABLE, MACHINE COMPATIBLE  STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400083

AL AMIN MEDICAL INSTRUMENT Co. 
Ltd. -Orig-

MORIA 19182 France

38 4229551800000
"ENDOGLIDE-ULTRATHIN, DSAEK SURGERY, DESIGN ALLOWS THE DONOR 

GRAFT TO BE LOADED INTO THE DELIVERY CARTRIDGE, STERILE"
EA ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

CORONET 51-823
United 

Kingdom

39 4229420691300 BD ROLLER, PLASTIC, VIOLET, FOR DSAEK SURGERY EA ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION

40 4229420700900 SPATULA, TRIFACET, FOR FOGLA SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400141 Al Basar For Medical Supplies -Orig- EJANACH J2192.29E Italy

41 4229420693100 SCISSORS, CORNEAL, FOR FOGLA SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

42 4229420698400 DISSECTOR, POINTED, FOR FOGLA SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
EPSILON EP-92 USA

43 4229420693000 SCISSORS, FOR CORNEA, CURVED, LEFT, FOR FOGLA SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
EPSILON ES-16L USA

44 4229420655400 CANNULA, 27G, FOGLA, FOR FOGLA SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400084
Saudi Service & Health Care Co. Ltd -

Orig-
Appasamy AA 7100 India

45 4229420686900 STERILIZATION TRAY, FOR 5 INSTRUMENTS, FOR FOGLA SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

46 4229420677900 PEELER, FOR MEMBRANE, 23G, FOR 23 GAUGE VITREORETINAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400085 Gulf Medical CO. LTD. -Orig- GEUDER G-37512 Germany

46 4229420677900 PEELER, FOR MEMBRANE, 23G, FOR 23 GAUGE VITREORETINAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
OPTICO 80-109

United 
Kingdom

47 4229420678100
SCISSORS, RETINAL, CURVED, 23G, FOR 23 GAUGE VITREORETINAL 

SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED 400230

Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 
Medical -Orig-

Hasa Optix 556006 Belgium

48 4229420654500
FORCEPS, RETINAL, SERRATED, 23G, FOR 23 GAUGE VITREORETINAL 

SURGERY
EA ITIMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

49 4229420684100
HANDLE, BACK FLUSH, LUER LOCK CONNECTOR, WITH LARGE RESERVOIR 

SILICONE, STAINLESS STEEL
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

50 4229420685800 PEELER, FOR MEMBRANE, 25G, FOR 25 GAUGE VITREORETINAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
OPTICO 80-110

United 
Kingdom

50 4229420685800 PEELER, FOR MEMBRANE, 25G, FOR 25 GAUGE VITREORETINAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400085 Gulf Medical CO. LTD. -Orig- GEUDER G-37513 Germany

51 4229420686000
SCISSORS, RETINAL, CURVED, 25G, FOR 25 GAUGE VITREORETINAL 

SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

OPTICO 60-601
United 

Kingdom

52 4229420654600
FORCEPS, RETINAL, SERRATED, 25G, FOR 25 GAUGE VITREORETINAL 

SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

OPTICO 60-501
United 

Kingdom

53 4229420666700
SCISSORS, BELLUCCI, CURVED RIGHT 8 MM, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR 

ENDOSCOPIC SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED 400195

Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -
Orig-

Rudolf RU 7893-42/03 Germany

54 4229420669200
KNIFE, DRAFT SICKLE, STRAIGHT 19 MM, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR 

ENDOSCOPIC SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

55 4229420672200
FORCEPS, LAWTON BLAKESLEY, STRAIGHT, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR 

ENDOSCOPIC SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED 400195

Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -
Orig-

Rudolf RU 8090-24 Germany

56 4229420669600
STERILIZATION TRAY, FOR ENDOSCOPIC SET, 25 INSTRUMENTS, FOR 

ENDOSCOPIC SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

57 4229420679200
FORCEPS, BLAKESLEY, STRAIGHT 3.0MM, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR 

ENDOSCOPIC SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED 400195

Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -
Orig-

Rudolf RU 8090-22 Germany

58 4229420664300 RETRACTOR, FREER, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400104 Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- KLS martin 37-702-15-07 Germany

59 4229420698500 RETRACTOR, RAGNELL, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
18.242.14 Germany

60 4229420698600 RONGEUR, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
32.131.15 Germany

61 4229420690400 RONGEUR, ADSON, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
32.142.20 Germany
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62 4229420692700 CHISEL, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400104 Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- KLS martin 23-106-03-07 Germany

62 4229420692700 CHISEL, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400084
Saudi Service & Health Care Co. Ltd -

Orig-
Appasamy AA 6100 India

62 4229420692700 CHISEL, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400141 Al Basar For Medical Supplies -Orig- EJANACH J2760.X Italy

63 4229420698900 RETRACTOR, SENN, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
18.162.15 Germany

64 4229420696700 MALLET, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400084
Saudi Service & Health Care Co. Ltd -

Orig-
Appasamy AA 6120 India

64 4229420696700 MALLET, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400104 Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- KLS martin 23-216-01-07 Germany

64 4229420696700 MALLET, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400195
Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -

Orig-
Rudolf RU 5811-23 Germany

65 4229420691700 FORCEPS, BLAKESLEY, 4.2MM, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400104 Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- KLS martin 37-255-03-07 Germany

66 4229420701800 FORCEPS, ADENOID, WRIGHT, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

67 4229420674200 STERILIZATION TRAY SET, ORBITAL, 13 PCS, FOR ORBITAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400141 Al Basar For Medical Supplies -Orig- EJANACH J4724 Italy

68 4229420700800 FORCEPS, TISSUE SERRATED, FOR SUB-TENON SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400084
Saudi Service & Health Care Co. Ltd -

Orig-
Appasamy AA 3470 India

68 4229420700800 FORCEPS, TISSUE SERRATED, FOR SUB-TENON SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400083
AL AMIN MEDICAL INSTRUMENT Co. 

Ltd. -Orig-
A1 Medical F-4180 Germany

69 4229420691800 SCISSORS, BLUNT WESCOTT, FOR SUB-TENON SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
09.104.11 Germany

70 4229420657700
SPECULUM, FOR EYE, BARRAQUER, WIRE LID, LARGE, FOR SUB-TENON 

SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

71 4229420676300
CANNULA, FLAT CURVED 1.10 X 25 MM TIP (19G X1 IN), FOR SUB-TENON 

SURGERY
EA ITIMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

72 4229420700000 STERILIZATION TRAY, FOR 4 INST, FOR SUB-TENON SURGERY EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

73 4229420655200
KNIFE, CRYSTAL SCLERECTOMY (RUBY BLADE), FOR DEEP SCLEROTOMY 

SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

74 4229420692000
CANNULA, BECHETOILLE, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR DEEP SCLEROTOMY 

SURGERY
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

75 4229420688100
TOWEL CLAMP, NON-PERFORATING BLUNT JAW TIP, WITH A LARGER 

SURFACE AREA TO PREVENT PENETRATING DRAPES DURING A SURGICAL 
PROCEDURE, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR OCULOPLASTY SURGERY

EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

76 4229420660700 DESMARRES, SMALL, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR OCULOPLASTIC SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 17-05146-10 Pakistan

77 4229420690500 FORCEPS, ADSON BROWN, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR OCULOPLASTIC SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
10.188.12 Germany

78 4229420695100 DIRECTOR, FOR GROOVE, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR DCR SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 18-06024-14 Pakistan

78 4229420695100 DIRECTOR, FOR GROOVE, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR DCR SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
EPSILON EC-5-5331-15 USA

79 4229452200400 BALLOON CATHETER, LACRIMAL, FOR DCR, ASSORTED SIZES, STERILE EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

80 4229540201700
MARKER, PAD,FOR OPHTHALMIC SURGERY, TO BE USED WITH DELICATE 

INSTRUMENT, DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400632 LIFE CARE EST FOR TRADING -Orig- HURRICANE MEDICAL 7303 USA

81 4231221000000
MARKER, SURGICAL, ULTRA FINE TIP, INDIVIDUALLY PACKAGED WITH 1 

WATERPROOF RULER FOR OPHTHALMIC SURGERY, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

VISCOT 1402-100 USA

82 4229420632200 MARKER, OPTIC ZONE, ASSORTED SIZES, WITH CROSS HAIRS, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 30-10532-06 Pakistan

83 4229420634700
DRAPE, INCISE DRAPE, TRANSPARENT, THIN LIGHT FILM, FOR OPHTHALMIC 

PEDIATRIC SURGERY, SIZE 45 X 60 CM (+/- 5 CM), ADHESIVE FROM ONE 
SITE 45 X 3-4 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400195
Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -

Orig-
SIDAPHARM 20055 Greece

83 4229420634700
DRAPE, INCISE DRAPE, TRANSPARENT, THIN LIGHT FILM, FOR OPHTHALMIC 

PEDIATRIC SURGERY, SIZE 45 X 60 CM (+/- 5 CM), ADHESIVE FROM ONE 
SITE 45 X 3-4 CM, DISPOSABLE, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400695
Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -

Orig-
VISION SV1020 I China

84 4229420665300
TOWEL CLIPS, NON-SHARP, BIG SERRATED TIP, CURVED NON-SHARP 

TOWEL FORCEPS, 4 INCH LENGTH, SURGICAL GRADE, STAINLESS STEEL, 
FOR BUCKLE SURGERY #2

EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 16-04828-14 Pakistan

85 4229420688200
TOWEL CLAMP, NON-PERFORATING BLUNT JAW TIP WITH A LARGER 

SURFACE AREA TO PREVENT PENETRATING DRAPES DURING A SURGICAL 
PROCEDURE, STAINLESS STEEL

EA ITEMIZED 400038
Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -

Orig-
DIMEDA Instrumente 

GmbH
14.123.11 Germany
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86 4229420625100 IRIS SUTURE INSTRUMENT SET, 25 G, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

87 4229420630200 KNIFE CRESCENT, SIZE 1.75MM, BEVEL UP, ANGLED, STERILE EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

88 4229454500400 KNIFE, CRESCENT, 2.25 MM, ANGLED, BEVEL UP, DISPOSABLE, STERILE EA ITEMIZED 400230
Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 

Medical -Orig-
Shah CRU-22 India

88 4229454500400 KNIFE, CRESCENT, 2.25 MM, ANGLED, BEVEL UP, DISPOSABLE, STERILE EA ITEMIZED 400083
AL AMIN MEDICAL INSTRUMENT Co. 

Ltd. -Orig-
SURGILAP SCU22 Switzerland

89 4229350401500 "CANNULA, OPHTHALMIC, 27GA, 60 DEG, REVISION PICK, STERILE" PC ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
EAGLE LABS 178-27 USA

90 4229350105000
CANNULA, 27 G, NUCLEUS HYDRODISSECTION, BEVELED TIP ANGLED, 8 

MM, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400243

Experts Medical Supplies Company -
Orig-

Surgistar 125158 USA

90 4229350105000
CANNULA, 27 G, NUCLEUS HYDRODISSECTION, BEVELED TIP ANGLED, 8 

MM, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400230

Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 
Medical -Orig-

Anodyne 7006 USA

91 4229420650600
CANNULA, 27 GAUGE, BEND 1.57MM, HYDRODISSECTION AKAHOSHI 

STYLE, BEVELED TIP, TAPERED DESIGN, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

92 4229450802000 CANNULA, INFUSION, CHAMBER MAINTAINERS, 23G, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED 400083
AL AMIN MEDICAL INSTRUMENT Co. 

Ltd. -Orig-
A1 Medical L-0990 Germany

92 4229450802000 CANNULA, INFUSION, CHAMBER MAINTAINERS, 23G, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
EPSILON EEC-179-23G USA

93 4229350401000
CANNULA, CAPSULE POLISHING KRATZ, 0.80 X 22MM (21G X 7/8 IN), 

DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400230

Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 
Medical -Orig-

Anodyne 6000 USA

93 4229350401000
CANNULA, CAPSULE POLISHING KRATZ, 0.80 X 22MM (21G X 7/8 IN), 

DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400632 LIFE CARE EST FOR TRADING -Orig- HURRICANE MEDICAL 6121 USA

94 4229450800700 CANNULA, OLIVE TIP POLISHER 0.60 X 25MM (23G X1 IN) EA ITEMIZED 400230
Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 

Medical -Orig-
Anodyne 8501S USA

94 4229450800700 CANNULA, OLIVE TIP POLISHER 0.60 X 25MM (23G X1 IN) EA ITEMIZED 400243
Experts Medical Supplies Company -

Orig-
Surgistar 171589 USA

95 4229350400300 CANNULA, BISHOP HARMON 1.1 X 25MM (19G X1 IN) EA ITEMIZED 400632 LIFE CARE EST FOR TRADING -Orig- HURRICANE MEDICAL 2219 USA

96 4229350400500
CANNULA, IRRIGATION, LINDSTROM, 0.5 X 22 MM (25G X 7/8IN), 

DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400632 LIFE CARE EST FOR TRADING -Orig- HURRICANE MEDICAL 7225 USA

96 4229350400500
CANNULA, IRRIGATION, LINDSTROM, 0.5 X 22 MM (25G X 7/8IN), 

DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400243

Experts Medical Supplies Company -
Orig-

Surgistar 205250 USA

97 4229350402100
CANNULA, VISCOUS FLUID INJECTION CANNULA, 7MM THIN WALL 

POLYIMIDE TIP 23 GAUGE, 0.6MM, DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400141 Al Basar For Medical Supplies -Orig- DORC 1272.VFI06 Netherlands

98 4229180205200
"MICROFORCEPS, SURGICAL, 20GA, 0.9MM, ILM, ECKARDT END GRIPPING, 

STERILE"
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

99 4229420665600 FORCEPS, BOCKS, WITHOUT TEETH, FOR SUTURE REMOVAL SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400695
Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -

Orig-
STEPHENS INSTRUMENS S5-1550 USA

100 4229420691900 FORCEPS, BORES FIXATION, CURVED, FOR RK INSTRUMENTS SURGERY EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 30-10853-10 Pakistan

101 4229420650200
FORCEPS, ILM, DESIGNED TO SUPPORT ATRAUMATIC ILM PEEL INITIATION, 
SHARKSKIN OR EQUIVALENT, ASSORTED SIZES AS PER HOSPITAL REQUEST, 

DISPOSABLE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

102 4229450900100
FORCEPS, CAPSULORHEXIS, CURVED, CYSTOTOME TIP, 12 MM, LONG 

BEND, FLAT HANDLE. OVERALL LENGTH 100 MM, DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400695

Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -
Orig-

VISION DS500-5084 Pakistan

103 4229516000200
FORCEPS, TYING, CURVED, 9 MM TYING PLATFORM, FLAT HANDLE. 

OVERALL LENGTH 100 MM. DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

104 4229180253000
FORCEPS, MICRO INCISION, CAPSULORHEXIS, CURVED, CYSTOTOME TIP, 

14.5 MM LONG BEND, FLAT CROSS ACTION HANDLE. LENGTH 86 MM. FIT 
IN 1.8 MM INCISION

EA ITEMIZED 400695
Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -

Orig-
BHT CO. IF-3003 China

104 4229180253000
FORCEPS, MICRO INCISION, CAPSULORHEXIS, CURVED, CYSTOTOME TIP, 

14.5 MM LONG BEND, FLAT CROSS ACTION HANDLE. LENGTH 86 MM. FIT 
IN 1.8 MM INCISION

EA ITEMIZED 400239 First Gulf Company -Orig- RUMEX 4-0395 USA

105 4229450900300 NEEDLE, ILM, MICRO PICK, 25 GAUGE, DISPOSABLE EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

106 4229420704100
NEEDLE, 58 MM LONG WITH ULTRA SHARP TIP WITH STRIP, STRIP LENGTH 

150 MM, THICKNESS 0.35 MM, WIDTH SIZE 2 TO 3 MM, EYELID PTOSIS 
SURGERY, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 30-10401-06 Pakistan

107 4229420666000
NEEDLE HOLDER, STRAIGHT, WITHOUT LOCK, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR 

MUSCLE SURGERY #1
EA ITEMIZED 400038

Farouk Maamon Tamer & Company -
Orig-

DIMEDA Instrumente 
GmbH

24.638.18 Germany

107 4229420666000
NEEDLE HOLDER, STRAIGHT, WITHOUT LOCK, STAINLESS STEEL, FOR 

MUSCLE SURGERY #1
EA ITEMIZED 400084

Saudi Service & Health Care Co. Ltd -
Orig-

Appasamy AA 5145 India

108 4229420611800
BLADE, RECIPIENT AND DONOR, TREPHINE, CONTROLLED DEPTH CORNEAL, 

VACUUM, DIFFERENT SIZE RANGES (6MM TO 9MM) ACCORDING TO 
SURGEON'S REQUEST, STERILE

EA ITEMIZED 400083
AL AMIN MEDICAL INSTRUMENT Co. 

Ltd. -Orig-
MORIA 17202D France
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109 4229420661100
SPATULA AND NAGAHARA CHOPPER, DOUBLE END, KOCH, STAINLESS 

STEEL, REUSABLE
EA ITIMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

110 4229420623500 INJECTOR, ICL, TYPE REQUESTED AS PER REQUIRED EA ITEMIZED 400462
Medicals International Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
STAAR Surgical AG MSI-PF Switzerland

111 4229420668400
SCISSORS, DE WECKEER, BLUNT TIPS. 8MM FROM BEND TO TIP. OVERALL 

LENGTH: 64MM, 2.52 INCHES. STAINLESS STEEL, REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400141 Al Basar For Medical Supplies -Orig- EJANACH J1402 Italy

112 4229350402500
HANDPIECE, FOR IRRIGATION/ASPIRATION, COAXIAL, FITS 2.2MM 

INCISION, CURVED TIP 45 DEGREE, COMPATIBLE WITH THE 
COMMERCIALLY AVAILABLE MACHINES, DISPOSABLE

EA ITEMIZED 400695
Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -

Orig-
MEDICEL SMS355P Switzerland

113 4229350402600
HANDPIECE, FOR IRRIGATION/ASPIRATION, COAXIAL, (19G TO 21G), FITS 

2.2MM INCISION, STRAIGHT TIP, COMPATIBLE WITH THE COMMERCIALLY 
AVAILABLE MACHINES, DISPOSABLE

EA ITEMIZED 400195
Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -

Orig-
Bausch+Lomb 85912S USA

114 4229420623200
HONAN BALLOON, INTRAOCULAR PRESSURE REDUCER WITH VALVE, 

REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400695

Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -
Orig-

RELNGENUITY INC 2055 USA

115 4229452300000
GLUE, SYNESTHETIC CYANOACRYLATE, FOR OPHTHALMIC USE, BLUE, 0.5 

AMPOULE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

116 4229420703900
LANDERS, OCULAR, WIDE FIELD TEMPORARY KERATOPROSTHESIS, SUTURE 

HOLES, ASSORTED SIZES, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400695

Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -
Orig-

MADHU
MIPL/D6/7.5 OR

MIPL/D6/9.0
India

117 4229452200600 TREPHINE, LACRIMAL, ULTRA SHARP MICRO 21 G X 1.5 IN, SINGLE USE EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 30-10400-04 Pakistan

118 4229451202500 "TEMPORARY KERATOPROSTHESIS , DISPOSABLE, AS PER SIZE REQUIRED" EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

119 4229550505200
COMPLETE CORNEAL RING, FOR KERATOCONUS PATIENTS, THICKNESS AS 

PER REQUIRED
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

120 4229420634500 OCULAR BUTTON, CLEAR, SIZE 13MM, PUPIL SIZE 3MM, NON-STERILE EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
Oculo-Plastik Inc FC-P Canada

121 4229550506600 ASYMMETRICAL TIRE (SCLERAL BUCKLE) 7.0 MM, 2.5 MM GROOVE EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
FCI S5.2290 France

121 4229550506600 ASYMMETRICAL TIRE (SCLERAL BUCKLE) 7.0 MM, 2.5 MM GROOVE EA ITEMIZED 400230
Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 

Medical -Orig-
Labtican S2999 USA

122 4229550501800 ASYMMETRICAL TIRE (SCLERAL BUCKLE) 8.5 MM, 2.5 MM GROOVE EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

123 4229550502900 CONCAVE TIRE 7.0MM, 2.5MM GROOVE EA ITIMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

124 4229550501900 CONCAVE TIRE 9.0MM, 2.5MM GROOVE EA ITEMIZED 401135
Accurate wave trading establishment -

Orig-
FCI S5.2330 France

124 4229550501900 CONCAVE TIRE 9.0MM, 2.5MM GROOVE EA ITEMIZED 400230
Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 

Medical -Orig-
Labtican S2991 USA

125 4229420620500
FLAT BLACK ACRYLIC PAINTING DISKS, SIZE 13.00 MM, THICKNESS OF 

0.5MM
EA ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

Oculo-Plastik Inc BAPD13 Canada

126 4229420625500 IOL GLIDE SHEETS, FICHMAN STYLE, STERILE EA ITEMIZED 400695
Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -

Orig-
MADHU MIPL/D5 India

127 4229420619100
DRESSING, EYE SHIELD, SKIN-FRIENDLY POLYACRYLATE ADHESIVE, CLEAR 

PLASTIC ROUND DISC, INFANT SIZE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

128 4618180301000
EYE SHIELD, PLASTIC, PEDIATRIC SIZE, CLEAR, WITH HOLES, STERILE, 

INDIVIDUALLY PACKED
EA ITEMIZED 400695

Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -
Orig-

VISION MV-02 India

128 4618180301000
EYE SHIELD, PLASTIC, PEDIATRIC SIZE, CLEAR, WITH HOLES, STERILE, 

INDIVIDUALLY PACKED
EA ITEMIZED 400239 First Gulf Company -Orig- BVI 581708 USA

129 4229453904800 EYE SHIELD, WITH HOLES, ADHESIVE EDGE, SIZE AS PER REQUEST EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

130 4229451202300 DOME, CONFORMER, ACRYLIC, CLEAR, ASSORTED SIZES, NON-STERILE EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

131 4214290100100
"GLASSES, MAXIMIZE THE SIZE OF DISTANT OBJECTS, EASY-TO-FIT, 

BINOCULAR, TELESCOPIC DISTANCE SYSTEM"
EA ITEMIZED 400462

Medicals International Saudi Arabia -
Orig-

Ocutech, Inc. A7022.5 USA

132 4111171300400 DIGITAL MAGNIFYING GLASS WITH LIGHT EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED
NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

133 4229420620700
COVER, FOR FOCUS KNOB, SILICONE, COMPATIBLE WITH HOSPITAL 

MICROSCOPE, PACK OF 6 PIECES, REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED DUPLICATED

134 4218308500200
TIP COVER, COMPATIBLE WITH HAND HELD TONO-PEN TONOMETERS, 

INDIVIDUALLY PACKED, SANITIZED, DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400230

Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 
Medical -Orig-

Reichert 230651 USA

135 4218340300200
"FUNDUS VIEWING SYSTEMS, CARL ZEISS RESIGHT 700 OR ANY 

EQUIVALENT, DIFFERENT VIEW – BETWEEN WIDE FIELD AND HIGH 
MAGNIFICATION, REUSABLE"

EA ITEMIZED 400085 Gulf Medical CO. LTD. -Orig- CARL Zeiss 30RES700 Germany

136 4229420670000
BURR, BATTERY POWERED, HANDHELD, OPHTHALMIC, WITH 

EXCHANGEABLE TIPS, REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400695

Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -
Orig-

STEPHENS INSTRUMENS S2-1176 + S2-1179 USA
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137 4229510401000
CAUTERY, ELECTROSURGICAL HAND HELD BATTERY OPERATED, LOW 

TEMPERATURE, WITH VARIETY OF FINE TIP STYLES, DISPOSABLE, STERILE
PC ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

KIRWAN 41-6120 USA

138 4229510401700
BIPOLAR, ERASER, HEMOSTATIC, OPHTHALMIC, STRAIGHT POINTED, 

COMPATIBLE WITH THE HOSPITAL MACHINE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400695

Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -
Orig-

KIRWAN 14-5000 USA

139 4229510400900
ERASER, HEMOSTATIC, OPHTHALMIC, CURVED, COMPATIBLE WITH THE 

HOSPITAL MACHINE, STERILE
PC ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

KIRWAN 14-5002 USA

140 4229516002000
BIPOLAR, BRUSH, STRAIGHT, 18 GAUGE WITH CABLE, COMPATIBLE WITH 

HOSPITAL MACHINE, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

141 4229420618700
ELECTRODE, BENDABLE, REGULAR NEEDLE, 3/8 INCH, FOR ELLMAN 

CAUTERY, STERILE
EA ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION

NO 
QUOTATION

142 4229420632300
FORCEPS, BIPOLAR, ANGLED SHAFTS, INSULATED, NON-STICK TIP, 

REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400104 Al-Jeel Medical & Trading Co. Ltd -Orig- KLS martin 80-983-12-04 Germany

143 4229680303600
FORCEPS, ADSON, BIPOLAR, STRAIGHT, 1.0MM, WIDE, INSULATED 

HANDLE, OVERALL LENGTH: 127MM, REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400695

Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -
Orig-

KIRWAN 10-3015 USA

143 4229680303600
FORCEPS, ADSON, BIPOLAR, STRAIGHT, 1.0MM, WIDE, INSULATED 

HANDLE, OVERALL LENGTH: 127MM, REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

KIRWAN 10-3415AU USA

144 4229420652800 AMO VISX EXCIMER LASER COMPATIBLE PREMIX GAS EA ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION

145 4229420609400 AMO VISX EXCIMER LASER COMPATIBLE HELIUM GAS EA ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION

146 4229420651200 AMO VISX EXCIMER LASER COMPATIBLE STANDARD TREATMENT CARD EA ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION

147 4229450002900 AMO VISX EXCIMER LASER COMPATIBLE CUSTOMIZED TREATMENT CARD EA ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION

148 4229516301500 AMO VISX EXCIMER LASER COMPATIBLE CALIBRATION CARDS/PLATES PC ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION

149 4229420702200
DRY EYE TREATMENT, ACTIVATION CARD, COMPATIBLE WITH INTENSE 

PULSED LIGHT (IPL) WITH ALL NEEDED DISPOSABLES
EA ITEMIZED 400239 First Gulf Company -Orig- QUANTEL MEDICAL PEBX0004 France

149 4229420702200
DRY EYE TREATMENT, ACTIVATION CARD, COMPATIBLE WITH INTENSE 

PULSED LIGHT (IPL) WITH ALL NEEDED DISPOSABLES
EA ITEMIZED 400422 Al-Riyadh Medical Services -Orig- E-SWIN ME0000010292 France

150 4229420702100
DRY EYE TREATMENT, COMPATIBLE WITH LIPIFLOW, WITH ALL NEEDED 

DISPOSABLES
EA ITEMIZED 400019 Abdulrehman Algosaibi G.T.C -Orig- TearScience, Inc REF-221090 USA

151 4229498000200
ENDO OPTIC, LASER, CORD MACHINE, ASSORTED GAUGES, STRAIGHT, 

REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400239 First Gulf Company -Orig- BVI OME200SMAHRXA USA

152 4229498000000
ENDO OPTIC, LASER, CORD MACHINE, ASSORTED GAUGES, CURVED, 

REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400239 First Gulf Company -Orig- BVI OME200SMAHRXVA USA

153 4218301900100
PROBE, ENDOILLUMINATION, STRAIGHT, 23 GAUGE, RFID SMOOTH 

ROUNDED DISTAL TIP, STERILE SINGLE USE
EA ITEMIZED 400239 First Gulf Company -Orig- BVI LF23.D01 USA

154 4229516302600
PROBE, ENDOLASER, FOR QUANTAL MACHINE, 23 GAUGE, CURVED, 

ILLUMINATED
EA ITIMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

155 4229498000100
ILLUMINATED ENDOLASER PROBE CURVED, 27 GAUGE, FOR IRIDEX 

MACHINE, DISPOSABLE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

156 4229516333700
LASERPROBE, 23 GAUGE, DIRECTIONAL, COMPATIBLE WITH DORC 

CONNECTOR, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

FCI S9.1325.23 France

156 4229516333700
LASERPROBE, 23 GAUGE, DIRECTIONAL, COMPATIBLE WITH DORC 

CONNECTOR, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400239 First Gulf Company -Orig- BVI LP23.D04 USA

156 4229516333700
LASERPROBE, 23 GAUGE, DIRECTIONAL, COMPATIBLE WITH DORC 

CONNECTOR, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400141 Al Basar For Medical Supplies -Orig- DORC 7223.DORC Netherlands

157 4229516333800
LASERPROBE, 25 GAUGE, DIRECTIONAL, COMPATIBLE WITH DORC 

CONNECTOR, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

FCI S9.1325.25 France

157 4229516333800
LASERPROBE, 25 GAUGE, DIRECTIONAL, COMPATIBLE WITH DORC 

CONNECTOR, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400239 First Gulf Company -Orig- BVI LP25.D04 USA

157 4229516333800
LASERPROBE, 25 GAUGE, DIRECTIONAL, COMPATIBLE WITH DORC 

CONNECTOR, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400141 Al Basar For Medical Supplies -Orig- DORC

7225.DORC -
7625.DORC

Netherlands

158 4229516333600
ILLUMINATED LASERPROBE, 23 GAUGE, STEPPED, FLEXIBLE CURVED, DORC 

CONNECTOR, WITH ILLUMINATED CONNECTOR, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400141 Al Basar For Medical Supplies -Orig- DORC 7510.DORC Netherlands

159 4218301900200
ILLUMINATOR, SAPPHIRE, WIDE ANGLE, 23GAUGE, COMPATIBLE WITH 

HOSPITAL MACHINE, STERILE SINGLE USE
EA ITEMIZED 400243

Experts Medical Supplies Company -
Orig-

Aktive AK-0423/A Italy

160 4229516302900
PROBE, ENDOLASER, 23GA, STRAIGHT, COMPATIBLE, WITH PUREPOINT 

MACHINE
EA ITEMIZED 401135

Accurate wave trading establishment -
Orig-

FCI S9.1002.23 France

161 4229420652700 DEVICE, CAPSULOTOMY, COMPATIBLE WITH ZEPTO MACHINE, DISPOSABLE EA ITEMIZED 400195
Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -

Orig-
Zepto ZEPTO-H USA

162 4218308500100
SENSOR, FOR MEMBRANE, AND TIP ASSEMBLY, COMPATIBLE FOR 

RATCHET 30 PNEUMATONOMETER
EA ITEMIZED 400230

Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 
Medical -Orig-

Reichert 230678 USA
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163 4229420616700
DEHYDRATED TRIPLE THICKNESS 150 MICRONS AMNIOTIC MEMBRANE 

FOR TRANSPLANT, FOR GLAUCOMA, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 401082 Miracle Medical LLC -Orig-

BIOGENTEK LIFESCIENCE 
PVT LTD

AMNIOTEK-G India

163 4229420616700
DEHYDRATED TRIPLE THICKNESS 150 MICRONS AMNIOTIC MEMBRANE 

FOR TRANSPLANT, FOR GLAUCOMA, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400230

Mohamed Abd Ellatef Basha For 
Medical -Orig-

Labtican Amniotek -G USA

164 4214291800500 "FILTER CLIPS FOR LOW VISION AID POWER SCF60, REUSABLE" EA ITEMIZED 400462
Medicals International Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
Eschenbach Optik GmbH 1662527P Germany

165 4214291800600 "FILTER CLIPS FOR LOW VISION AID POWER SCF80, REUSABLE" EA ITEMIZED 400462
Medicals International Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
Eschenbach Optik GmbH 1662511P Germany

166 4214291800700 "FILTER CLIPS FOR LOW VISION AID POWER SCF90, REUSABLE" EA ITEMIZED 400462
Medicals International Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
Eschenbach Optik GmbH 1662550 Germany

167 4214291800200 "FILTER CLIPS FOR LOW VISION AID POWER SCF540, REUSABLE" EA ITEMIZED 400462
Medicals International Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
Eschenbach Optik GmbH 1662511 Germany

168 4214291800300 "FILTER CLIPS FOR LOW VISION AID POWER SCF560, REUSABLE" EA ITEMIZED 400462
Medicals International Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
Eschenbach Optik GmbH 1662527 Germany

169 4214291800400 "FILTER CLIPS FOR LOW VISION AID POWER SCF580, REUSABLE" EA ITEMIZED 400462
Medicals International Saudi Arabia -

Orig-
Eschenbach Optik GmbH 1662550P Germany

170 4229420676600 SUCTION TIP, SIZE 7, WITH STYLET, FOR OPHTHALMIC, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 12-01180-07 Pakistan

171 4229420676700 SUCTION TIP, SIZE 8, WITH STYLET, FOR OPHTHALMIC, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 12-01180-08 Pakistan

172 4229420676500 SUCTION TIP, SIZE 10, WITH STYLET, FOR OPHTHALMIC, REUSABLE EA ITEMIZED 400020
AbdulRauf Ibrahim Batterjee & Bros. -

Orig-
Instrumed (Pvt.) Ltd. 12-01206-30 Pakistan

173 4229420702900
PACK, ALL TIPS WITH ACCESSORIES, COMPATIBLE WITH STELLARIS PHACO 

HANDPIECE MACHINE, STERILE
EA ITIMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS

174 4111173600100
KIT, CAPS, HANDLE AND KNOBS COVER, SILICONE, FOR MICROSCOPE ZEISS 

LUMERA 700, REUSABLE
EA ITEMIZED 400085 Gulf Medical CO. LTD. -Orig- CARL Zeiss 60ACBSET Germany

175 4229516002200
PACK, VITRECTOMY, STELLARIS ELITE POSTERIOR WITH AIR FORCE 

INFUSION (AFI), 23 GAUGE, WITH FULL ACCESSORIES, STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400195

Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -
Orig-

Bausch+Lomb BL5523WVX USA

176 4229420651600 PACK, FRAGMENTATION, FOR STELLARIS MACHINE, STERILE EA ITEMIZED 400195
Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -

Orig-
Bausch+Lomb BL5277 USA

177 5124113900200 KIT : SILICON OIL INJECTION FOR STERALLIS MACHINE (DIFFERENT TIPS) KIT ITEMIZED 400083
AL AMIN MEDICAL INSTRUMENT Co. 

Ltd. -Orig-
ALCHMIA ECT 002-00 Italy

178 4229420600800
KIT: RETINOPATHY OF PREMATURITY (ROP) EXAMINATION KIT, NEONATAL 

OPHTHALMIC SPECULUM AND DEPRESSOR, PEEL-PACK, STERILE, SINGLE-
USE

KIT ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION

179 4229516000000
BAG, FOR FLUID COLLECTION, WITH WICK, 10CM X 15CM (+ / - 2CM), 

(100CC CAPACITY), ADHESIVE
EA ITEMIZED 400695

Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -
Orig-

VISION SV-04C Taiwan

180 4229454101400
CONTACT LENSES, SILICONE HYDROGEL SOFT TORIC, MUST HAVE ALL 

POWER RANGE +20.00DS TO -20.00DS DIAMETER 13.80MM TO 14.5MM 
BASE CURVE 8.30MM TO 8.90MM, REQUESTED AS PER REQUIRED

EA ITEMIZED 400422 Al-Riyadh Medical Services -Orig- NO7 CONTACT LENSES ME0000010291
United 

Kingdom

181 4229420615400

CONTACT LENSES, HYDROGEL SOFT MULTIFOCAL, SPHERE, MUST HAVE ALL 
POWER RANGE +20.00DS TO -20.00DS, CYLINDER POWER RANGE -0.75DS 

TO -2.25DS, AXIS 0 TO 180, ADD +0.75DS TO +3.00DS, DIAMETER 13.80MM 
TO 14.5MM BASE CURVE 8.30MM TO 8.90MM, REQUESTED AS PER 

REQUIRED

EA ITEMIZED 400422 Al-Riyadh Medical Services -Orig- NO7 CONTACT LENSES ME0000010291
United 

Kingdom

182 4229420615100

CONTACT LENSES, HYBRID, SPHERE, MUST HAVE ALL POWER RANGE 
+40.00DC TO -40.00DC, CYLINDER POWER TO -8.00DS, AXIS 0 TO 180, 
DIAMETER 14.20MM TO 15.3MM, BASE CURVE 7.00MM TO 9.00MM, 

REQUESTED AS PER REQUIRED

EA ITEMIZED 400422 Al-Riyadh Medical Services -Orig-
LABORATOIRE CONTACT 

SERVICE
ME0000010290 France

183 4229450400200 LENS, HOSKINS, SUTURE LYSIS LASER, WITH HANDLE, REUSABLE DZ ITEMIZED 400695
Smart Gulf Technology Establishment -

Orig-
OCULAR OHSA USA

184 4229420614000
SOLUTION, CLEANING, WITH TABLETS, FOR CONTACT LENSES AND OCULAR 
PROSTHESIS, PRESERVATIVE FREE, PROTEIN REMOVAL, 200ML ( +/- ) 50ML

EA ITEMIZED 400422 Al-Riyadh Medical Services -Orig-
AVIZOR EYE CARE 

SOLUTIONS
ME0000012285 Spain

185 4229420615000
SOLUTION, CLEANING, FOR CONTACT LENS, RGP, HARD AND SCLERAL 

CONTACT LENS 200-240 ML BOTTLE
EA ITEMIZED 400422 Al-Riyadh Medical Services -Orig-

AVIZOR EYE CARE 
SOLUTIONS

ME0000012285 Spain

186 4229420642400

SALINE UNIDOSE, PRESERVATIVE FREE, 5ML, SPECIALLY DESIGNED FOR 
RINSING, HYDRATING, DISINFECTING AND STORING ALL TYPES OF 

CONTACT LENSES, STERILE, ISOTONIC AND BUFFERED PH SOLUTION AND 
AQUEOUS SOLUTION

EA ITEMIZED 400422 Al-Riyadh Medical Services -Orig-
AVIZOR EYE CARE 

SOLUTIONS
ME0000012285 Spain

187 4229420703500 WIPE, FOR CLEANING OPTICAL LENS, SINGLE USE EA ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION

188 4618180600400 SPRAY, WITH TOWEL, FOR CLEANING OPTICAL LENS, 100-150 ML EA ITIMIZED NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION NO QUOTATION
NO 

QUOTATION
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TENDER NO. NPT0030/23
TENDER NAME: Ophthalmic Supplementary Tender

PRELIMINARY ANNOUNCEMENT

SN NUPCO Code       Item Description UOM Group / Itemized Vendor No Vendor Name Manufacturer Catalog No Country NUPCO REMARK

189 4231151800800 PAD, EYELID CLEANING, READY TO USE, DISPOSABLE, STERILE EA ITEMIZED 400065 Jamjoom Medicine Store Co. -Orig- THEA LABORATOIRES 12232 France

190 4229450002700
OIL, HEAVY SILICONE, HIGH DENSITY 1.02 - 1.06 G/CM, 10 ML SYRINGE, 

STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400085 Gulf Medical CO. LTD. -Orig- GEUDER G-80925 Germany

190 4229450002700
OIL, HEAVY SILICONE, HIGH DENSITY 1.02 - 1.06 G/CM, 10 ML SYRINGE, 

STERILE
EA ITEMIZED 400195

Omar Saeed Al-Amoudi Sons Co.(Osas -
Orig-

Bausch+Lomb VRL700 USA

191 4214150200200
COTTON SWAB, FOR OPHTHALMIC, DUAL HEAD / POINTED TIP AND 

ROUNDED TIP, 7.5 CM ( +/- 1 CM ), STERILE
EA ITEMIZED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED CANCELLED

NO BID MATCHED WITH THE 
REQUIRED SPECIFICATIONS
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