NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

VITAMIN E (TOCOPHEROL)

FINAL RESULT

1 5050151200500 INTRAVENOUS INJECTION 100 NO QUOTE
MG/ML AMPOULE
MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 2 G
2 5050160600000 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 50 ML NO QUOTE

PREMIXED BAG
MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 4 G
3 5050160600100 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 100 ML NO QUOTE
PREMIXED BAG
MANGANESE 0.1 MG/ML

4 5050160700000 INJECTION 10ML NO QUOTE

SAUDI
5 5050170100400 e PHARMACEUTICAL FRESENIUS KABI DIPEPTIVEN 20% 100ML
ML BOTTLE
COMPANY
CUSTODIOL HTK (HISTIDINE +
TRYPOTOPHAN + Abdulrehman Dr. Franz Kohler
6 >050170100700 KETOGLUTARATE) 1000 ML Algosaibi G.T.C. Chemie GmbH CUSTODIOL 1L
SOLUTION
CUSTODIOL HTK (HISTIDINE +
TRYPOTOPHAN + mena saudi medical
6 5050170100700 KETOGLUTARATE) 1000 ML co.ltd SALF S.p.A. SERVATOR H
SOLUTION
7 5050170101100 GLYCINE 1.5% 3000 ML FOR Pharmaceutical PHASR(';/:_?J?:CL)JLICAL GLYCINE 1.5% IRRIGATION
IRRIGATION BAG OR BOTTLE Solutions Industry L INDUSTRY LTD - PS| 3000ML BAG
3 5112230100400 CARDIOPLEGIC SOLUTION 1000 Arabian Health Care BAXTER CARDIOPLEGIC SOLUTION
ML BOTTLE OR BAG Supply Company HEALTHCARE S A 2B1462X
PLASMA EXPANDER MODIFIED
10 >113130600100 GELATIN INFUSION BAG 500 ML NO QUOTE
FEB 23, 2026 10f25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

DEXTRAN-40 10% SODIUM
11 5113230100000 CHLORIDE 0.9% INTRAVENOUS NO QUOTE
INFUSION 500 ML BOTTLE

FINAL RESULT

12 5114156600100 MAGNESIUM SULPHATE 50% Pharmaceutical PHASR(';/:_ﬁg_TgLICAL MAGNESIUM SULFATE 50%
INJECTION 50 ML VIAL Solutions Industry L INDUSTRY LTD - PS| 50 ML VIAL

SODIUM BICARBONATE 8.4% IN
13 5117150400200 50 ML PRE FILLED SYRINGE NO QUOTE

PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION SOD BICARB 8.4% 250ML
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI

SODIUM BICARBONATE 8.4% [1 Pharmaceutical

1 1171 11
4 >117150401100 MMOL/1 ML] 250 ML BOTTLE Solutions Industry L

0, =
15 5117150401200 SODIUM BICARBONATE 8.4% 10  CANCELLED - NO BID

ML SYRINGE ACCEPTED
SODIUM PHOSPHATE 3
16 5117162200300 MMOL/ML AS PHOSPHATE 10 NO QUOTE

TO 15 ML INJECTION
SODIUM PHOSPHATE (SODIUM
4 MEQ/ML + PHOSPHORUS 3
MMOL/ML) ] INJECTION, 5 ML
VIAL

17 5117162201800 NO QUOTE

FEB 23, 2026 20f25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

FEB 23, 2026
www.nupco.com

5117162800000

5117162800200

5117162801000

5118240100000

5118240100100

5118240300000

5119150900000

5119150900100

POTASSIUM PHOSPHATE 2
MMOL/ML INJECTION 10 TO 20
ML AMPOULE

POTASSIUM PHOSPHATE
(POTASSIUM 4.4 MMOL/ML +
PHOSPHATE 3 MMOL/ML) 5 TO
15 ML INJECTION
POTASSIUM PHOSPHATE 1.4
MMOL/ML AMPOULE

CALCIUM CHLORIDE DIHYDRATE
10% INJECTION 10 ML SYRINGE

CALCIUM CHLORIDE DIHYDRATE
10% INJECTION 10 ML VIAL OR
AMPOULE
CALCIUM GLUCONATE
MONOHYDRATE 10% INJECTION
10 ML AMPOULE

MANNITOL 20% IN 500 ML
GLASS BOTTLE

MANNITOL 25% IN 50 ML VIAL

CANCELLED - NO BID

ACCEPTED

CANCELLED - NO BID

ACCEPTED

NO QUOTE

SAUDI
PHARMACEUTICAL
COMPANY

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

NO QUOTE

MARTINDALE
PHARMA

PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI

3 of 25

CALCIUM CHLORIDE PFS

CALCIUM CHLORIDE 10%
10ML AMP

CALCIUM GLUCONATE 10%
10ML AMP

MANNITOL 20% 500ML GB
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

PHARMACEUTICAL
. .
26 5119150900200 MANN&‘X;;%;’F‘L@SO ML SOT:j;’::ff;ﬁg:' ) SOLUTION MANNITOL 20% 250ML GB
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
SORBITOL MANNITOL
27 5119150900300 IRRIGATION SOLUTION 540 NO QUOTE
MG/100 ML IN 3000 ML
DEXTROSE 5% INJECTION:
29 5119160100000 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500 CANC:(LZEEEIDDT'E'\E)O BID
ML PARTIALLY FILLED BAG
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.225%
E L
20 | 5119160100300 DEXTROSE 5%: INTRAVENOUS Pharmaceutical PHASR(';/'LGCTI SL'CA DEXTROSE 5% +0.225 NSS
INFUSION sogAlxéL BOTTLEOR  Solutions IndustryL "\ =0 o 500ML
DEXTROSE 5% (2.5 G/50 ML): o armaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL
31 5119160100400  INTRAVENOUS INFUSIONSOML (- 15Tmeee M8 SOLUTION DEXTROSE 5% 50ML BAG
BAG i/ INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
DEXTROSE 5% INJECTION: o armaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL
32 5119160100500 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 100 [ 18T 2He 1HE8 SOLUTION DEXTROSE 5% 100ML BAG
ML PARTIALLY FILLED BAG v INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
. .
33 5119160100600 DEXTIESSEIZ?\IA’S'(;\ILWEATOUS SOTSt?;T:T::l:LCtT ) SOLUTION DEXTROSE 50% 50ML VIAL
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
DEXTROSE 25% INJECTION: o armaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL
34 5119160100700 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 250 SOLUTION DEXTROSE 25% 250 BAG

FEB 23, 2026
WWwWWw.nupco.com

ML BOTTLE

Solutions Industry L

INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

DEXTROSE 10% INJECTION: Pharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL
35 5119160100800 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500 Solutions Industry L SOLUTION DEXTROSE 10% 500ML
ML BOTTLE OR BAG INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
DEXTROSE 5% INTRAVENOUS CANCELLED - NO BID
INFUSION 250 ML BOTTLE ACCEPTED
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.225%
DEXTROSE SOLUTION 10% IN CANCELLED - NO BID
250 ML BOTTLE OR BAG ACCEPTED
WITHOUT IV SET

DEXTROSE 50% INJECTION IN

FINAL RESULT

36 5119160100900

37 5119160101000

38 5119160101100 SYRINGE PRE-FILLED SYRINGE 50 NO QUOTE
ML
DEXTROSE 5% SODIUM
39 5119160101200 CHLORIDE 0.18% INTRAVENOUS Pharmaceutical PHA;I-\)/II-?E_I;ILOJLICAL Dextrose 5% 1/5 NS 250ml
INFUSION 250 ML BOTTLE OR Solutions Industry L INDUSTRY LTD - PSI BAG
BAG
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45%
E L
40 5119160101300 DEXTROSE SOLUTION 5% IN 250 Pharmaceutical PHASR(';/::TJ(_:I_KLJJLICA DEXTROSE 5% in 1/2 NS
ML BOTTLE OR BAG WITHOUT IV Solutions Industry L INDUSTRY LTD - PS| 250ML Bag
SET
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%
an 5119160101400 DEXTROSE 5% IN 250 ML Pharmaceutical PHASR(';/:_G(_::(L)JLICAL Dextrose 5% in NS 250ml
BOTTLE OR B?EGTWWHOUT \Y) Solutions Industry L INDUSTRY LTD - PS| Bag
PHARMACEUTICAL
. .
42 5119160101500 Dﬁﬁﬁ%fg;%’g'ﬂfg\éwﬁus SOT:E;T:IC::[:'SC;:' ) SOLUTION DEXTROSE 50% 500ML PB
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
FEB 23, 2026 5 of 25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

DEXTROSE 10% INJECTION: oharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL
43 5119160101600 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 250 [ A8/ m2He (e SOLUTION DEXTROSE 10% 250ml Bag
ML BOTTLE OR BAG Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45%
m | 5110160101700 DEXTROSE 10% INTRAVENOUS Pharmaceutical PHASRC';/'LGCT%L'CAL DEXTROSE 10% IN N.S 0.45%
INFUSION 250 MLBOTTLEOR  Solutions Industry L~ =0 250ML BAG
BAG
DEXTROSE 10% SODIUM
45 5119160101900  CHLORIDE 0.18% INTRAVENOUS NO QUOTE
INFUSION 250 ML BOTTLE
PHARMACEUTICAL
\ .
46 5119160102000 RENE s SAB\/Q/QTER 1000 ML So'::jg::lc:é‘jft‘:' ) SOLUTION DEXTROSE 5% 1000ML BAG
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.225%
47 5119160109100  DEXTROSE SOLUTION 5% IN 250 Pharmaceutical PHAE(';"L‘L\JCT%L'CAL DEXTROSE 5% in 1/4 NS
ML BOTTLE ORSI?\I_G WITHOUT IV Solutions Industry L INDUSTRY LTD - PSI 250ml Bag
DEXTROSE 70% INTRAVENOUS ~ CANCELLED - NO BID
CLOH | SRR 0D INFUSION 2000 ML BAG ACCEPTED
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45% : PHARMACEUTICAL .
49 5119160102500 DEXTROSE 5% INTRAVENOUS SOFI’:tai:::f:;jza' y SOLUTION DEXTI??)?)E)I\SAf g; 1/2Ns
INFUSION 1000 ML BAG ry INDUSTRY LTD - PSI g
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% . PHARMACEUTICAL .
50 5119160102600 DEXTROSE 5% INTRAVENOUS So'::j:::fj:ﬁ':tar' ) SOLUTION DEXTROS'\EAE g’ A'g ALY
INFUSION 1000 ML BAG Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.225% . PHARMACEUTICAL .
51 5119160102900 DEXTROSE 5% INTRAVENOUS Pharmaceutical SOLUTION DEXTROSE 5% IN 1/4 NS

FEB 23, 2026
WWwWWw.nupco.com

INFUSION 1000 ML BAG

Solutions Industry L

INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

52

53

54

55

56

56

57

58

58

FEB 23, 2026
WWwWWw.nupco.com

5119160104000

5119160200500

5119160200900

5119160201500

5119160201600

5119160201600

5119160201700

5119160201800

5119160201800

DEXTROSE 10% INJECTION
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 1000
ML BAG
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%
INJECTION 3 ML SYRINGE
BALANCED SALT SOLUTION PLUS
STERILE EYE SOLUTION 500 ML
BOTTLE
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%
INTRAVENOUS INJECTION 1000
ML BAG
SODIUM CHLORIDE 9 MG/ML
SOLUTION FOR PRE-FILLED
INJECTION POSIFLUSH
PARENTERAL 20 ML
SODIUM CHLORIDE 9 MG/ML
SOLUTION FOR PRE-FILLED
INJECTION POSIFLUSH
PARENTERAL 20 ML
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%
INJECTION 10 ML SYRINGE
BALANCED SALT STERILE
SOLUTION FOR IRRIGATION 500
ML BOTTLE OR BAG
PRESERVATIVE FREE
BALANCED SALT STERILE
SOLUTION FOR IRRIGATION 500
ML BOTTLE OR BAG
PRESERVATIVE FREE

CANCELLED - NO BID
ACCEPTED

CANCELLED - NO BID
ACCEPTED

NO QUOTE

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Gallop Trading
Company

Gallop Trading
Company

CANCELLED - NO BID
ACCEPTED

AlRazi pharmaceutical
industry

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI

AMSINO

AMSINO

ALRAZI PHARMA
INDUSTRIES
FACTORY COMPANY

PHARMACEUTICAL

SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI

7 of 25

Normal Saline 1000m| BAG

AMSafe 20 mL NaCl 0.9%

Sterile Field PFS

AMSafe 20mL NaCl0.9%

Sterile Pathway PFS

Balanced Salt Solution500ml

BALANCED SALT SOLUTION

500 ML
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

69

FEB 23, 2026
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5119160202200

5119160202300

5119160202400

5119160202500

5119160202600

5119160202900

5119160203000

5119160203400

5119160203500

5119160203700

SODIUM CHLORIDE 3%
INTRAVENOUS INJECTION 500
ML BOTTLE
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%
INTRAVENOUS INJECTION 250
ML BAG

SODIUM CHLORIDE SOLUTION
0.225% 500 ML BOTTLE OR BAG

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 1000
ML FOR IRRIGATION BAG

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 2000
ML FOR IRRIGATION BAG

SODIUM CHLORIDE 3%
INJECTION 10 ML AMPOULE

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45%
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500
ML BOTTLE OR BAG
SODIUM CHLORIDE 2.5
MEQ/ML (14.61%) INJECTION 50
ML VIAL
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 500 ML
IRRIGATION BOTTLE
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.45%
INTRAVENOUS INJECTION 1000
ML BAG

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

NO QUOTE

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI

PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
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Sodium Chloride 3% 500ml
PB

Normal Saline 250ml Bag

1/4 Normal Saline 500mI| PB

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%
FOR IRR 1000ml

NaCl 0.9% for Irrigation 2L
BAG

Sodium Chloride 3% 10ML
AMP

1/2 Normal Saline 500mI| PB
Sodium Chloride 14.61%

50ml Vial

1/2 Normal Saline 1000ml
Bag
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% IN 100

CANCELLED - NO BID

70 | 5115160204700 ML MINIBAG PLUS ACCEPTED
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% IN50  CANCELLED - NO BID
71| 5119160204800 ML MINIBAG PLUS ACCEPTED
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%
72 5119160205800 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 3000 NO QUOTE
ML BAG OR BOTTLE
PHARMACEUTICAL
. .
73 5119160206400 SSI[L)';JO'\: IC:RLI?;RA'T[:SS'%#L%O So':::é:‘jf:;ﬁft?' ) SOLUTION NACL 0.9% 1000ML IRRIG PB
Y- INDUSTRYLTD-PSI
0, H 0,
23 | 5119160206400 SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 1000 Arabian Health Care BAXTER SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%
ML FOR IRRIGATION BOTTLE Supply Company HEALTHCARE S A IRRIGATION
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9%
75 5119160207300 INJECTION 10 ML VIAL NO QUOTE
PRESERVATIVE FREE
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% . PHARMACEUTICAL .
76 5119160207400 INJECTION 5 ML VIAL So'::fg::f:;jza' : SOLUTION SOD'L'\JA'\C EHALI\OA';'ODSL%% >
PRESERVATIVE FREE ry INDUSTRY LTD - PSI ’
DEXTROSE 5 % IN 50 ML CANCELLED - NO BID
vy SRRl MINIBAG PLUS ACCEPTED
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 1000
78 5119160208100 ML FOR IRRIGATION BAG NO QUOTE
(STERILE CONTAINER SLUSH)
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% o armaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL
79 5119160208200 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500 SOLUTION Normal Saline 500ML BAG

FEB 23, 2026
WWwWWw.nupco.com

ML BAG

Solutions Industry L

INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

80

81

82

83

84

85

87

FEB 23, 2026
www.nupco.com

5119160209000

5119160209100

5119160209300

5119160209400

5119160210000

5119160300800

5119160301000

DEXTROSE 5% WATER
INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 25 ML
BAG
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% IN 25
ML PIGGY BAG

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% 3000
ML FOR IRRIGATION BAG

SODIUM CHLORIDE 4MEQ/ML
(23.4%) INJECTION 30 TO 50 ML

DEXTROSE 5% WITH SODIUM
CHLORIDE 0.45% WITH
POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 10 MEQ
INTRAVENOUS SOLUTION 500
ML BAG
MULTIVITAMINS (WATER
SOLUBLE) FOR PEDIATRIC 10 ML
FOR TPN

CENTERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 2000
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV
LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND SOYBEAN
OIL

Arabian Health Care
Supply Company

Arabian Health Care
Supply Company

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

Pharmaceutical
Solutions Industry L

NO QUOTE

Arabian Health Care
Supply Company

BAXTER
HEALTHCARE S A

BAXTER
HEALTHCARE S A
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
PHARMACEUTICAL
SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI

PHARMACEUTICAL

SOLUTION
INDUSTRY LTD - PSI

BAXTER
HEALTHCARE S A

10 of 25

DEX 5% INJ USP 25ML BAG
SOD CHL INJ 0.9% IN 25 ML
MINI
NaCl 0.9% for Irrigation 3L
BAG

SODIUM CHLORIDE 23.4%
50ml VIAL

DEX 5% IN 1/2 NS + 0.15%
KCL 500ml

OLIMEL N9SE-2000ML
ENGLISH
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

CENTERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 500
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES Arabian Health Care BAXTER

88 >119160301100 DEXTROSE IV LIPIDS OLIVE OIL Supply Company HEALTHCARE S A NUMETA G16%E- 500ML

AND SOYBEAN OIL FOR
PEDIATRIC

PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1206

FINAL RESULT

SAUDI
ML BAG WITH IV LIPIDS FISH SMOFKABIVEN PERIPHERAL
89 5119160301200 lovt IV pieedivey PHA(I?g/IS(;iLI:I'LICAL FRESENIUS 206 ML
TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE OIL
SOYBEAN OIL
PEIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1500 .
90 5119160301300 ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV A"Saub'a? "g::haiare e AI{BTA|-|XCT AERRE oA PERIOLIMEL N4E - 1.5 L
LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND SOYBEAN pply Lompany
oIL
PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1904 w
ML BAG WITH IV LIPIDS FISH SMOFKABIVEN PERIPHERAL
91 5119160301400 ensen wirn i U B PHAE(I\)/IIGIS'IZ‘LJI\'(ICAL FRESENIUS 1504 ML
TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE OIL
SOYBEAN OIL
PERIPHERAL PARENTERAL
NUTRITION WITH ELECTROLYTES
92 5119160301500 =00 ML BAG OR BOTTLE FOR NO QUOTE
PEDIATRIC
11 of 25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

93

94

95

96

FEB 23, 2026
www.nupco.com

5119160334700

5119160334800

5119160334900

5119160335000

CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1000
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES
DEXTROSE IV LIPIDS OLIVE OIL

AND SOYBEAN OIL FOR

PEDIATRIC

CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1012
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES
EXTRA NITROGEN AND IV LIPIDS
FISH BASED WITH MEDIUM
CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE
OIL SOYBEAN OIL

CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1250
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES

AND IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE
AND SOYBEAN OIL

CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1500
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV
LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND SOYBEAN
OIL

Arabian Health Care BAXTER NUMETA G19% 1000 ML
Supply Company HEALTHCARES A BAG
SAUDI

PHARMACEUTICAL FRESENIUS Sm'?:gég\\l/il(\)llEZXIARl_A

COMPANY

NO QUOTE

NO QUOTE

12 of 25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1518
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES SAUDI
97 5119160335100 EXTRA NITROGEN AND IV LIPIDS PHARMACEUTICAL FRESENIUS Smg:ggi:\\l/iglzx-ll—:f
FISH BASED WITH MEDIUM COMPANY

CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE
OIL SOYBEAN OIL
CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1875
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES
%8 5119160335200 AND IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH HIELnE
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE
AND SOYBEAN OIL
CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1970
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV CANCELLED - NO BID
LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH ACCEPTED
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE
AND OLIVE OIL SOYBEAN OIL

99 5119160335300

CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 2025
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES SAUDI
100 5119160335400 EXTRA NITROGEN IV LIPIDS FISH PHARMACEUTICAL FRESENIUS
BASED WITH MEDIUM CHAIN COMPANY
TRIGLYCERIDE AND OLIVE OIL
SOYBEAN OIL

SMOFKABIVEN EXTRA
NITROGEN 2025 ML

FEB 23, 2026 13 of 25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 2463
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV = CANCELLED - NO BID
LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH ACCEPTED
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE
AND OLIVE OIL SOYBEAN OIL
CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 300
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES Arabian Health Care BAXTER
102 >119160335600 DEXTROSE IV LIPIDS OLIVE OIL Supply Company HEALTHCARE S A NUMETA G13% 300 ML BAG
AND SOYBEAN OIL FOR
PEDIATRIC
CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 625
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES
103 5119160335700 AND IV LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH MO ELOE
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE
AND SOYBEAN OIL
CENTRAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 986 SAUDI
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV SMOFKABIVEN CENTRAL
104 5119160335800 LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH PHA(I?(I\)/ISE;[:;ICAL FRESENIUS 986 ML
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE
AND OLIVE OIL SOYBEAN OIL
PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1000
105 5119160335900 ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV NO QUOTE
LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND SOYBEAN
OIL

FINAL RESULT

101 5119160335500

FEB 23, 2026 14 of 25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 2000 .

106 5119160336000 ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV A';aub'a? "(';ar:haiare e ALBTA|-|XcT AERRE = PERIOLIMEL N4E 2000ML
LIPIDS OLIVE OIL AND SOYBEAN pply Lompany

OIL

FINAL RESULT

PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1250
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV
107 5119160336100 LIPIDS EISH BASED WITH NO QUOTE
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE

AND SOYBEAN OIL

PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1448

SAUDI
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV SMOFKABIVEN PERIPHERAL
108 5119160336200 LIPIDS EISH BASED WITH PHAEg:GEZiSCAL FRESENIUS 1448 ML

MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE
AND OLIVE OIL SOYBEAN OIL

PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER
PARENTERAL NUTRITION 1875
ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV
109 5119160336300 LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH NO QUOTE
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE

AND SOYBEAN OIL
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

PERIPHERAL THREE CHAMBER

PARENTERAL NUTRITION 2500

ML BAG WITH ELECTROLYTES IV

110 5119160336400 LIPIDS FISH BASED WITH NO QUOTE
MEDIUM CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDE
AND SOYBEAN OIL
RINGER LACTATE INTRAVENOUS . PHARMACEUTICAL
Pharmaceutical

111 5119160400100 INFUSION 500 ML BAG OR . SOLUTION RINGER LACTATE 500ML I.V
Solutions Industry L

FINAL RESULT

BOTTLE INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
RINGER LACTATE INTRAVENOUS Pharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL

112 5119160400200 INFUSION 1000 ML BAG OR Solutions Industry L SOLUTION RINGER LACTATE
BOTTLE H INDUSTRY LTD - PSI

STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION | AlRazi pharmaceutical L RAZREARMA

113 5119160500100 : INDUSTRIES WATER FOR INJECTION USP
10 ML AMPOULE industry b
. PHARMACEUTICAL
113 5119160500100 STER'LEl\S/GTLE:“;SgL'JTJEECT'ON SOT:t?;T:fs:l:'sct‘:' ) SOLUTION WATER FOR INJ 10ML
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PS|
. PHARMACEUTICAL
114 5119160500200 STEE'OLS mgiz FOORR;gJTETﬂ'ON SOT:E;T:?:;&':?' i SOLUTION WATER FOR INJ 500ML
ry INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
. PHARMACEUTICAL
115 5119160500300 WATER FOF;/:EF;'EQT'ON 1200 So'::j:::fj:ﬁ':tar' ) SOLUTION WATER IRRIG 1000ML BAG
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION Pharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL Water for Injection 1000ml
116 >119160500400 1000 ML BAG Solutions Industry L SOLUTION Ba
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI &
FEB 23, 2026 16 of 25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION CANCELLED - NO BID

LU 2000 ML BAG ACCEPTED
STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION Pharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL -\ \TER FOR INJECTION 50
118 | 5119160501000 50 ML VIAL Solutions Industry L SOLUTION ML VIAL
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
STERILE WATER FOR INJECTION Pharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL TR FOR INJECTION 5ML
O [ SRR REO AN 5 ML AMPOULE Solutions Industry L SO AMPOULE
ry INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
COPPER 0.4 MG/ML INJECTION
120 5119160600000 ot viad NO QUOTE
DEXTROSE 70% INTRAVENOUS
121 5119160700000 INFUSION 500 ML BAG OR NO QUOTE
BOTTLE
DEXTROSE 5% WATER
122 5119160700100  INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 50 ML NO QUOTE
VIAL
DEXTROSE 10% INJECTION 10
124 5119160700400 ML AMPOULE NO QUOTE
DEXTROSE 25 % INJECTION:
125 5119160700600 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500 NO QUOTE

FEB 23, 2026
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

SODIUM ACETATE 2 MEQ/ML

126 5119170300000 JECTION IN 20 ML VIAL NO QUOTE
PHARMACEUTICAL
. .
127 5119170401500 DE)I(L';(S;EOSNA’Z';'J EAALVBE/L\'(? us SoT:jg::f::ﬁ':tar' ) SOLUTION DEXTROSE 5% 250ML BAG
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
E L
DEXTROSE 5% RINGER LACTATE Pharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL - 1y 1R OSE 5% in RL 500ML
s LIS AT 500 ML BOTTLE Solutions Industry L sQtneh: PB
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
DEXTROSE 5% RINGER LACTATE Pharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL 1y R OSE 5% in RL 1000ml
129 | 5119170402100 1000 ML BAG OR BOTTLE Solutions Industry L SOLUTION BAG
¥ INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 2 AlRazi pharmaceutical ~ TRAZ PHARMA b o ASSIUM CHLORIDE 15%
£ SRR MEQ/ML INJECTION 10 ML industr INDUSTRIES INJ 10 ML
y FACTORY COMPANY
POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 2 Pharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL - o51UM CHLORIDE 15%
130 >119180200100 MEQ/ML INJECTION 10 ML Solutions Industry L B~ TToN 10ml Am
Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI P
DEXTROSE 5% WITH SODIUM
CHLORIDE 0.45% INTRAVENOUS
131 5119180200400 o e IoE 20 NO QUOTE
MEQ INFUSION 500 ML BAG
DEXTROSE 5% WITH SODIUM
CHLORIDE 0.45% WITH : PHARMACEUTICAL .
132 5119180200800  POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 20 MEQ SOT:S:::‘IC;:L:';?' ) SOLUTION KCL 200 E;QN'Z 1DELX >%
INTRAVENOUS SOLUTION 1000 Y INDUSTRY LTD - PSI 4270 .S
ML BAG
. PHARMACEUTICAL .
133 | 5119180201100 POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 2 Pharmaceutical COLUTION POT. CHLORIDE 15%

FEB 23, 2026
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 20
134 5119180201300 MMOL SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% NO QUOTE
100 ML PREMIXED BAG
POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 20
135 5119180201400 MMOL SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% NO QUOTE
250 ML PREMIXED BAG
POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 2
136 5119180202600 MEQ/ML SOLUTION FOR NO QUOTE
INJECTION 250 ML
POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 40

FINAL RESULT

137 5119180204000 MMOL + SODIUM CHLORIDE NO QUOTE
0.9% 500 ML BAG
POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 40
Arabian Health Care BAXTER SOD CHL 40 MEQ/L KCL
138 5119180204100 MMOL + SODIUM CHLORIDE Supply Company HEALTHCARE S A 0.9% 1L0.9%

0.9% 1000 ML BAG
POTASSIUM CHLORIDE 2
139 5119180205100 MEQ/ML (15%) INJECTION 5 ML NO QUOTE
VAIL
POTASSIUM ACETATE 3.93 G/20
ML (POTASSIUM 40 MMOL/20
ML) INJECTION: CONCENTRATED
20 ML VIAL
POTASSIUM ACETATE 2
141 5119180400300 MEQ/ML SOLUTION FOR NO QUOTE
INJECTION 20 ML
ARGININE HCL 10% INJECTION
142 5119190200000 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 300 NO QUOTE
ML

140 5119180400000 NO QUOTE
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

AMINO ACIDS 10% PARENTERAL SAUDI .
143 5119190200400  NUTRITION 100 ML BOTTLE FOR  PHARMACEUTICAL FRESENIUS AM'NOVEEO'I'\\'AFLANT L
NEONATE AND INFANT COMPANY
AMINO ACIDS 10% PARENTERAL .
143 5119190200400  NUTRITION 100 ML BOTTLE FOR Arsaub'a:‘ Féiar:haiare e AI{BTAHX(;I- ::E - PRIMENE 10% 250ML
NEONATE AND INFANT pply Lompany
E L
GLYCINE 1.5% 2000 ML FOR Pharmaceutical el GG T GLYCINE 1.5% Irrigation 2L
144 | 5119130200600 IRRIGATION BAG OR BOTTLE Solutions Industry L SOLUTION Ba
ry INDUSTRY LTD - PS| &
AMINO ACIDS 15% SAUDI
145 5119190200700 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 500 PHARMACEUTICAL FRESENIUS AMINOVEN 15% 500ML
ML BOTTLE FOR ADULT COMPANY
AMINO ACID 8% (HEPATAMINE) SAUDI .
146 5119190201200 INJECTION 500 ML BOTTLEOR ~ PHARMACEUTICAL FRESENIUS AM'NOSTSES(')%\ANL AR
BAG COMPANY
AMINO ACIDS 10% .
147 5119190201300 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 2000 A;aub'a:‘ "éiar:haiare e A|_BTA|-|XcT ::E <A TRAVASOL 10% 2000 ML
ML BAG FOR ADULT P P
AMINO ACIDS 15%
148 5119190201700 INTRAVENOUS INFUSION 1000 CANC:EEEE[F),T'E'\I')O BID
ML BOTTLE FOR ADULT
AMINO ACID 6.5% PARENTERAL
NUTRITION INJECTION 500 ML
149 5119190201900 SOTTLE FOR NEONATE AND NO QUOTE
INFANT
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

AMINO ACIDS 10% PARENTERAL SAUDI
150 5119190202000 NUTRITION 250 ML BOTTLEOR ~ PHARMACEUTICAL FRESENIUS AMINOVEN 10% 250ML
BAG FOR NEONATE AND INFANT COMPANY
AMINO ACIDS 10% PARENTERAL . .
150 5119190202000 NUTRITION 250 ML BOTTLE OR Arsaub'aT "éiar:hacnare e AFTAHXCT ::E = PRIMENE 1?N/‘;/L\'|5WNATES &
BAG FOR NEONATE AND INFANT pply Lompany
FAT EMULSION 20% LONG .
151 5119190400200 CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES AND Arsaub'a? i‘::haiare e ALE?F/LXCT AE:E oA CLINOLEIC 20% 100ML
OLIVE OIL BOTTLE 100 ML pply Lompany
FAT EMULSION 20% LONG . .
152 5119190400300 CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES AND A;aub'a:‘ Féiar:haiare e AI{BTAHX(;I- ::E = CL'NO“L/]E(;%E%%SOML
OLIVE OIL BOTTLE 250 ML pply Lompany
FAT EMULSION 20% SOY BEAN SAUD|
154 5119190400500  IEDIUMCHAINTRIGLYCERIDES o\ onacEUTICAL FRESENIUS SMOFLIPID 20 % 500 ML
OLIVE OIL FISH OIL 500 ML COMPANY
BOTTLE
FAT EMULSION 20% MEDIUM
CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES LONG ~ CANCELLED - NO BID
155 | 5119130400600 CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES WITH ACCEPTED
FISH OIL 100 ML BOTTLE
FAT EMULSION 20% MEDIUM
CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES LONG ~ CANCELLED - NO BID
150 || SHURA0R Ol CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES WITH ACCEPTED
FISH OIL 250 ML BOTTLE
FAT EMULSION 20% MEDIUM
CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES LONG ~ CANCELLED - NO BID
157 | 5119150400800 CHAIN TRIGLYCERIDES WITH ACCEPTED
FISH OIL 500 ML BOTTLE
FEB 23, 2026 21 of 25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

158

159

160

161

162

163

164

165

166

167

FEB 23, 2026
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5119190500800

5119190501000

5119190502900

5119190503000

5119190503700

5119190505700

5119190505800

5119190506100

5119191500100

5119191500200

CYANOCOBALAMIN 1 MG/ML
INJECTION 1 ML AMPOULE
VITAMIN B1 (THIAMINE
HYDROCHLORIDE) 100 MG/2 ML
INJECTION 2 ML AMPOULE
FOLIC ACID 5 MG/ML INJECTION
1 ML VIAL
PYRIDOXINE HYDROCHLORIDE
(VITAMIN B6) 100 MG/ML
INJECTION 1 ML VIAL
PYRIDOXINE (VITAMIN B6) 50
MG/ML 2 ML INJECTION
MULTIVITAMINS (WATER
SOLUBLE) FOR ADULT 10 ML
FOR TPN
MULTIVITAMINS (LIPID
SOLUBLE) FOR ADULT 10 ML
FOR TPN
MULTIVITAMINS FOR PEDIATRIC
(AB1B2B3B5B6B7B12CD3E
K1 FOLIC ACID) INJECTION:
CONCENTRATED 4 ML 1 ML VIAL
FORTPN
CALCIUM GLUCONATE 100
MG/ML (10%) SOLUTION FOR
INJECTION 50 ML
CALCIUM GLUCONATE 100
MG/ML (10%) SOLUTION FOR
INJECTION 100 ML

CANCELLED - NO BID
ACCEPTED

CANCELLED - NO BID
ACCEPTED

CANCELLED - NO BID
ACCEPTED

NO QUOTE

CANCELLED - NO BID
ACCEPTED
NO QUOTE

NO QUOTE

Arabian Health Care
Supply Company

NO QUOTE

NO QUOTE

BAXTER
HEALTHCARE S A
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

CALCIUM GLUCONATE 100

FINAL RESULT

168 5119191500300 MG/ML (10%) SOLUTION FOR NO QUOTE
INJECTION 250 ML
TRACE ELEMENT FOR TPN USE  Arabian Health Care LABORATORIE
169 | 5119199800100 10 ML VIAL FOR ADULT Supply Company AGUETTANT NUTRYELT 10ML
SAUDI

TRACE ELEMENT FOR TPN USE
169 5119199800100 10 ML VIAL FOR ADULT PHARMACEUTICAL FRESENIUS ADDAVEN 10ML

COMPANY
TRACE ELEMENT (CONTAINS 5 .
Arabian Health Care BAXTER
170 5119199800200 ELEMENTS) FOR TPN USE 10 ML Supply Company HEALTHCARE S A JUNYELT 10 ML 596232

VIAL FOR PEDIATRICS
TRACE ELEMENT (CONTAINS 6
171 5119199800600 ELEMENTS) FOR TPN USE 10 ML NO QUOTE
VIAL FOR PEDIATRICS
FAT EMULSION 20% (EGG YOLK
PHOSPHOLIPID GLYCEROL SOYA

172 5119199900300 OIL MEDIUM CHAIN CANCELLEDZNO BID

TRIGLYCERIDES) INTRAVENOUS ACCERED
INFUSION 100 ML BOTTLE
SODIUM GLYCEROPHOSPHATE SAUDI
(SODIUM 2 MMOL/ML
173 5119199900600 PHOSPHATE 1 MMOL/ML) 20 PHAE(I\)/II\,;E'EALI:;ICAL FRESENIUS GLYCOPHOS 1MMOL

ML VIAL
FAT EMULSION 20% (EGG YOLK
PHOSPHOLIPID GLYCEROL SOYA
174 5119199900700 OIL MEDIUM CHAIN
TRIGLYCERIDES) INTRAVENOUS
INFUSION 500 ML BOTTLE

CANCELLED - NO BID
ACCEPTED

FEB 23, 2026 23 of 25
www.nupco.com



http://www.nupco.com/

NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

175 5119199900800 OIL MEDIUM CHAIN
TRIGLYCERIDES) INTRAVENOUS AR
INFUSION 250 ML BOTTLE
MULTIPLE ELECTROLYTES
(POTASSIUM CHLORIDE +
MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE + .
176 5119230000000 SODIUM ACETATE + SODIUM Arsaub'a? Féiar:haiare e ALBTA:IXCT ::E - PLASMA'LELE;\J NJECTION
CHLORIDE + SODIUM pply Lompany '
GLUCONATE) PH 7.4 INJECTION
1000 ML
SELENIUM 10 TO 50 MCG/ML  Arabian Health Care LABORATORIE
177 5124121800200 NECTION S G CUETTANT SELENIUM 10MCG/ML
ZINC SULPHATE 1 MG/ML CANCELLED - NO BID
178 | 5124130300300 INJECTION ACCEPTED
ZINC SULPHATE 5 MG/ML
179 5124130300400  CONCENTRATED SOLUTION FOR CANC:&EEBT'E'\I'DO BID
INJECTION 5 ML VIAL
ZINC CHLORIDE 1 MG/ML
180 5124130301200 e o NO QUOTE
ZINC GLUCONATE 1 MG/ML 10 Arabian Health Care LABORATORIE
181 5124130301600 LVIAL iy G AGUETTANT ZINC GLUCONATE 1MG/ML
SODIUM TETRADECYL SULPHATE
182 5132160800000 3% SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 2 NO QUOTE
ML
CHROMIUM 4 MCG/ML
183 5146160500000 N UECTION 10 MLAIAL NO QUOTE
FEB 23, 2026 24 of 25
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0041/24
TENDER NAME: TPN TENDER

FINAL RESULT

WATER FOR IRRIGATION 1000 Pharmaceutical PHARMACEUTICAL STERILE WATER IRRIG
184 >147350400200 ML BOTTLE Solutions Industry L SOLUTION 1000ML
Y- INDUSTRY LTD - PSI
WATER FOR IRRIGATION 1000 Arabian Health Care BAXTER STERILE H20 IRRIGATION
184 >147350400200 ML BOTTLE Supply Company HEALTHCARE S A POUR1000ML
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