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ALFUZOSIN 10 MG EXTENDED-
5115191800000 RELEASE TABLET STORES -Orig- APOTEX ALFOSIN XR 10 mg
ALFUZOSIN 10 MG EXTENDED- Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals .
>115191800000 RELEASE TABLET COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa Uritab XL 10 mg tablet
ALFUZOSIN 10 MG EXTENDED- . . .
5115191800000 RELEASE TABLET spectropharma -Orig- Aurobindo Hi-Alfa SR
ALFUZOSIN 10 MG EXTENDED- Farouk Maamon Tamer & - .
5115191800000 RELEASE TABLET Company -Orig- Sanofi Withrop Industrie Xatral 10 MG
ALPHA LIPOIC ACID 300 MG CANCELED - NO BID
SSURANLLIEY CAPSULE ACCEPTED
ALUMINUM HYDROXIDE 200 MG +
5117151100200 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 200 MG NO QUOTATION
CHEWABLE TABLET
ALUMINUM HYDROXIDE 225
MG/5 ML + MAGNESIUM
5117151101700 HYDROXIDE 200 MG/5 ML ORAL NO QUOTATION
LIQUID
ALUMINUM HYDROXIDE 405 MG +
5117151100600 MAGNESIUM HYDROXIDE 100 MG NO QUOTATION
CHEWABLE TABLET
ALUMINUM HYDROXIDE 405
MG/5 ML + MAGNESIUM CIGALAH Pharmaceutical GULF PHARMACEUTICAL
SRR Ol HYDROXIDE 100 MG/5 ML ORAL STORES -Orig- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR MOXAL SUSPENSION
LIQUID
AMYLASE 3600 PHEUR UNITS +
LIPASE 5000 PHEUR UNITS +
5117240000300 PROTEASE 200 PHEUR UNITS NO QUOTATION
MINI-MICROSPHERES GASTRO-
RESISTANT GRANULES 20 G
BOTTLE
AMYLASE 8000 PHEUR UNITS +
LIPASE 10000 PHEUR UNITS + Farouk Maamon Tamer &
5119190500600 PROTEASE 600 PHEUR UNITS EiisETY O Abbott Neustadt Creon 10,000 1U
CAPSULE
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ANTI-D [RHO] IMMUNOGLOBULIN

CIGALAH Pharmaceutical

March 1, 2026

9 | 5120180500200 | 1500 IU (300 MCG) SOLUTION FOR TOREe i CSL BEHRING Rhophylac - 2ML
INJECTION IN PRE-FILLED SYRINGE &
ANTI-D [RHO] IMMUNOGLOBULIN N . .
10 | 5120180500500 | 1500 1U (300 MCG) SOLUTION FOR |  APdUlrehman Algosaibi Fmergent Blosolutions WinRho® SDF
INJECTION VIAL & '
ANTI-D [RHO] IMMUNOGLOBULIN CANCELED - NO BID
11 | 5120180500400 2500 1U (500 MCG) INJECTION ACCEPTED
ANTIHEMORRHOIDAL LIDOCAINE Farouk Maamon Tamer & . o
12 5116178000200 HCL 2% + TRIBENOSIDE 5% CREAM o N Jamjoom Pharma Pilocin Cream
ANTIHEMORRHOIDAL LIDOCAINE . . | JAZEERA PHARMACEUTICAL
12 5116178000200 HCL 2% + TRIBENOSIDE 5% CREAM Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- INDUSTRIES (JPI) RECTACURE
13 | 5116178000800 ANT_:ELE';')/OEF;HR%'ESCL)SLI'SSE‘Q'NE CIGALAH Pharmaceutical | GULF PHARMACEUTICAL HAEMOPROCT
° ° STORES -Orig- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR OINTMENT
OINTMENT
ANTIHEMORRHOIDAL LIDOCAINE
14 | 5116178000300 HCL 40 MG + TRIBENOSIDE 400 NO QUOTATION
MG SUPPOSITORY
ANTIHEMORRHOIDAL WITH
15 | 5116178001000 STEROID 15 - 30 G RECTAL CAN(,:AECLCI:EEP'—I'IIE\IS BID
OINTMENT
ANTIHEMORRHOIDAL WITH CANCELED - NO BID
16 | 5116178000500 | orepoips RECTAL SUPPOSITORY ACCEPTED
CIGALAH Pharmaceutical RONTIS HELLAS S.A., ENEVOM 125 MG
17 | 5129400100100 APREPITANT 125 MG CAPSULE Sl MEDICAL AND PHARMACE CAPSULL
CIGALAH Pharmaceutical RONTIS HELLAS S.A., ENEVOM 80 MG
18 | 5129400100200 APREPITANT 80 MG CAPSULE . I, | S CAPSULE
ASCORBIC ACID + MACROGOL
3350 + POTASSIUM CHLORIDE + | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical MOVIPREP POWDER FOR
19 | 5117163100200 | orp) 1501 ASCORBATE + SODIUM STORES -Orig- NORGINE ORAL SOLUTION
CHLORIDE + SODIUM SULPHATE
ATOSIBAN 7.5 MG/ML SOLUTION | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical | EVER PHARMA JENA GMBH,
20 | 5118229900300 FOR INJECTION 0.9 ML STORES -Orig- GERMANY Premaban 0.9 ml
ATOSIBAN 7.5 MG/ML SOLUTION Abdulrehman Algosaibi . TRACTOCILE sol for inj
20 | 5118229900300 FOR INJECTION 0.9 ML GTC -Orig- FELA el 7.5mg/ml
20f 30
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ATOSIBAN 7.5 MG/ML SOLUTION

CIGALAH Pharmaceutical

"EVER PHARMA JENA

Trade Description

March 1, 2026

21| >118229900500 FOR INJECTION 5 ML STORES -Orig- GMBH, GERMANY Premaban 3 m|
ATOSIBAN 7.5 MG/ML SOLUTION |  Abdulrehman Algosaibi . TRACTOCILE conc for sol
21| >118229900500 FOR INJECTION 5 ML GTC -Orig- Ferring GmbH for inf 7
BETAINE (TRIMETHYLGLYCINE) . .
22 | 5117152700000 | POWDER FOR ORAL SUSPENSION ALOSOOLCZA_?:a_' Trading | pECORDATI RARE DISEASE CYSTADANE
1 G/SCOOPFUL 180 G g
CIGALAH Pharmaceutical | GULF PHARMACEUTICAL LAXOCODYL 10MG
Bl S E e e D | IR O G O A RO/ STORES -Orig- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR ADULT SUPPOSITORIES
BISACODYL 5 MG ENTERIC Farouk Maamon Tamer & DULCOLAX 5 MG 40
24 | 5117161400000 -, Company Orig. DELPHARM REIMS S.A.S ABLLT
25 | 5117161400200 | BISACODYL5 MG SUPPOSITORY NO QUOTATION
CANCELED - NO BID
26 | 5114250100000 | BROMOCRIPTINE 2.5 MG TABLET (S
BUDESONIDE 2 MG/DOSE RECTAL CIGALAH Pharmaceutical Budenofalk 2MG Rectal
27 | 5116170300400 oA TORES ATt ASM L
28 | 5116170300500 BUDESONIDE 3 MG CAPSULE C'GAL;AT%EEEr_gfng?”t'ca' LOSAN PHARMA GMBH Budenofalk 3mg cap
BUDESONIDE 9 MG EXTENDED- Abdulrehman Algosaibi CORTIMENT prol rel tab
29 | 5116170300700 RELEASE TABLET GTC -Orig- Cosmo 9mg blis 3
30 | 5114153500000 CABERGOLINE 0.5 MG TABLET ZIMMO TRADING MEDCITY PHARMA Dexorolin 0.5mg ab
Company LTD -Orig-
30 | 5114153500000 CABERGOLINE 0.5 MG TABLET | Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- | *"2EERA PHARMACEUTICAL |\ orieix 0.5 mg TABLET
INDUSTRIES (JPI)
30 | 5114153500000 CABERGOLINE 0.5 MG TABLET | Farouk Maamon Tamer & Pfizer Italia S.R.L, Ascoli | 1 hori\Ex 0.5MG TABLET
Company -Orig- Piceno
CALCITONIN SALMON 100 IU/ML
31 | 5118161300000 SOLUTION FOR INFUSION 1 ML NO QUOTATION
AMPOULE
KUWAIT SAUDI
Ny [— eI e
pany & INDUSTRIAL CO )
CARBETOCIN 100 MCG/ML Abdulrehman Algosaibi .
32 5118229900100 INJECTION 1 ML AMPOULE GTC -Orig- Ferring GmbH Pabal RTS
30f 30
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33 | 5118160000000 CARBIMAZOLE 5 MG TABLET Alhobail Medical Company MACLEODS CARBIMAZOLE
Orig- MACLEODS
33 | 5118160000000 CARBIMAZOLE 5 MG TABLET | S2udi International Trading Cenexi SAS NEBIEE Ll S [3 inl
Company -Orig- 100 Tabs
CARBOPROST 0.25 MG/ML
34 | 5118229900200 | SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 1 ML HOLD
AMPOULE
CARGLUMIC ACID 200 MG . APOTHECON FOR CARGLUMIC ACID 200
o e DISPERSIBLE ORAL TABLET OLelmEEo g Ot WAYMADE PLC MG DISPERSIBLE ORAL T
CARGLUMIC ACID 200 MG ZIMMO TRADING SYNERLAB- LABORATOIRES
35 | 5121260100000 DISPERSIBLE ORAL TABLET Company LTD -Orig- BTT CARBAGLU 200MG
CARGLUMIC ACID 200 MG . . | JAZEERA PHARMACEUTICAL .
35 5121260100000 DISPERSIBLE ORAL TABLET Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- INDUSTRIES (JPI) Aminglu
CETRORELIX ACETATE 0.25 MG
36 | 5111184000000 iy, i HOLD
I Orphacol 250m
37 | 5117200800000 CHOLIC ACID 250 MG CAPSULE PHARMACEUTICAL THERAVIA . S'i’”es Cholic Aii y
COMPANY -Orig- P
CHORIOGONADOTROPIN ALFA
6500 IU (250 MCG/0.5 ML) CIGALAH Pharmaceutical Ovitrelle 250 Microgram
38 | 5118150100300 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION OR STORES -Orig- WK SERONO S.P.A /0.5 ml
INFUSION IN PRE-FILLED SYRINGE
39 | 5118249900100 CINACALCET 30 MG TABLET Saudi Pharmaceutical SPIMACO ST ED G
Industries And Medi -Orig- coated tablet
39 | 5118249900100 CINACALCET 30 MG TABLET DU ariiieuticy JRbuk PhiceUtigly ENDOLET 30MG
COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa
Saudi Pharmaceutical GLANDY 60 mg film-
40 | 5118249900200 CINACALCET 60 MG TABLET Sty ) SPIMACO oated bt
40 | 5118249900200 CINACALCET 60 MG TABLET Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals ENDOLET 60MG
COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa
CANCELED - NO BID
41 | 5113162800100 CITRIC ACID POWDER CCEPTED
Middle East MIDDLE EAST
) 0,
42 5110150400600 CUNDAVI\:E(I:':\LEEEEZEAATE 2% Pharmaceutical industries PHARMACEUTICAL AVOC”\é;é’A\'\/AAGINAL
co -Orig- INDUSTRIES
March 1, 2026 4 0f 30
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CLOMIFENE CITRATE 50 MG

Farouk Maamon Tamer &

Trade Description

43 | 5118191100000 TABLET ST Patheon Clomid 50 MG Tab
CLOTRIMAZOLE 10% VAGINAL | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical
44 | 5130230800000 CREAM S G STORES -Orig. KERN PHARMA S.L. Canesten
CLOTRIMAZOLE 100 MG VAGINAL | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical .
45 | 5110180500600 TABLET STORES -Orig. BATTERIEE PHARMA Clottrizole
CLOTRIMAZOLE 100 MG VAGINAL | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical | HAUPT PHARMA WULFING
45 | >110180500600 TABLET STORES -Alt- GMBH GP GRENZACH Canesten
CLOTRIMAZOLE 500 MG VAGINAL | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical | HAUPT PHARMA WULFING
16 | -110180500300 TABLET STORES -Orig- GMBH GP GRENZACH Canesten
CONJUGATED ESTROGENS 0.625
47 | 5118180300300 ot va B B v NO QUOTATION
CONJUGATED ESTROGENS 1.25
CANCELED - NO BID
48 | 5118180300400 MG TABLET A CCEPTED
CORIFOLLITROPIN ALFA1SOMCG | =
49 | 5118190600200 | SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 0.5 ML comoa I NV Organon,Netherlands Elonva
IN PRE-FILLED SYRINGE pany==rie
COSYNTROPIN (TETRACOSACTRIN)
50 | 5142200100200 S e L LA NO QUOTATION
CYPROTERONE ACETATE 2 MG + . . .
51 | 5118189900300 ETHINYL ESTRADIOL 0.035 MG | ~2udi International Trading | BAYER WEIMAR GmbH UND DIANE-35
Company -Orig- CO. KG
TABLET
CYPROTERONE ACETATE 50 MG CANCELED - NO BID
52 | 5118189900200 TABLET CCEPTED
ADCO Trading Company - DELPHARMA LILLE SAS
53 | 5117231900000 CYSTEAMINE 150 MG CAPSULE ol B o Cystagon 150mg
ADCO Trading Company - DELPHARMA LILLE SAS
54 | 5117231900100 CYSTEAMINE 50 MG CAPSULE orig-  ECORDAT Cystagon 50mg

55 5117231900700

CYSTEAMINE BITARTRATE 75 MG
DELAYED-RELEASE CAPSULE

Salehiya Trading CO -Orig-

CHIESI FARMACEUTICI S.P.A

Procysbi 75MG

56 5118210100200

DESMOPRESSIN 100 MCG TABLET

CIGALAH Pharmaceutical
STORES -Orig-

APOTEX

APO-DESMOPRESSIN 100
MCG TAB

March 1, 2026
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DESMOPRESSIN ACETATE 10

ZYDUS LIFESCIENCES LTD

Trade Description

DESMOPRESSIN 10 mcg /

March 1, 2026

57 5118210100400 MCG/DOSESI\F:I:;F;RED NASAL Qomel Company -Orig- FOR QOMEL COMPANY 0.1 mL per spray
DESMOPRESSIN ACETATE 100
58 5118210100100 MCG/ML (0.1 MG/ML) NASAL CANCELED - NO BID
ACCEPTED
DROPS
DESMOPRESSIN ACETATE 120 Abdulrehman Algosaibi s
59 5118210100500 MCG SUBLINGUAL TABLET GTC -Orig- Catalent Minirin Melt 120 mcg
DESMOPRESSIN ACETATE 4 - ..
60 | 5118210100000 MCG/ML SOLUTION FOR Abd“"g??fgr?'_g“a'b' Ferring GmbH M'N'Er':'cs;’r';f rin
INJECTION 1 ML : &
DESMOPRESSIN ACETATE 60 MCG Abdulrehman Algosaibi .
61 5118210100600 SUBLINGUAL TABLET GTC -Orig- Catalent Minirin Melt 60 mcg
DESOGESTREL 150 MCG + Saudi International Tradin
62 5118181100000 ETHINYLESTRADIOL 30 MCG . & GEDEON RICHTER REGULON
Company -Orig-
TABLET
DESOGESTREL 150 MCG + Farouk Maamon Tamer &
62 5118181100000 ETHINYLESTRADIOL 30 MCG . NV Organon,Netherlands Marvelon
Company -Orig-
TABLET
63 | 5118181100100 DESOGESTREL 75 MCG TABLET Abd”"g:?_agrg_g“a'b' Laboratories Leconsa S.A Desirett 75mcg
Farouk Maamon Tamer &
63 5118181100100 DESOGESTREL 75 MCG TABLET . NV Organon,Netherlands Cerazette
Company -Orig-
DEXLANSOPRAZOLE 30 MG Abdulrehman Algosaibi INSTIGAR 30 mg Delayed-
64 >117193500000 MODIFIED-RELEASE CAPSULE GTC -Orig- TAKEDA Release Ca
DIBASIC SODIUM PHOSPHATE + Jamioom Medicine Store
65 5117162200100 MONOBASIC SODIUM PHOSPHATE ) Co. -Orig- C.B. FLEET INC USA Fleet Enema For Adult
RECTAL ENEMA FOR ADULT i
66 5118209900100 DIENOGEST 2 MG TABLET HOLD
DIMETICONE (SIMETHICONE) 42 CANCELED - NO BID
67 >117150000100 MG CHEWABLE TABLET ACCEPTED
DIMETICONE (SIMETICONE) 40 ) . i .
68 5117150000200 MG/ML ORAL DROPS 30 ML Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- AMMAN PHARMA IND. Tumeeze Oral Emulsion
DIMETICONE (SIMETICONE) 40 ZIMMO TRADING HAYAT PHARMACEUTICAL
68 >117150000200 MG/ML ORAL DROPS 30 ML Company LTD -Orig- INDUSTRIES DEFLAT DROPS 40MG/ML
6 of 30
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DINOPROSTONE 1 MG VAGINAL

Trade Description

March 1, 2026

69 5118220100500 GEL NO QUOTATION
DINOPROSTONE 10 MG VAGINAL Abdulrehman Algosaibi Ferring Controlled Propess Vaginal Delivery
70 5118220100300 TABLET GTC -Orig- Therapeutics Limited System
DINOPROSTONE 10 MG/ML
71 5118220100800 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 0.5 ML NO QUOTATION
72 5118220100700 DINOPROSTO[\(‘;EEE MG VAGINAL NO QUOTATION
73 5118220100200 DINOPROSTONE 3 MG VAGINAL NO QUOTATION
TABLET
DIOSMIN 450 MG + HESPERIDIN Farouk Maamon Tamer & . Henasen 500 mg Film
74 | 5116178000600 50 MG TABLET Company -Orig- Jamjoom Pharma Coated Tablet
DIOSMIN 450 MG + HESPERIDIN Al Haya Medical Company CAPILLO 450,50 MG FILM
74 5116178000600 50 MG TABLET i RIYADH PHARMA COATED TABLET
DIOSMIN 450 MG + HESPERIDIN Ahmed Mohammed Abdul LES LABORATOIRES SERVIER
74 >116178000600 50 MG TABLET Wahab Naghi -Orig- INDUSTRIE DAFLON 500MG TAB
NAWAH
DOMPERIDONE 1 MG/ML ORAL DEEF PHARMACEUTICAL AMISTOP 5MG-5ML
e >117839000000 LIQUID PHARMA((:;IIg(_:UAL EST - INDUSTRIES CO. / KSA SUSPENSION
75 | 5117899000000 | DOMPERIDONELMG/MLORAL | Farouk Maamon Tamer & Jamjoom Pharma Dompy Suspension
LIQUID Company -Orig-
75 5117899000000 DOMPERIDONE 1 MG/ML ORAL Tabuk pharmaFeutlcaI Tabuk Pharmaceutlcals PROKININ 5MG/5ML
LIQUID COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa SUSPENSION
76 | 5117899000100 DOMPERIDONE 10 MG TABLET | ' 2rouk Maamon Tamer & Jamjoom Pharma Dompy 10 mg Tablets
Company -Orig-
76 | 5117899000100 DOMPERIDONE 10 MG TABLET Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals | oo NN 10MG TABLETS
COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa
DROSPIRENONE 3 MG + ETHINYL
ESTRADIOL 0.02 MG +
77 5118180700400 LEVOMEFOLIC ACID 0.451 MG NO QUOTATION
TABLET
78 5118201400100 DUTASTERIDE 0.5 MG + Saudi International Trading CATALANT GERMANY Duodart 0.5 mg /0.4 mg
TAMSULOSIN 0.4 MG CAPSULE Company -Orig- SCHORNDORF GMBH Capsules
DUTASTERIDE 0.5 MG + ZIMMO TRADING LABORATORIOS LEON
78 | 5118201400100 TAMSULOSIN 0.4 MG CAPSULE Company LTD -Orig- FARMA SA Dusta plus
7 of 30
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CIGALAH Pharmaceutical

March 1, 2026

79 | 5118201400000 DUTASTERIDE 0.5 MG CAPSULE b OLIVE HEALTHCARE Duserex 0.5 MG CAPSULE
ZIMMO TRADING LABORATORIOS LEON
79 | 5118201400000 DUTASTERIDE 0.5 MG CAPSULE Company LT0 Orig- RMIA <A Dusta 0.5 mg
Saudi International Trading DELPHARM POZNAN
79 | 5118201400000 DUTASTERIDE 0.5 MG CAPSULE Company Orig. SPOLKA AKCYINA Avodart 0.5 mg Capsules
80 | 5118199900000 | DYDROGESTERONE 10 MG TABLET HOLD
. MOVICOL SACHET
o1 | sumeasooao | FECTROLITES POLYETHILNE | CIOALAN Pharmaceutica — e
& RECONSTITUTION
ELECTROLYTES + POLYETHYLINE | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical . o
82 | 5117163101100 e STORES -Orig. NORGINE Movicol Paediatric Plain
ENEMA SODIUM BIPHOSPHATE
83 | 5117162201500 | PEDIATRIC WITH PRE-LUBRICATED HOLD
TIP DISPOSABLE
CANCELED - NO BID
84 | 5117191300800 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 10 MG SACHET ac iR
SAUDI PHARMACUTICAL
85 | 5117191301100 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 20 MG CAPSULE COMPANY -Orig- ETHYPHARM Ventra 20 mg
85 | 5117191301100 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 20 MG CAPSULE | '2roukMaamonTamer& | Hetero Labs Limited Unit= | o 0 56 1o cansules
Company -Orig- Il For Amaro
Farouk Maamon Tamer & SAJA-SAUDI ARABIAN
85 | 5117191301100 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 20 MG CAPSULE B IAPANESE PHARMACEUTIC SESMO 20mg
Saudi Pharmaceutical TOWA PHARMACEUTICAL | EZORA 20 MG GASTRO-
85 | 5117191301100 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 20 MG CAPSULE |\, <\ ies And Medi -Orig- EUROPE S L RESISTANT HARD CAPSUL
86 | 5117191300100 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 20 MG TABLET HOLD
Farouk Maamon Tamer & SAJA-SAUDI ARABIAN
87 | 5117191301200 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 40 MG CAPSULE Compar s IAPANESE PHARMACEUTIC SESMO 40mg
SAUDI PHARMACUTICAL
87 | 5117191301200 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 40 MG CAPSULE COMPANY -Orig- ETHYPHARM ventra 40 mg
87 | 5117191301200 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 40 MG CAPSULE | 'oroukMaamon Tamer& | Hetero Labs Limited Unit=| ¢\ 16 1o cansules
Company -Alt- IIl For Amaro
Saudi Pharmaceutical TOWA PHARMACEUTICAL | EZORA 40 MG GASTRO-
S SRSt S EARCHR G O RCARSEE e ) e B EUROPE S L RESISTANT HARD CAPSUL
8 of 30
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Farouk Maamon Tamer &

ASPIRO PHARMA LIMITED

Trade Description

Esopole 40 mg Injection

88 | 5117191300600 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 40 MG INJECTION .
Company -Orig- For Amarox 10
88 | 5117191300600 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 40 MG INJECTION | S2udi International Trading ASTRAZENECA AB NEXIUM IV 40 MG 50 INF
Company -Orig-
NAWAH
89 | 5117191300300 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 40 MG TABLET | PHARMACETICUAL EST - LEE PHARMA RESTOMAP 40 MG
Orig-
89 | 5117191300300 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 40 MG TABLET | oroukMaamonTamer& | o ricppapmaGmby | ESOMEP 40 mg gastro-
Company -Orig- resistant ta
80 | 5117191300300 | ESOMEPRAZOLE 40 MG TABLET | S2udiInternational Trading SPIMACO Nexium 40mg Tablets
Company -Orig-
90 | 5118182300100 | COTERIFIEDESTROGEN125MG NO QUOTATION
TABLET
o1 | 5118182300000 | CoTERIFIEDESTROGEN 300 MCG NO QUOTATION
TABLET
ESTRADIOL 100 MCG/DAY CANCELED - NO BID
92 | 5118181300100 TRANSDERMAL PATCH ACCEPTED
ESTRADIOL 2 MG + Farouk Maamon Tamer &
83 | 5118181300600 | o o O o aLeT Commany Ortg. ABBOTT BIOLOGICALS FEMOSTON 2-10 TABLET
ESTRADIOL 25 MCG/DAY CANCELED - NO BID
94 | 5135160500200 TRANSDERMAL PATCH ACCEPTED
ESTRADIOL 50 MCG/DAY CANCELED - NO BID
9 | 5118181300000 TRANSDERMAL PATCH ACCEPTED
ESTRADIOL VALERATE 2 MG + . . .
96 | 5135160500100 CYPROTERONE ACETATE 1 MG | S2udi International Trading | BAYER WEIMAR GmbH UND CLIMEN
Company -Orig- CO. KG
TABLET
ESTROGEN CONJUGATED 25 MG
97 | 5118180300000 OWDER FOR INJECTION NO QUOTATION
ESTROGENS CONJUGATED 300 CANCELED - NO BID
98 | 5118180300600 MCG TABLET ACCEPTED
ESTROGENS CONJUGATED 625 CANCELED - NO BID
99 | 5118180300100 MCG TABLET ACCEPTED
ETELCALCETIDE 10 MG/ML . . | PATHEON MANUFACTURING
100 | 5118249900500 ECTION Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- CERVICES LLC PARSABIV 10MG

March 1, 2026

www.nupco.com

9 of 30



http://www.nupco.com/

NUPCO TENDER:
TENDER NAME:

NPT 0017/25
GASTROINTESTINAL AND HORMONAL HEALTH

Vendor Name

Manufacturer

FINAL RESULT - STAGE 1

NUPCO Code Item Description

Trade Description

ETELCALCETIDE 2.5 MG/ML . . . PATHEON MANUFACTURING
101 5118249900400 INJECTION Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- SERVICES LLC PARSABIV 2.5MG
ETELCALCETIDE 5 MG/ML . . . PATHEON MANUFACTURING
102 5118249900300 INJECTION Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- SERVICES LLC PARSABIV 5MG
ETHINYL ESTRADIOL + . . .
103 | 5135241300000 LEVONORGESTREL TRIPHASIC | *2 'C':n‘imaarf'o_rg‘::_rad'”g BAYER WE'C'\:')Ai GGmbH UND LOGYNON
REGIMEN TABLET pany -brig ‘
ETHINYL ESTRADIOL 0.03 MG + Saudi International Trading Bulk Production: Bayer .
104 | 5118180700600 DROSPIRENONE 3 MG TABLET Company -Orig- Weimar GmbH und C Yasmin
ETHINYL ESTRADIOL 0.03 MG + AL KAMAL IMPORT OFFICE .
104 5118180700600 DROSPIRENONE 3 MG TABLET CO LTD -Orig- BAYER AG Yasmin Tab
ETHINYLESTRADIOL 15 MCG/24 HR
+ ETONOGESTREL 120 MCG/24 HR | Farouk Maamon Tamer & .
105 5118181300300 VAGINAL DELIVERY SYSTEM 1 e T NV Organon,Netherlands Nuvaring
RING
ETHINYLESTRADIOL 30 MCG + Saudi International Trading Bulk Production: Bayer
106 | 5135240000000 GESTODENE 75 MCG TABLET Company -Orig- Weimar GmbH und C Gynera
ETHINYLESTRADIOL 30 MCG + Abdulrehman Algosaibi . Luttagen
106 5135240000000 GESTODENE 75 MCG TABLET GTC -Orig- Leon Farma Laboratories 0.075mg/0.03mg
ETHINYLESTRADIOL 6 MG/24 HR + .
CIGALAH Pharmaceutical LTS LOHMANN THERAIE- EVRA TRANSDERMAL
107 5135241400000 NORELGESTROMIN 0.6 MG/24 HR STORES -Orig- SYSTEME AG PATCHES
PATCH
ETONOGESTREL 68 MG IMPLANT Farouk Maamon Tamer & N V Organon
108 >135200500000 FOR SUBDERMAL USE Company -Orig- Kloosterstraat,Netherlands Implanon
109 5117190200200 FAMOTIDINE 10 MG TABLET Farouk Maamon Tfamer & Anpo.ra Pharma Private Famotidine Amarox 10
Company -Orig- Limited For Amarox mg Tablets
110 5117190200000 FAMOTIDINE 10 MG/ML Farouk Maamon Tamer & Anho.ra Pharma Private Famotidine Amarox
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 2 ML Company -Orig- Limited For Amarox INJECTION
FAMOTIDINE 10 MG/ML Abdulrehman Algosaibi Hikma Italia SPA for Jazeera
110 >117130200000 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 2 ML GTC -Orig- Pharmaceuti FAMODINE
111 5117190200100 FAMOTIDINE 40 MG/5 ML ORAL Farouk Maamon Tfa\mer & Anhora Pharma Private Famotidine Amarox OS
SUSPENSION Company -Orig- Limited For Amarox 40 mg/5ml
FAMOTIDINE 40 MG/5 ML ORAL . APOTHECON FOR NAVINTA FAMOTIDINE 40 MG/5
111 | 5117150200100 SUSPENSION Qomel Company -Orig- LLC ML ORAL SUSPENSION
March 1, 2026 10 of 30
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FIBER SUPPLEMENT GRANULES | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical | ROTTAPHARM |MADAUS
112 | 5050170600400 OWDER 250 G STORES -Orly. CROUP AGIOLAX GRANULES
FIBER SUPPLEMENT GRANULES ACEDRA METAX INSTITUT FUR
112 | 5050170600400 PHARMACEUTICAL \ FibreMaxx
POWDER 250 G COMPANY -Orig. DIATETIK GMBH
113 | 5118200100100 FINASTERIDE 1 MG TABLET Farouk Maamon Tamer & | ORGANON PHARMA (UK) Propecia
Company -Orig- LIMITED
Farouk Maamon Tamer & HETERO LABS LIMITED UNIT
113 | 5118200100100 FINASTERIDE 1 MG TABLET Comman Al I FOR AMARG Allocar 1 mg Tablets
114 | 5118200100000 FINASTERIDE 5 MG TABLET Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals FINISCAR 5mg Tablets
COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa
Farouk Maamon Tamer & SAJA-SAUDI ARABIAN
114 | 5118200100000 FINASTERIDE 5 MG TABLET Commany Ortg. IAPANESE PHARMACEUTIC FINASID 5MG
115 | 5115164200000 | FLAVOXATE HCL 100 MG TABLET NO QUOTATION
FOLLITROPIN ALFA 150 1U +
116 | 5118191201500 | LUTROPIN ALFA 75 IU SOLUTION CAN(,:AECLCEEP:I'IIE\‘[;J BID
FOR INJECTION VIAL
FOLLITROPIN ALFA 150 IU .
117 | 5118191200600 | POWDER FOR INJECTIONVIAL+ | C/GALAH Pharmaceutical MERCK SERONO S.P.A Gonal-f 150 1U/0.25 mL
STORES -Orig- solution for inje
DILUENT
FOLLITROPIN ALFA 300 1U/0.5 ML | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical Gonalf 300 1U/0.50 mL
118 | 5118151201000 PRE-FILLED PEN STORES -Orig- MERCK SERONO 5.P.A (22 micrograms/o0.
FOLLITROPIN ALFA 450 1U/0.75 ML | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical Gonalf 450 1U/0.75 mL
119 | 5118191200200 PRE-FILLED PEN STORES -Orig- MERCK SERONO 5.P.A (33 micrograms/O0.
FOLLITROPIN ALFA 75 IU POWDER CANCELED - NO BID
120 | 5118191200500 | co2 |NJECTION VIAL + DILUENT ACCEPTED
GALSULFASE 1 MG/ML SOLUTION | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical
121 | 5120181000000 FoR INJECTION 5 ML STORES -Orly. BIOMARIN Naglazyme
122 | 5117190000200 GIVOSIRAN 189 MG INJECTION | Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- | ALNYLAM NETHERLANDS BV Givlaari
GLYCERIN 1 - 2.8 G SUPPOSITORY | Ankaa Medical Company -
123 | 5117161900100 OR PEDIATRIC ore- UNICARE PHARMA Glycelax
GLYCERIN 700 - 900 MG Ankaa Medical Company -
124 | 5117161900000 CUPPOSITORY ore- UNICARE PHARMA Glycelax

March 1, 2026
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GLYCEROL PHENYLBUTYRATE 1.1

Farouk Maamon Tamer &

Annora Pharma Private

Trade Description

Glycti 1.1 G/ML ORAL

March 1, 2026

125 >016190100000 G/ML ORAL SOLUTION Company -Orig- Limited For Amarox SOLUTION
GLYCEROL PHENYLBUTYRATE 1.1 Arabian Trade House -
125 5016190100000 G/ML ORAL SOLUTION Orig- IMMEDICA RAVICTI
. SHARON BIO MEDICINE LTD | Glycopyrronium Bromide
126 5115161100200 GLYCOPYRROLATE 1 MG TABLET Qomel Company -Orig- FOR WAYMADE PLC 1 Mg Tab
GLYCOPYRROLATE 1 MG/5 ML
127 5115161100400 ORAL SOLUTION HOLD
GLYCOPYRROLATE 200 MCG/ML CANCELED - NO BID
L) SR Iol INJECTION 1 ML ACCEPTED
GONADOTROPHIN CHORIONIC
129 5118190100100 HUMAN 5000 I[U POWDER FOR CAN?AECLCEEP:I'ENI;) BID
INJECTION AMPQOULE + DILUENT
130 | 5117180200100 GRANISETRON 1 MG TABLET | hMed Mohammed Abdul Delpharm Milano S. R KYTRIL F.C. TABLETS 1MG
Wahab Naghi -Orig-
131 5117180200000 GRANISETRON 1 MG/ML Abdulrehman Algosalbl Hikma Farmacéutica for GRANITRON 1MG—ML
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 1 ML GTC -Orig- Jazeera Pharmaceu SOLUTION FOR Inj
GRANISETRON 1 MG/ML . . .
131 5117180200000 SOLUTION EOR INJECTION 1 ML Thimar Allazirah Co -Orig- AMOUN Emlop
GRANISETRON 1 MG/ML Ahmed Mohammed Abdul . KYTRIL AMPOULES
131 | 5117180200000 | ¢4 110N FOR INJECTION 1 ML Wahab Naghi -Orig- Cenexi 1IMG/1ML
GRANISETRON 1 MG/ML
132 5117180200400 SOLUTION EOR INJECTION 3 ML NO QUOTATION
GRANISETRON 34.3 MG Abdulrehman Algosaibi Kindeva Drug Delivery
133 | 5117180200200 TRANSDERMAL PATCH GTC -Orig- Systems 19901 Nord sancuso
HUMAN MENOPAUSAL
134 5118191200800 GONADOTROPHIN (HMG) - FSH Cilr::/“\a/lr? -II-_I_T_ADD_LI)\I'_CI; i Blgéﬁlf\l/_lll\g:llgil ) Merional 150 |U
150 IU/LH 150 1U INJECTION pany & '
HYALURONIC ACID LOW Farouk Maamon Tamer &
135 5120200200800 MOLECULAR WEIGHT (LMW) Company -Orie- Crab Sinergy Srl Hyal Gel
VAGINAL GEL pany -Lrig
136 5117210700100 HYOSCINE BUTYLBROMIDE 10 MG CIGALAH Pharma.ceutlcal GULF PHARMACEUTICAL SCOPINAL 10MG
TABLET STORES -Orig- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR TABLETS
HYOSCINE BUTYLBROMIDE 10 MG Saudi Pharmaceutical
136 5117210700100 TABLET Industries And Medi -Orig- SPIMACO NOSPASM 10 MG TAB
12 of 30
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NUPCO Code Item Description Vendor Name Manufacturer Trade Description
» THE ARAB
136 | 5117210700100 | [YOSCINE BUTTZETES MIDE 10 MG Abd”'rgﬁcmf‘grf'jgma'b' PHARMACEUTICAL SPASMOPAN 10MG TAB.
& MANUFACTURING PS
HYOSCINE BUTYLBROMIDE 10 MG Farouk Maamon Tamer & BUSCOPAN 10 MG 20
136 | 5117210700100 TABLET Company -Orig. DELPHARM REIMS S.A.S ABLET
HYOSCINE BUTYLBROMIDE 20 Khalid Bin Saad
137 | 5117210700200 MG/ML INJECTION 1 ML International Company Ld i pead) Sl 4S8 HYPONAL AMPOULE
AMPOULE -Orig-
137 | 5117910700200 HY&S(S/'::'AEL ?I\LIJ JTEYCLT'TS(;'\Q':\)AEL 20 CIGALAH Pharmaceutical GULF PHARMACEUTICAL SCOPINAL 20MG/ML
STORES -Orig- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR INJECTION IM/IV/SC
AMPOULE
HYOSCINE BUTYLBROMIDE 20 N . .
137 | 5117210700200 MG/ML INJECTION 1 ML Abdulrehman Algosaibi | Hikma ltalia SPA for Jazeera | oo\ o150 AN 20MG AMP.
GTC -Orig- Pharmaceuti
AMPOULE
HYOSCINE BUTYLBROMIDE 20 Y AT
137 | 5117210700200 MG/ML INJECTION 1 ML . Medochemie Ltd. Bysimin
AMPOULE Pany==rie
KUWAIT SAUDI
HYOSCINE BUTYLBROMIDE 5 ZIMMO TRADING HYOPAN SYRUP
138 | 5117210700400 ) PHARMACEUTICL
MG/5 ML ORAL LIQUID Company LTD -Orig- INDUSTRIAL CO 5MG/5ML 100 ML
HYOSCINE BUTYLBROMIDE 5 CIGALAH Pharmaceutical GULF PHARMACEUTICAL
138 | 5117210700400 MG/5 ML ORAL LIQUID STORES -Orig- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR SCOPINAL SYRUP
NAWAH
HYOSCINE BUTYLBROMIDE 5 DEEF PHARMACEUTICAL DEFOPAN 5MG-5ML
138 | 5117210700400 MG/5 ML ORAL LIQUID PHARMACOErTi';UAL EST - INDUSTRIES CO. / KSA SYRUP
ISPAGHULA HUSK 3.5 -5 G
139 | 5117160000000 | prprpy/ESCENT GRANULES SACHET HOSS
Khalid Bin Saad
KAOLIN-LIGHT 193 MG/ML + ; . .
| Sl 3
140 | 5117242100000 | Lo Al LQUID Internatlo?glrizt_)mpany Ld L peaall Sl 48,5 KAPECT SUSPENSION
141 | 5013170600100 | LACTASE ENZYME 3000 IU TABLET NO QUOTATION
142 | 5124122800200 | LACTASE ENZYME 9000 IU TABLET NO QUOTATION
13 of 30
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March 1, 2026

143 4223180300000 (NUTRITION PROBIOTIC) 4 - 6 ML Gulf neocare -Orig- DICOFARM SPA, ITALY Dicoflor Oral drops 5ml
DIETARY SUPPLEMENT DROPS
LACTULOSE 3.25 - 3.35 G/5 ML CIGALAH Pharmaceutical MEDICAL UNION
144 >117160500000 ORAL LIQUID STORES -Orig- PHARMACEUTICALS MUP LAXOLAC SYRUP
LACTULOSE 3.25 - 3.35 G/5 ML CIGALAH Pharmaceutical GULF PHARMACEUTICAL
144 5117160500000 ORAL LIQUID STORES -Alt- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR SOFLAXSOLUTION
LACTULOSE 3.25 - 3.35 G/5 ML Farouk Maamon Tamer & DUPHALAC ORAL
144 5117160500000 ORAL LIQUID o S N ABBOTT BIOLOGICALS SOLUTION
LACTULOSE 3.25 - 3.35 G/5 ML Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals
144 5117160500000 ORAL LIQUID COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa EZILAX Syrup 10 g / 15 ml
LANREOTIDE ACETATE 120 MG
145 5111185500000 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION IN PRE- | Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- IPSEN PHARMA BIOTECH SOMATULINE AUTOGEL
120MG
FILLED SYRINGE
LANREOTIDE ACETATE 60 MG
146 5111185500200 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION IN PRE- | Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- IPSEN PHARMA BIOTECH SOMATULINE AUTOGEL
60MG
FILLED SYRINGE
LANREOTIDE ACETATE 90 MG
147 5111185500100 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION IN PRE- | Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- IPSEN PHARMA BIOTECH SOMATU;LTVIIE:UTOGEL
FILLED SYRINGE
L-CARNITINE 30% (300 MG/ML)
148 5119199900500 ORAL LIQUID 20 ML HOLD
149 5119190201600 L-CITRULLIS'\LEﬁ(g MG ORAL Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- VITAFLO/NESTLE VITAFLO CITRULLINE 200
150 5138650200300 LEUCINE 100 MG SACHET Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- VITAFLO/NESTLE VITAFLO LEUCINE 100
LEVOCARNITINE 200 MG/ML Ankaa Medical Company -
151 5119199900400 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 5 ML Orig- KLEVA SOLUDAMIN
LEVOCARNITINE 200 MG/ML . .
151 5119199900400 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 5 ML Esnad medical -Orig- HELP SA INESTOM
LEVOCARNITINE 200 MG/ML Abdulrehman Algosaibi . . N
151 5119199900400 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 5 ML GTC -Orig- Hikma Portugal Levocarnitine Injection
CANCELED - NO BID
152 5132300200100 LEVOCARNITINE 500 MG CAPSULE ACCEPTED
LEVONORGESTREL 30 MCG Saudi International Trading | BAYER WEIMAR GmbH UND
153 5135200600000 TABLET . CO. KG MICROLUT
14 of 30
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LEVONORGESTREL 52 MG

Saudi International Trading

154 | 5135200600100 INTRAUTERINE DRUG DELIVERY o Bayer Oy Turku Mirena
SYSTEM 1 SYSTEM pany -rig
LEVONORGESTREL 52 MG
154 | 5135200600100 INTRAUTERINE DRUG DELIVERY | - KAMALIMPORT OFFICE Bayer Oy Turku Mirena

SYSTEM 1 SYSTEM

CO LTD -Orig-

155 5118160100300

LEVOTHYROXINE SODIUM 100

AL KAMAL IMPORT OFFICE

Acme Generics LLP, India

Levogand 100mcg Tab

MCG TABLET CO LTD -Orig-
155 5118160100300 LEVOTHY&%E'?E;&?UM 100 Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- | MERCK HEALTHCARE KGAA Euthyrox 100 pg
LEVOTHYROXINE SODIUM 100 Ahmed Mohammed Abdul | Aspen Bad Oldesloe GmbH -
155 5118160100300 MCG TABLET Wahab Naghi -Orig- Germany ELTROXIN 0.1MG TAB

156 5118160100700

LEVOTHYROXINE SODIUM 100
MCG/ML SOLUTION FOR
INJECTION 5 ML

Qomel Company -Orig-

ZYDUS LIFESCIENCES LTD

Levothyroxine
Lyophilized Powder 500

mcg

157 5118160100400

LEVOTHYROXINE SODIUM 150
MCG TABLET

Salehiya Trading CO -Orig-

MERCK HEALTHCARE KGAA

Euthyrox 150 pg

158 5118160100000

LEVOTHYROXINE SODIUM 200
MCG/ML SOLUTION FOR
INJECTION 1 ML AMPOULE

HOLD

159 5118160100100

LEVOTHYROXINE SODIUM 25 MCG

AL KAMAL IMPORT OFFICE

Acme Generics LLP, India

Levogand 25mcg Tab

TABLET CO LTD -Orig-

LE E SOD 2

159 5118160100100 VOTHYROX:_'\LBiST IUM 25 MCG Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- | MERCK HEALTHCARE KGAA Euthyrox 25 mcg
LEVOTHYROXINE SODIUM 50 MCG | AL KAMAL IMPORT OFFICE . .

160 5118160100200 TABLET CO LTD -Orig- Acme Generics LLP, India Levogand 50mcg Tab
LEVOTHYROXINE SODIUM 50 MCG

160 5118160100200 TABLET Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- | MERCK HEALTHCARE KGAA Euthyrox 50 pg
LEVOTHYROXINE SODIUM 50 MCG | Ahmed Mohammed Abdul | Aspen Bad Oldesloe GmbH -

160 5118160100200 TABLET Wahab Naghi -Orig- Germany ELTROXIN 0.05MG TAB

161 5117233700100

LINACLOTIDE 145 MCG CAPSULE

CIGALAH Pharmaceutical

FOREST LABORATORIES

Linzess 145MCG

STORES -Orig- IRELAND, LIMITED
CIGALAH Pharmaceutical FOREST LABORATORIES .
162 5117233700000 LINACLOTIDE 290 MCG CAPSULE STORES -Orig- IRELAND, LIMITED Linzess 290 MCG

March 1, 2026
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LIOTHYRONINE SODIUM 25 MCG . LIOTHYRONINE SODIUM
163 | 5118160200000 ABLET Qomel Company -Orig- ZYDUS LIFESCIENCES LTD 2o MCG TABLET
164 | 5117170200000 | LOPERAMIDE HCL 2 MG CAPSULE C'GAL;AT%:::r_'gficge_”t'ca' LUSOMEDICAMENTA Imodium 2mg cap

LUMASIRAN 94.5 MG/0.5 ML
165 | 5119160700300 | SOULTION FOR SUBCUTANEOUS | Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- | ALNYLAM NETHERLANDS BV Oxlumo
INJECTION
LUTROPIN ALPHA 75 IU POWDER
166 | 5111185000100 B0 <oLvENTLon INJECTION NO QUOTATION
167 | 5117210100000 | MEBEVERINE HCL 135 MG TABLET | 2rouk Maamon Tamer & Jamjoom Pharma Meva 135 mg Tablets
Company -Orig-
167 | 5117210100000 | MEBEVERINE HCL 135 MG TABLET | >2udi Pharmaceutical SPIMACO VERINE 135MG TAB
Industries And Medi -Orig-
ZIMMO TRADING JAZEERA PHARMACEUTICAL
167 | 5117210100000 | MEBEVERINE HCL 135 MG TABLET R gl Ol DUSPAMEN 135MG TAB
MEBEVERINE HCL 200 MG Farouk Maamon Tamer & .
168 5117210100100 MODIFIED-RELEASE CAPSULE Company -Orig- Jamjoom Pharma Meva SR 200mg Capsule
VERINE SR 200MG
MEBEVERINE HCL 200 MG Saudi Pharmaceutical
| 2 (O L MODIFIED-RELEASE CAPSULE Industries And Medi -Orig- SPIMACO SUSTA'NiiEELEASED
168 | 5117210100100 MEBEVERINE HCL 200 MG ZIMMO TRADING JAZEERA PHARMACEUTICAL DUSPAMEN 200 mg
MODIFIED-RELEASE CAPSULE Company LTD -Orig- INDUSTRIES (JPI) prolonged release cap
168 | 5117210100100 MEBEVERINE HCL 200 MG Farouk Maamon Tamer & AJA PHARMACEUTICAL DUSPATALIN 200MG
MODIFIED-RELEASE CAPSULE Company -Alt- INDUSTRIES PROLONGED RELEAS
MEBEVERINE HCL 200 MG
169 | 5117210100200 voomeorec I AeLcl NO QUOTATION
MECASERMIN 10 MG/ML . . | BAXTER ONCOLOGY GMBH,
170 5111185900000 SOLUTION EOR INJECTION 4 ML Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- GERMANY Increlex
MEDROXYPROGESTERONE
171 | 5118182700100 ACETATE 150 MG/ML CANE\ECLCEEP'—I'IIE\IDO BID
SUSPENSION FOR INJECTION
MEDROXYPROGESTERONE Farouk Maamon Tamer & Pfizer Italia S.R.L, Ascoli
172 >118182700000 ACETATE 5 MG TABLET Company -Orig- Piceno PROVERA SMG TAB
MEGESTROL ACETATE 40 MG CANCELED - NO BID
173 | 5118180600000 TABLET CCEPTED
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March 1, 2026

174 5118190500000 1200 1U POWDER AND SOLVENT GTC -Orig- Ferring GmbH Menopur 1200 IU
FOR INJECTION
MENOTROPHIN (HUMAN
MENOPAUSAL GONADOTROPHIN)
600 IU POWDER AND SOLVENT Abdulrehman Algosaibi .
175 5118190500100 EOR INJECTION GTC -Orig- Ferring GmbH Menopur 600 IU
MENOTROPHIN (HUMAN A
Khalid Bin Saad
MENOPAUSAL GONADOTROPHIN) . % N EPIGONAL 75 IU
yaall ) 4< 44
176 5118191200300 751U POWDER AND SOLVENT FOR Internatlo?glric?mpany Ld “Q Sl 48,4 AMPOULE
INJECTION :
MENOTROPHIN (HUMAN
MENOPAUSAL GONADOTROPHIN) Abdulrehman Algosaibi
176 5118191200300 75 1U POWDER AND SOLVENT FOR GTC -Orig- FERRING GMBH Menopur 75 U
INJECTION
177 | 5118160500000 METHIMAZOLE 5 MG TABLET Nasaq Al Enjaz for Macleods METHIMAZOLE 5 MG TAB
development -Orig-
. . . Thyrozol 5 mg
177 5118160500000 METHIMAZOLE 5 MG TABLET Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- MERCK HEALTHCARE KGAA )
film-coated tablets
METHYLERGOMETRINE MALEATE
178 5114249900000 200 MCG/ML INJECTION 1 ML NO QUOTATION
METOCLOPRAMIDE HCL 10 MG CIGALAH Pharmaceutical GULF PHARMACEUTICAL PREMOSAN 10MG
179 >117180600400 TABLET STORES -Orig- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR TABLETS
METOCLOPRAMIDE HCL 10
180 5117180600500 MG/ML INJECTION 2 ML NO QUOTATION
METOCLOPRAMIDE HCL 5 MG/5 CANCELED - NO BID
181 5117180600300 ML SYRUP BOTTLE ACCEPTED
182 5117180600100 METOCLOPRAMIDE HCL 5 MG/ML CIGALAH Pharmaceutical GULF PHARMACEUTICAL PREMOSAN 10MG/2ML
INJECTION 2 ML STORES -Orig- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR INJECTION I.M./I.V.
METOCLOPRAMIDE HCL 5 MG/ML Abdulrehman Algosaibi Hikma ltalia SPA for Jazeera CLOPRAM 10 mg/2 ml
182 >117180600100 INJECTION 2 ML GTC -Orig- Pharmaceuti solution for i
17 of 30

www.nupco.com



http://www.nupco.com/

NUPCO TENDER:
TENDER NAME:

NPT 0017/25

GASTROINTESTINAL AND HORMONAL HEALTH

Vendor Name

Manufacturer

FINAL RESULT - STAGE 1

NUPCO Code Item Description

Trade Description

March 1, 2026

METRELEPTIN 11.3 MG . . . EMERGENT BIOSOLUTIONS
183 5016190100100 SUBCUTANEOUS INJECTION Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- (CANGENE BIOPHARMA Myalept 11.3MG
METRONIDAZOLE 500 MG CANCELED - NO BID
184 | 5110160300400 VAGINAL SUPPOSITORY ACCEPTED
MICONAZOLE NITRATE 1200 MG
185 | 5110181200100 U AGINAL TABLET NO QUOTATION
186 | 5110180500200 MICONAZOLE NITRATE 2% CIGALAH Pharmaceutical GULF PHARMACEUTICAL GYNO - MIKOZAL 2%
VAGINAL CREAM TUBE STORES -Orig- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR CREAM
NAWAH
MICONAZOLE NITRATE 2% DEEF PHARMACEUTICAL CONAZOLE VAGINAL
186 | 5110180500200 VAGINAL CREAM TUBE PHARMAC;;';UAL EST - INDUSTRIES CO. / KSA CREAM 20MG-1GM
187 | 5110181200700 MICONAZOLE NITRATE 200 MG | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical | UNITED PHARMACEUTICAL | GYNO-CANDIZOL 200 MG
VAGINAL OVULE STORES -Orig- COMPANY VAGINAL OVULES
187 | 5110181200700 MICONAZOLE NITRATE 200 MG | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical GULF PHARMACEUTICAL | GYNO - MIKOZAL 200MG
VAGINAL OVULE STORES -Alt- INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR OVULES
188 | 5110181200300 MICONAZOLE NITRATE 400 MG | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical | UNITED PHARMACEUTICAL | GYNO-CANDIZOL 400 MG
VAGINAL CAPSULE STORES -Orig- COMPANY VAGINAL OVULES
. DELPHARM REIMS FOR GEN MIGLUSTAT 100 MG
189 | 5117197500000 MIGLUSTAT 100 MG CAPSULE Qomel Company -Orig- ORPH CAPSULE
Farouk Maamon Tamer & SAJA-SAUDI ARABIAN
190 | 5115210000100 MIRABEGRON 25 MG TABLET compary A CRUTIC BETMIGA 25 mg
Farouk Maamon Tamer & SAJA-SAUDI ARABIAN
191 | 5115210000000 MIRABEGRON 50 MG TABLET S IAPANESE PHARMACEUTIC BETMIGA 50 mg
192 | 5117190800000 | MISOPROSTOL 200 MCG TABLET | FaroukMaamon Tamer & Jiramal Heghcare B Cytotec
Company -Orig- Limited, Whalton R
MULTI-ENZYME CONTAINING rouk Maamon Tamer &
193 | 5119190507500 | AMYLASE 18000 IU + LIPASE 25000 oo Abbott Neustadt Creon 25000 Ul
IU + PROTEASE 1000 IU CAPSULE pany -rig
194 | 5145230400200 NITISINONE 10 MG CAPSULE Arabian Tor:‘gif" House - SOBI Orfadin 10
195 | 5145230400000 NITISINONE 2 MG CAPSULE LI g::_e LIRSS SOBI Orfadin 2
NITISINONE 4 MG/ML ORAL Arabian Trade House - .
196 | 5145230400300 SUSPENSION orie. SOBI Orfadin 4
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Arabian Trade House -

Trade Description

197 5145230400100 NITISINONE 5 MG CAPSULE B SOBI Orfadin 5
198 | 5118182800000 | NORETHISTERONE 5 MG TABLET | “2udiInternational Trading | BAYER WEIMAR GmbH UND PRIMOLUT-N
Company -Orig- CO. KG
NYSTATIN 100000 |U VAGINAL Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals SINATEN 100000 |.U Vag
199 >110181500200 TABLET COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa Tabs
Abdulrehman Algosaibi PIRAMAL HEALTHCARE UK .
200 5117190000000 OBETICHOLIC ACID 5 MG TABLET GTC -Orig- LIMITED WHALTON RO Ocaliva 5mg
OCTREOTIDE ACETATE 0.1 MG/ML CIGALAH Pharmaceutical
201 5118230400300 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 1 ML STORES -Orig- GP PHARM SA OCRAN 0.1 MG/ML
OCTREOTIDE ACETATE 0.1 MG/ML Farouk Maamon Tamer & . SANDOSTATIN 0.1
201 | 5118230400300 | "oy \s1i0N FOR INJECTION 1 ML Company -Orig- Delpharm Dijon MG/ML 5 AMP
OCTREOTIDE ACETATE 0.5 MG/ML CIGALAH Pharmaceutical
202 5118230400200 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 1 ML STORES -Orig- GP PHARM SA OCRAN 0.5 MG/ML
OCTREOTIDE ACETATE LAR 20 MG Farouk Maamon Tamer & Novartis pharmaceutical SANDOSTATIN LAR 20
203 >118230400000 INJECTION VIAL Company -Orig- manufacturing G MG
204 5118230400400 OCTREOTIDE ACETATE LAR 30 MG Farouk Maamon T.amer & Novartis pharm'aceutlcal SANDOSTATIN LAR 30
INJECTION VIAL Company -Orig- manufacturing G MG
CANCELED - NO BID
205 5117247800100 OMEPRAZOLE 10 MG CAPSULE ACCEPTED
OMEPRAZOLE 10 MG MUPS Abdulrehman Algosaibi Losec MUPS 10 mg
206 5117191300700 TABLET GTC -Orig- Astra Zeneca AB Tablets
207 | 5117191300400 OMEPRAZOLE 20 MG CAPSULE | " 2rouk Maamon Tamer & Jamjoom Pharma Aciloc 20 mg Capsules
Company -Alt-
ZEE E L
207 5117191300400 OMEPRAZOLE 20 MG CAPSULE Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- JAZEERA PHARMACEUTICA OMERAL 20 mg capsule
INDUSTRIES (JPI)
Farouk Maamon Tamer & SAJA-SAUDI ARABIAN
207 5117191300400 OMEPRAZOLE 20 MG CAPSULE Company -Alt- JAPANESE PHARMACEUTIC OMEPREX 20 mg
207 | 5117191300400 | OMEPRAZOLE 20 MG CAPSULE | C'CALAH Pharmaceutical )y o) ppiarmA INDUSTRY | GASEC 20MG GASTRO
STORES -Orig- CAPS
207 | 5117191300400 OMEPRAZOLE 20 MG CAPSULE Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals OMIZ 20MG CAP
COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa
OMEPRAZOLE 20 MG GASTRO- Abdulrehman Algosaibi
208 5117191301000 RESISTANT TABLET GTC -Orig- Astra Zeneca AB Losec MUPS 20 mg Tablet
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GASEC 40MG GASTRO

March 1, 2026

209 | 5117190900200 ECISTANT CAPSULE STORES -Orig. ALPHA PHARMA INDUSTRY Cape
209 | 5117190900200 OME':{FE:IZS%ENZ_‘FOC'XPGSS’::TRO' Far°‘g;“p:::"y°f'0?grf'er & Jamjoom Pharma Aciloc 40 mg Capsules
210 | 5117191300200 OMEPR%?RLI'?\SSC'?KG):OWDER HOLD
211 5117180400200 SOI?UNTII)OAl\Tig:ﬁ\II\JIEZC'II\'/IISG\AZLML FaroilszZTyo?oTr?gr?er & Jamjoom Pharma Zoron 2 mg/ml Injection
212 | 5117180400300 | OI?UNT?OASSFEF::?\II\JIEZC'II\'/IICG)Q\ZLML Far°uckom:r:y°_"0?grf’er & Jamjoom Pharma Zoron 2 mg/ml Injection
2 | e |, RGO, | ot el | T TR | st
213 5117181600000 ONDANSETRON 4 MG ORALLY Farouk Maamon Tamer & Catalent UK Swindon ZYdis ZOFRAN MELT 4MG

DISINTEGRATING TABLET Company -Orig- Ltd. ORAL LYOPHILISATE
214 | 5117180400100 ONDANSETRON 4 MG TABLET HOLD
215 | 5117180400000 ONDANSETROL'I\'Q‘L:gG/ > ML ORAL Gulf neocare -Orig- ALPHA PHARMA KROMQ;’E’;SS&UT'ON
216 | 5117181600100 ONDDIQ',\\']STEELRR(Z'\T'&Z'?A(;FEQTLLY HOLD
217 | 5117180400400 ONDANSETRON 8 MG TABLET HOLD
218 | 5119160000400 ORAFE S\ZHJERR;\/I'C(:":TSALT Faroucl(()'\r:;?:y°_"0:?grf‘er & Ha'eWOLCt’g ;2?2::;?2‘” Pvt. Electrorush Sachet
218 5119160000400 ORAII; g\EVHID\( I? RR;AICOH':'I'S ALT Deveg;:;at:{c_s;i:n(:rercial Mega/Care Hydralyte Sachet 4.9gm
215 | 5119170200200 OR,ASI_()IT_ILEJI:Il_\I(ODNR,Oé'I;(_I)_II_\IL:ALT AIRa;rz]ldpl)J::rr;’riaocr?;tlcal UNITED NA'CI'g)NAL DAIRY NORMALYTE
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ACEDRA o
219 | 5119170400200 ORAL REHYDRATION SALT PHARMACEUTICAL MEDIFOOD INNOVATION | MediDrinkKidslyte(Ban,
SOLUTION BOTTLE . forest frut,stra
COMPANY -Orig-
ORAL REHYDRATION SALT Pharmaceutical Solutions PHARMACEUTICAL Babylyte Oral Solution
219 | 5119170400200 SOLUTION BOTTLE Industry Ltd. -Orig- SOLUTIONS INDUSTRY 240ml GB
ORAL REHYDRATION SALT Farouk Maamon Tamer & Halewood Laboratories Pvt.
219 5119170400200 SOLUTION BOTTLE o N Ltd For Amaro Electrorush Bottle
Arabian Oasis For . . .
220 | 5117210600000 OXYBUTYNIN 5 MG TABLET Development&Commercial Rubicon Research for Oxybutynin Chloride
Orig- Advagen USA Extended Rele
220 5117210600000 OXYBUTYNIN 5 MG TABLET spectropharma -Orig- Pharmascience BUTACAN
Arabian Oasis For .
221 | 5117210600100 OXYBUTYNIN 5 MG/SMLORAL | [\ 01 ent&Commercial SyriMed Oxybutynin 5 Mg/5 M
SYRUP orie- Oral Sol. 15
OXYTOCIN 10 IU/ML SOLUTION Abdulrehman Algosaibi Hikma Farmacéutica for GYNOCIN 10 IU/ml
222 >118220300400 FOR INJECTION 0.5 ML GTC -Orig- Jazeera Pharmaceu solution for inj
OXYTOCIN 5 IU/ML SOLUTION FOR CANCELED - NO BID
223 | 5118220300100 INJECTION 1 ML ACCEPTED
Saudi Pharmaceutical PROTON 20MG E.C
224 | 5117191500100 PANTOPRAZOLE 20 MG TABLET | | o o B e orie- SPIMACO ABLET
Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals TOPRAZOLE 20MG
224 | 5117191500100 PANTOPRAZOLE 20 MG TABLET oM -Orig. Manufactring Compa ABLETS
224 | 5117191500100 | PANTOPRAZOLE 20 MG TABLET | AracHealth Care Company SPIMACO PANTOL 20 MG enteric-
-Orig- coated tablet
PANTOPRAZOLE 40 MG POWDER
225 | 5117191500200 - | HOLD
226 | 5117191500000 | PANTOPRAZOLE 40 MG TABLET | C'GALAH Pharmaceutical BATTERJEE PHARMA Pantoloc
STORES -Orig-
226 | 5117191500000 | PANTOPRAZOLE 40 MG TABLET Saudi Pharmaceutical SPIMACO PROTON TABS 40MG
Industries And Medi -Orig-
Farouk Maamon Tamer & SAJA-SAUDI ARABIAN
226 | 5117191500000 PANTOPRAZOLE 40 MG TABLET A IAPANESE PHARMACEUTIC PANTOMAX 40MG
226 | 5117191500000 PANTOPRAZOLE 40 MG TABLET Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals Toprazole 40mg Tablets

COM -Orig-

Manufactring Compa
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Arac Health Care Company

Trade Description

PANTOL 40 mg enteric-

226 5117191500000 PANTOPRAZOLE 40 MG TABLET . SPIMACO
-Orig- coated tablet
227 5050151100000 PARICALCITOL 1 MCG CAPSULE HOLD
228 5050151100100 PARICALCITOL 2 MCG CAPSULE HOLD
PARICALCITOL 5 MCG/ML
229 5050151100200 SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 1 ML spectropharma -Orig- Pharmathen S.A Paricalcitol Spectro
AMPOULE
PASIREOTIDE PAMOATE 40 MG
230 >118230300200 SUSPENSION FOR INJECTION HOLD
PASIREOTIDE PAMOATE 60 MG
231 >118230300100 SUSPENSION FOR INJECTION HOLD
PEGVALIASE 20 MG/ML IN PRE- CIGALAH Pharmaceutical .
232 5120189900500 FILLED SYRINGE STORES -Orig- BIOMARIN Palynzig 20 MG
PEGVISOMANT 10 MG/ML Abdulrehman Algosaibi Pfizer Manufacturing
233 5118230400600 . . .. S t
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION VIAL GTC -Orig- Belgium NV, Rijkswe omaver
234 5117150900000 PEPPERMINT OIL 0.2 ML CAPSULE NO QUOTATION
CANCELED - NO BID
0,
235 5147330700000 PHENOL OIL 5% INJECTION ACCEPTED
Arabian Oasis For
PHOSPHATE 500 MG . . Phosphate Sandoz
236 5117162200600 EEFERVESCENT TABLET Developme-gtfgc-ommerual Alturix Ltd. 500Mg Effervesce
237 | 5117197800100 PINAVERIUM BROMIDES0MG | Farouk Maamon Tamer & | »gprr e AL THCARE SAS DICETEL TAB 50MG
TABLET Company -Orig-
POVIDONE IODINE 10% VAGINAL Farouk Maamon Tamer & . .
238 5110271300200 APPLICATION BOTTLE o N Jamjoom Pharma Betasept Vaginal Douche
Middle East MIDDLE EAST
o . .
238 | 5110271300200 POVlDA%I\I:EIICaPrllgEN EOJ’T;/&G'NAL Pharmaceutical industries PHARMACEUTICAL A"f(')?,/”\f:"i':;’lnso'jfr'\”e
co -Orig- INDUSTRIES °Vag
POVIDONE IODINE 10% VAGINAL NAWAH DEEF PHARMACEUTICAL DEFODIN VAGINAL
(]
238 >110271300200 APPLICATION BOTTLE PHARMACOE:i-Ig(_:UAL EST - INDUSTRIES CO. / KSA DOUCHE
5 . -
238 5110271300200 POVIDONE IODINE 10% VAGINAL Salehiya Trading CO -Alt- MUNDIPHARMA Betadine Vaginal douche

APPLICATION BOTTLE

PHARMACEUTICALS LIMITED

125ml
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239 5118181800100 PROGESTERONE 100 MG CAPSULE STORES -Orig- CYNDEA PHARMA, S.L Utrogestan 100 MG
240 5118181800500 PROGESTERONE 100 MG VAGINAL Abdulrehman Algosalbl Sever Pharma Solution AB ENDOM.ETRIN 100 mg
TABLET GTC -Orig- vaginal tablet
— p
241 | 5135151400000 | PROGESTERONE 200 MG PESSARy | /Pduirehman Algosaibi Accord UK Ltd (Cerg=s A0l
GTC -Orig- Pessary
PROGESTERONE 25 MG/ML ZIMMO TRADING IBSA (LNSTITUT
242 | 5118181800300 | o0\ (110N FOR INJECTION 1 ML Company LTD -Orig- BIOCHIMIQUE SA.) Prolutex25me
— s
243 | 5118181800000 | PROGESTERONE 400 MG PESSARY | ~Pdulrehman Algosaibi Accord UK Ltd Cyclogest® 400mg
GTC -Orig- Pessary
CIGALAH Pharmaceutical DENDRON BRANDS LIMITED
0, 1 0,
244 5118181800200 PROGESTERONE 8% VAGINAL GEL STORES -Orig- - MERCK Crinone 8%
PROPYLTHIOURACIL 50 MG Alhobail Medical Company PROPYLTHIOURACIL
245 5118160600000 TABLET i MACLEODS MACLEODS
246 5117164200100 PRUCALOPRIDE 1 MG TABLET CALLle TRAD'N(.S ALRAI PHARMA Conestal 1 MG
Company LTD -Orig-
246 5117164200100 PRUCALOPRIDE 1 MG TABLET Saudi InternatlonaI.Tradmg Janssen Cilag S.p.A/ Sanico Resolor 1mg tabs, 28
Company -Orig-
PSYLLIUM LAXATIVES G CANCELED - NO BID
247 5117161000400 GRANULES ACCEPTED
RACECADOTRIL 10 MG GRANULES Farouk Maamon Tamer & .
248 5117171400100 FOR ORAL SUSPENSION SACHET Company RO et Laboratoires SOPHARTEX HIDRASEC
RACECADOTRIL 30 MG GRANULES Farouk Maamon Tamer & .
249 5117171400000 FOR ORAL SUSPENSION SACHET Canl . O Laboratoires SOPHARTEX HIDRASEC
CANCELED - NO BID
250 5111186500000 RALOXIFENE HCL 60 MG TABLET ACCEPTED
SAPROPTERIN DIHYDROCHLORIDE Farouk Maamon Tamer & Annora Pharma Private Sapropterin Amarox 100
251 >113159900100 100 MG SACHET Company -Orig- Limited For Amarox mg Powder
SAPROPTERIN DIHYDROCHLORIDE Farouk Maamon Tamer & Annora Pharma Private Sapropterin Amarox 100
252 >113159900000 100 MG TABLET Company -Orig- Limited For Amarox mg Tablets
ALEXION PHARMA
253 5117199000000 SEBELIPASE ALFA 20 MG /10 ML Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- INTERNATIONAL KANUMA
OPERATIONS
254 | 5117161000000 | SENNASTANDARDIZED TABLET | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical | GULF PHARMACEUTICAL LAXAL TABLETS

STORES -Orig-

INDUSTRIES-JULPHAR
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SILDENAFIL 10 MG/12.5 ML
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255 | 5141320400000 < OLUTION FOR INJECTON NO QUOTATION

SILDENAFIL 10 MG/ML POWDER
256 | 5121240100200 OR ORAL SUSPENSION HOLD
257 | 5121240100000 SILDENAFIL 20 MG TABLET HOLD
258 | 5121240100300 SILDENAFIL 25 MG TABLET Saudi Pharmaceutical SPIMACO A 25 3 Goe e

Industries And Medi -Orig- tablets
NAWAH
DEEF PHARMACEUTICAL .
259 | 5121240100100 SILDENAFIL 50 MG TABLET PHARMA%Er'Ii'Ig(_ZUAL EST - NDUSTRIES O / KS GIAD 50 mg film-coated
259 | 5121240100100 SILDENAFIL 50 MG TABLET Arac Health Care Company DAMMAM PHARMA SRSl
-Orig- coated tablet
Middle East MIDDLE EAST
259 | 5121240100100 SILDENAFIL 50 MG TABLET Pharmaceutical industries PHARMACEUTICAL VIRECTA 50 mg F.C tablet
co -Orig- INDUSTRIES
259 | 5121240100100 SILDENAFIL 50 MG TABLET Farouk Maamon Tamer & Jamjoom Pharma Erecta 50 mg Tablets
Company -Orig-
259 | 5121240100100 SILDENAFIL 50 MG TABLET Saudi Pharmaceutical SPIMACO WAFI 50 mg film-coated
Industries And Medi -Orig- tablets
CANCELED - NO BID

260 | 5117150000500 SIMETHICONE 40 MG TABLET CCEPTED

SODIUM ALGINATE 50 MG/ML +

SODIUM BICARBONATE 26.7
261 | 5117151100500 | MG/ML + CALCIUM CARBONATE HOLD
16 MG/ML ORAL SUSPENSION 200
ML
SODIUM ALGINATE 500 MG +

262 | 5117151100000 | SODIUM BICARBONATE 325 MG + | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical RECKITT BENCKISER Gaviscon Double Action

CALCIUM CARBONATE 213 MG STORES -Orig- HEALTHCARE (UK)LIMITED Mint Oral Suspens

ORAL SUSPENSION 300 - 600 ML

SODIUM BENZOATE 500 MG/5 ML . LEXON LTD FOR WAYMADE | SODIUM BENZOATE 500

263 5110183601000 ORAL LIQUID Qomel Company -Orig- PLC MG/5 ML ORAL LIQUID

SODIUM BICARBONATE 325 MG
264 | 5117150401000 ABLET HOLD
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SODIUM BICARBONATE 500 MG
265 5117150400500 TABLET HOLD
SODIUM BICARBONATE 650 MG
266 5117150400700 TABLET HOLD
SODIUM PHENYLACETATE 10% (5
G/50 ML) + SODIUM BENZOATE . UNIVERSITY OF LOW
267 1101 2 IC - - PSB
67| 5110183600200 1 )40/ (5 G/50 ML) INJECTION 50 ML | Q°OMe! COMPaNy -Orig= |5\ ) VA FOR NAVINTA LLC SPS
VIAL
SODIUM PHENYLBUTYRATE 250
268 5111190700600 MG/ML ORAL LIQUID HOLD
SODIUM PHENYLBUTYRATE 500
269 5111190700400 MG TABLET NO QUOTATION
SODIUM PICOSULPHATE 10 MG +
MAGNESIUM OXIDE 3.5 G + CITRIC Abdulrehman Algosaibi Ferring Pharmaceutical ( .
270 | 5117159900100 ACID 12 G POWDER FOR ORAL GTC -Orig- China ) Co LTD, Picoprep
SOLUTION
SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 10 MG Farouk Maamon Tamer & . Fensolin 10 mg Film
271 | 5115166100100 FILM-COATED TABLET Company -Orig- JamiglQly Pharmy Coated Tablet
SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 10 MG Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals
271 >115166100100 FILM-COATED TABLET COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa URILAX'10 MG TABLET
Middle East MIDDLE EAST
271 5115166100100 SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 10 MG Pharmaceutical industries PHARMACEUTICAL Uroleph 10 mg
FILM-COATED TABLET .
co -Orig- INDUSTRIES
SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 10 MG Saudi International Trading AJA PHARMACEUTICAL
271 >115166100100 FILM-COATED TABLET Company -Orig- INDUSTRIES SOLFISAN
SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 10 MG Saudi Pharmaceutical LIFANCE 10MG
271 >115166100100 FILM-COATED TABLET Industries And Medi -Orig- SPIMACO F.C.TABLET
SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 5 MG Farouk Maamon Tamer & . Fensolin 5 mg Film
272 | 5115166100000 FILM-COATED TABLET Company -Orig- Il fo] (A = e Coated Tablet
SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 5 MG Tabuk pharmaceutical Tabuk Pharmaceuticals
272 5115166100000 FILM-COATED TABLET COM -Orig- Manufactring Compa URILAXS MG TABLET
SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 5 MG Saudi International Trading AJA PHARMACEUTICAL
272 >115166100000 FILM-COATED TABLET Company -Orig- INDUSTRIES SOLFISAN
SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 5 MG Saudi Pharmaceutical
272 5115166100000 FILM-COATED TABLET Industries And Medi -Orig- SPIMACO LIFANCE 5MG F.C.TABLET
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Middle East MIDDLE EAST
272 5115166100000 SOLIFENACIN SUCCINATE 5> MG Pharmaceutical industries PHARMACEUTICAL Uroleph 5mg
FILM-COATED TABLET .
co -Orig- INDUSTRIES
SOMAPACITAN 10 MG/1.5 ML
273 5118230200800 PRE-FILLED PEN HOLD
SOMAPACITAN 15 MG/1.5 ML
274 5118230201100 PRE-FILLED PEN HOLD
SOMAPACITAN 5 MG/1.5 ML PRE-
275 5118230000300 EILLED PEN NO QUOTATION
SOMATROGON 24 MG SOLUTION
276 5118230000100 FOR INJECTION IN PRE-FILLED PEN HOLD

15 NEEDLES FREE FOR EACH PEN
SOMATROGON 60 MG SOLUTION
277 5118230000200 FOR INJECTION IN PRE-FILLED PEN HOLD
15 NEEDLES FREE FOR EACH PEN
SOMATROPIN 10 MG/1.5 ML
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION IN
278 5118230201200 CARTRIDGE (THE REQUIRED HOLD
DEVICES TO BE SUPPLIED FREE OF
CHARGE)
SOMATROPIN 10 MG/1.5 ML
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION IN PRE-
279 >118230200300 FILLED PEN 15 NEEDLES FREE FOR oLy
EACH PEN
SOMATROPIN 12 - 15 MG
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION IN
280 5118230200600 CARTRIDGE (THE REQUIRED HOLD
DEVICES TO BE SUPPLIED FREE OF
CHARGE)

SOMATROPIN 12 - 15 MG
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION IN PRE-
281 >118230200400 FILLED PEN 15 NEEDLES FREE FOR HOLD

EACH PEN
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SOMATROPIN 3.3 - 5.3 MG/ML
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION IN
282 5118230201300 CARTRIDGE (THE REQUIRED HOLD
DEVICES TO BE SUPPLIED FREE OF
CHARGE)
SOMATROPIN 3.3 - 5.3 MG/ML
SOLUTION FOR INJECTION IN PRE-
283 5118230200500 FILLED PEN 15 NEEDLES FREE FOR HOLD
EACH PEN
SOMATROPIN 6 MG SOLUTION
FOR INJECTION IN CARTRIDGE
284 5118230201000 HOLD
(THE REQUIRED DEVICES TO BE
SUPPLIED FREE OF CHARGE)
STERCULA 62% + FRANGULA 8% 7
285 5117320000100 G GRANULES NO QUOTATION
286 | 5117160000200 STERCULIA 62% GRANULE NO QUOTATION
SUCRALFATE 1 G/10 ML ORAL Arabian Trade House -
287 5117191100200 SUSPENSION 420 ML Orig- AMNEAL SUCRALFATE
Khalid Bin Saad
288 5117191100300 SUCRALFATE 500 MG TABLET International Company Ld 4 paall sSun) A8 5 GASTROFAIT 500 MG TAB
-Orig-
AlRazi pharmaceutical ALRAZI PHARMA
289 5141350600300 TADALAFIL 20 MG TABLET i :r INDUSTRIES FACTORY LTD Tadalo
289 | 5141350600300 TADALAFIL 20 MG TABLET Arac Health Care Company DAMMAM PHARMA HOVEA Al
-Orig- coated tablet
289 5141350600300 TADALAFIL 20 MG TABLET ZIMMO TRADIN(.E MEDCITY PHARMA Helt 20 mg Tab
Company LTD -Orig-
289 5141350600300 TADALAFIL 20 MG TABLET ALPHA PHARMA -Orig- ALPHA PHARMA Ascenta 20mg tablet
289 | 5141350600300 TADALAFIL 20 MG TABLET Farouk Maamon Tamer & Jamjoom Pharma Rexofil 20 mg Film
Company -Alt- Coated Tablet
AlRazi pharmaceutical ALRAZI PHARMA
290 5141350600200 TADALAFIL 5 MG TABLET [T INDUSTRIES FACTORY LTD Tadalo
290 5141350600200 TADALAFIL 5 MG TABLET ZIMMO TRAD'N(.; MEDCITY PHARMA Helt 5 mg Tab
Company LTD -Orig-
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290 | 5141350600200 TADALAFIL 5 MG TABLET Arac Hea'tt‘ocr?gr? Company DAMMAM PHARMA LOVERA St':bglz't'm'coated
Middle East MIDDLE EAST Avialis Sme 28 F.C
290 5141350600200 TADALAFIL 5 MG TABLET Pharmaceutical industries PHARMACEUTICAL g ’
. Tablets.
co -Orig- INDUSTRIES
Saudi Pharmaceutical SNAFI 5 mg Film Coated
290 | 5141350600200 TADALAFIL 5 MG TABLET eI o SPIMACO ot
290 | 5141350600200 TADALAFIL 5 MG TABLET Farouk Maamon Tamer & Jamjoom Pharma Rexofil 5 mg Film Coated
Company -Alt- Tablet
TAMSULOSIN HCL 400 MCG
291 | 5115181700100 MODIFIED-RELEASE TABLET HOLD
TERIPARATIDE 20 MCG/DOSE (250 | Farouk Maamon Tamer & Alliance Medical Products,
292 | 5118243500000 MCG/ML) PRE-FILLED PEN Company -Orig- Inc Bonteo
TERIPARATIDE 20 MCG/DOSE (250 | Saudi International Trading . Forteo colter 250 MCG/
292 | 5118243500000 Lilly S.A.
MCG/ML) PRE-FILLED PEN Company -Orig- L 1ml pen 2.
TERLIPRESSIN ACETATE 0.12 | . .
293 | 5118210600100 | MG/ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION Abd“"g???gr?'_g“a'b' Zentiva K.S. Glyprel‘c‘:'zciz:t'o" fo
8.5 ML AMPOULE & J
TESTOSTERONE 1% (50 MG/5 G)
294 | 5118200200300 TOPICAL GEL S G NO QUOTATION
TESTOSTERONE ENANTHATE 250
295 | 5118200200100 MG/ML INJECTION L34 HOLD
TESTOSTERONE PROPIONATE 30
MG + TESTOSTERONE
296 5118207500000 PHENYLPROPIONATE 60 MG + Ahmed Mohamrped ,.Abdul Ever Pharma Jena GmbH- Sustanop 250mg/m|
TESTOSTERONE ISOCAPROATE 60 Wahab Naghi -Orig- Germany Solution for in
MG + TESTOSTERONE DECANOATE
100 MG SOLUTION FOR INJECTION
TESTOSTERONE UNDECANOATE 1 CANCELED - NO BID
297 | 5118200200000 G/4 ML INJECTION ACCEPTED
TETRACOSACTIDE DEPOT 1 -
298 | 5142200100000 | MG/ML SOLUTION FOR INJECTION 'dTerZ' rescrpton for ATNAHS PHARMA UK LTD :EE:TCE()?:ACJ/'EAEL
1 ML AMPOULE & &
THYROTROPIN ALFA 0.9 MG/ML Arabian Trade House -
299 5118160400000 INJECTION Orig- Genzyme Ireland Ltd. Thyrogen
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Farouk Maamon Tamer &

Trade Description

300 | 5118204700000 TIBOLONE 2.5 MG TABLET . NV Organon,Netherlands Livial
Company -Orig-
CANCELED - NO BID
301 | 5116274500000 TIOPRONIN 100 MG TABLET CCEPTED
302 5115192000000 TOLTERODINE TARTRATE 2 MG Farouk Maamon Tfamer & | Hetero Labs Limited Unit —V URIDISITOL 2 mg Tablets
TABLET Company -Orig- For Amarox
TOLTERODINE TARTRATE 2 MG | Ahmed Mohammed Abdul . DETRUSITOL 2MG F.C
302 | 5115192000000 TABLET Wahab Naghi -Orig- Plizer TABLET
TOLTERODINE TARTRATE 4 MG | Ahmed Mohammed Abdul . DETRUSITOL 4MG
303 | 5115192000100 | b ONGED-RELEASE CAPSULE Wahab Naghi -Orig- Pfizer CAPSULE
TRIBENOSIDE 400 MG +
304 | 5138250300000 | | o pOeORY NO QUOTATION
POTHECON FOR NAVINT TRIENTINE 250 M
305 | 5117230700000 TRIENTINE 250 MG CAPSULE Gemel Cemany O || o oGO O R 0 MG
LLC CAPSULE
305 | 5117230700000 TRIENTINE 250 MG CAPSULE Farouk Maamon Tamer & | Hetero Labs Limited Unit= | i\ 250me capsule
Company -Orig- Il For Amaro
CIGALAH Pharmaceutical TILLOMED LABORATORIES Trientine
202 SHLPRLILIY RIS 32016 €S2 STORES -Orig- FOR ALPHA PHARMA K dihydrochlorideTillomed
TRIENTINE TETRAHYDROCHLORIDE Arabian Trade House -
306 | 5117233400000 150 MG TABLET orig. DELPHARM EVREUX CUPRIOR
307 | 5111181500100 | TRIPTORELIN 0.1 MG INJECTION | Salehiya Trading CO -Orig- | IPSEN PHARMA BIOTECH Diphereline 0.1 mg
307 | 5111181500100 | TRIPTORELIN 0.1 MG INJECTION Abd”'rgﬁrcn?gr::_g“a'b' Ferring GmbH Decapeptyl 0.1 mg
308 | 5115166900000 TROSPIUM 20 MG TABLET Ahmed Mohammed Abdul | o o [Madaus Group | SPASMOLYT 20MG TAB
Wahab Naghi -Orig-
309 | 5115166900100 TROSPIUM 30 MG TABLET QEEIPEhm QRS | DGEISEer NERItel | o cmex 30 mg Tablets
GTC -Orig- GmbH
URIDINE TRIACETATE 10 GRAM ACEDRA ALMAC PHARMA SERVICES, | VISTOGARD 10G 20SC US
310 | 5144200700300 PHARMACEUTICAL ' g
ORAL GRANULES COMPANY -Orig- UK/BTG INTERNATIO - Uridine Triaceta
UROFOLLITROPIN 75 U POWDER ZIMMO TRADING IBSA (LNSTITUT .
311 | 5118130600000 | \\p bjLUENT FOR INJECTION VIAL Company LTD -Orig- BIOCHIMIQUE SA.) Fostimon 75 1U
312 | 5117200300000 | URSODEOXYCHOLICACID250MG | CIGALAH Pharmaceutical LOSAN PHARMA GMBH Ursofalk 250 mg cap

CAPSULE

STORES -Orig-
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NUPCO TENDER: NPT 0017/25
TENDER NAME: GASTROINTESTINAL AND HORMONAL HEALTH

FINAL RESULT - STAGE 1

SN NUPCO Code Item Description Vendor Name Manufacturer Trade Description ‘
313 | 5117200300100 URS,\?GD/ESO mcgs :lLCUAQClIJ?DZSO CIGAL:T%::gr.nc;?ic;uncal COFi?BEgUPRZAARgA A Ursofalk suspension
314 | 5117200300400 URSODEOXYCT"/'_\%LL'ECTAC'D 200 MG C'GAL;AT%:::r_rgfi‘:”tica' LOSAN PHARMA GMBH Ursofalk 500 mg tab
315 | 5118210200000 | ¢, L\(JATslglI:RFEg;I ll\lNJZSCI\'I{II(G){\IMlLML HOLD
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